

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 1A
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT IR-38504-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 150052500ST4
 DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION
 CALL: 111 ROUTE: US 31
 LOCATION: ON US 31 AT MICHIGAN ROAD AND OLD US 31

DBE GOAL: 10.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,133,000.00
 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: MARSHALL BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE			\$ 241,492.95			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE			\$ 175,679.68			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	SOUTH BEND IN	574-288-8321	\$ 1,121,914.25		X	AWARD DBE 10.01%
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	SOUTH BEND IN	574-288-8321	\$ 810,613.75		X	AWARD DBE 10.01%
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	SOUTH BEND IN	574-288-8321	NO BID			
35-1068009	DYER CONSTRUCTION CO SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	DYER IN	219-865-2961	\$ 1,309,135.39			
35-1068009	DYER CONSTRUCTION CO SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	DYER IN	219-865-2961	\$ 8124,90.12			
35-1068009	DYER CONSTRUCTION CO SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	DYER IN	219-865-2961	NO BID			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	\$ 1,135,412.04			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	\$ 803,950.70			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	NO BID			
35-1487677	G E MARSHALL INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	VALPARAISO IN	219-462-3415	\$ 1,055,414.30			
35-1487677	G E MARSHALL INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	VALPARAISO IN	219-462-3415	\$ 901,436.28			
35-1487677	G E MARSHALL INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	VALPARAISO IN	219-462-3415	NO BID			

*SEE NOTE ON BOTTOM OF PAGE 1B.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 1B
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT IR-38504-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 150052500ST4
 (continued) DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION
 CALL: 111 ROUTE: US 31
 LOCATION: ON US 31 AT MICHIGAN ROAD AND OLD US 31

DBE GOAL: 10.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,133,000.00
 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: MARSHALL BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 241,492.95			
	SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE						
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 175,679.68			
	SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE						
35-1489621	HRP CONSTRUCTION INC	SOUTH BEND	574-271-7800	\$ 1,828,349.76			
	SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	IN					
35-1489621	HRP CONSTRUCTION INC	SOUTH BEND	574-271-7800	\$ 866,188.95			
	SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	IN					
35-1489621	HRP CONSTRUCTION INC	SOUTH BEND	574-271-7800	NO BID			
	SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	IN					

NOTE: RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF THE COMMON ITEMS SECTION, ALTERNATE SECTION BID AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

THE LOWEST RANKING
 AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0002 + PVFM 0002
 = \$ 1,121,914.25 + \$ 810,613.75 + \$ 241,492.95 = \$ 2,174,020.95

ACTUAL CONTRACT AMOUNT = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0002 = \$ 1,932,528.00

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 2
 DATE: 01/28/16

CONTRACT R -29425-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500866 DBE GOAL: 11.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT AND ROAD REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 6,592,000.00
 CALL: 141 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON ROCKYFORD ROAD OVER SLOAN BRANCH CREEK, 0.12 MILE WEST
 OF TALLY ROAD
 COUNTY: BARTHOLOMEW

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 6,648,486.09	R		
		Indiana	317-634-5561				
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS		\$ 6,316,287.66	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana	812-579-5248				DBE 11.09%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 3
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -30260-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500836 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 CALL: 151 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON WABASH RIVER GREENWAY EXTENSION AND INTER-URBAN TRAIL

CODE	COUNTY: WELLS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE		\$ 1,650,213.84	R		REJECT *
		Indiana	260-478-1548				

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECT ALL BIDS; MAY BE READVERTISED FOR A FUTURE LETTING.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 4
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34292-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006127 DBE GOAL: 9.00
 DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,492,000.00
 CALL: 161 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE FORT WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: WHITLEY BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1035114	SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY Indiana	219-886-3728	\$ 1,939,967.66	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,551,015.76	R	X	AWARD * DBE 9.12%
35-1185040	NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC	BRISTOL Indiana	574-848-4437	\$ 1,597,664.80	R		
35-2094565	3D COMPANY INC	MUNCIE Indiana	765-288-3326	\$ 1,621,004.11	R		

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 5
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34353-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172295 DBE GOAL: 8.00
 DESCRIPTION: ROAD REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 6,963,000.00
 CALL: 171 ROUTE: 94 LAPORTE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON I-94 FROM 1.0 MILE EAST OF SR 51 TO 0.5 MILE EAST OF SR
 249

CODE	COUNTY: LAKE BIDDER	PORTER ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GARY		\$ 6,539,272.00	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana	219-977-0722				DBE 8.02%
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH		\$ 6,864,865.93	R		
		Indiana	219-924-5900				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 6
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34426-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200603 DBE GOAL: 0.00
 DESCRIPTION: NEW BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 262,000.00
 CALL: 181 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 244 OVER LITTLE HURRICANE CREEK, 1.9 MILES WEST OF
 SR 3
 COUNTY: RUSH

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0844079	PAUL H ROHE COMPANY	AURORA Indiana	812-926-1471	\$ 293,657.80	R		
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 329,500.00	R		
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 296,972.02	R		
35-1549010	MCALISTER EXCAVATING CO INC	PATRIOT Indiana	812-594-2402	\$ 295,708.09	R		
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-933-0205	\$ 297,618.02	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	RICHMOND Indiana	765-935-4231	\$ 264,450.00	R	X	AWARD *
35-2046222	MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-356-9250	\$ 280,063.10	R		

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 7
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34447-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006639 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,750,000.00
 CALL: 191 ROUTE: 41 LAPORTE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON US 41 FROM 2.22 MILES NORTH OS UF 30 TO 1.42 MILES SOUTH
 OF I-80
 COUNTY: LAKE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GARY Indiana	219-977-0722	\$ 1,733,099.34	R		
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH Indiana	219-924-5900	\$ 1,493,331.11	R	X	AWARD DBE 12.82%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 8
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34518-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005995
 DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION
 CALL: 201 ROUTE:
 LOCATION: ON TRACY STREET FROM SR 116 TO US 224

DBE GOAL: 12.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: WELLS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE		\$ 1,879,043.00	R		REJECT *
		Indiana	260-478-1990				
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON		\$ 1,855,458.70	R		REJECT *
		Indiana	765-643-5358				

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECT ALL BIDS; MAY BE READVERTISED FOR A FUTURE LETTING.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 9
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34585-A
 CALL: 211

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006340
 DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT
 ROUTE: 55
 LOCATION: ON SR 55, 1.72 MILES NORTH OF SR 341

DBE GOAL: 0.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 137,000.00
 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: FOUNTAIN BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND Indiana	219-474-6542	\$ 272,500.50	R		
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-933-0205	\$ 219,787.20	R		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 225,633.00	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	LAFAYETTE Indiana	765-772-7500	\$ 174,464.50	R	X	AWARD *

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 10
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34821-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173667 DBE GOAL: 0.00
 DESCRIPTION: SAFE ROUTE TO SCHOOL ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 325,000.00
 CALL: 221 ROUTE: 30 LAPORTE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ALONG US 30 FROM CALUMET AVENUE TO CASTLEWOOD DRIVE AND
 FROM CALUMET AVE FROM US 30 TO RICHARD ROAD
 COUNTY: LAKE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GARY	219-977-0722	\$ 393,698.70	R		
		Indiana					
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY	219-887-5233	\$ 387,500.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1068009	DYER CONSTRUCTION CO	DYER	219-865-2961	\$ 386,120.37	R		
		Indiana					
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH	219-924-5900	\$ 316,942.35	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana					

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 11
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -34928-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129604400ST2 DBE GOAL: 2.00
 DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 747,000.00
 CALL: 231 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS ROADS AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE
 FORT WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: HUNTINGTON BIDDER	WELLS ADDRESS	WHITLEY PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1526557	MIDWEST MOLE INC	GREENFIELD Indiana	317-545-1335	\$ 1,086,041.00	R		
35-2141150	T & T EXCAVATING & PAVING LLC	SCOTTSBURG Indiana	812-595-2274	\$ 814,400.00	R	X	AWARD * DBE 4.25%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 12
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -35193-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173224
 DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION
 CALL: 235 ROUTE:
 LOCATION: ON FIRST STREET FROM SOUTH D STREET TO SR 22

DBE GOAL: 11.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,798,000.00
 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: GRANT BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 2,146,297.00	R		
35-1151771	CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC	WHITESTOWN Indiana	317-769-1900	\$ 1,951,337.41	R	X	AWARD * DBE 11.00%
35-2094565	3D COMPANY INC	MUNCIE Indiana	765-288-3326	\$ 2,228,647.12	R		

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 13
 DATE: 01/28/16

CONTRACT R -35351-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129608000LC1 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 6,714,000.00
 CALL: 241 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SAGAMORE PARKWAY FROM NATIONAL DRIVE TO MAIN STREET IN
 THE CITY OF LAFAYETTE
 COUNTY: TIPPECANOE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	LAFAYETTE		\$ 7,204,606.00	R		
		Indiana	765-447-2324				
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	LAFAYETTE		\$ 7,022,058.17	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	765-772-7500				DBE 12..18%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 14
 DATE: 02/24/16

CONTRACT R -35616-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173332 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,135,000.00
 CALL: 261 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS ROADS ALONG THE MUSCATATUCK TRAIL PROJECT
 IN THE CITY OF NORTH VERNON
 COUNTY: JENNINGS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 847,791.00	R		REJECT *
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 1,080,000.00	R	X	AWARD DBE 12.75%
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 1,576,965.75	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 1,307,583.90	R		

*REJECT BY ORDER OF THE COMMISSIONER PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(b) AND (c)10.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 15
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -36337-A
 CALL: 271

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006111
 DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT, ROUNDABOUT
 ROUTE:
 LOCATION: ON NEBO ROAD AT JACKSON STREET, 0.91 MILE
 SOUTH OF SR 332
 COUNTY: DELAWARE

DBE GOAL: 12.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,100,000.00
 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 999,302.40	R		
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 997,635.00	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 937,981.95	R	X	AWARD DBE 13.10%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	RICHMOND Indiana	765-935-4231	\$ 1,014,157.25	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 16
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -36415-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173620 DBE GOAL: 10.00
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,510,000.00
 CALL: 281 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SOUTHEASTERN AVENUE FROM ENGLISH AVENUE TO EMERSON
 AVENUE
 COUNTY: MARION

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 1,680,000.00	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,700,250.00	R		
35-1151771	CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC	WHITESTOWN Indiana	317-769-1900	\$ 1,425,000.00	R	X	AWARD DBE 10.01%
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 2,340,517.00	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-788-6885	\$ 1,598,513.00	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 17
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT R -37076-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006661
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE
 CALL: 291 ROUTE: SR 16
 LOCATION: ON SR 16 FROM US 421 TO SR 39

DBE GOAL: 8.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,211,000.00
 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: WHITE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	LAFAYETTE Indiana	765-447-2324	\$ 1,151,600.20	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,097,279.10	R	X	AWARD DBE 8.06%
35-1550663	TOWN & COUNTRY CONSTRUCTION IN	DEMOTTE Indiana	219-987-5450	\$ 1,178,252.50	R		
35-1621699	CENTRAL PAVING INC	LOGANSFORT Indiana	574-722-4727	\$ 1,125,883.60	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	LAFAYETTE Indiana	765-772-7500	\$ 1,146,368.25	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 18A
DATE: 01/28/16

CONTRACT R -37393-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140060500ST2 MBE GOAL: 7.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION, NEW BRIDGE AND BRIDGE RECONSTR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 20,062,000.00
CALL: 295 ROUTE: 900N FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON CR 900N FROM US 24 TO FOGWELL
COUNTY: HUNTINGTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE			\$ 967,580.87			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE			\$ 744,717.88			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-634-5561	\$ 14,276,886.62			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-634-5561	\$ 7,714,026.86			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-634-5561	NO BID			
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1990	\$ 14,227,525.85			
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1990	\$ 5,810,537.34			
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1990	NO BID			
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	\$ 13,046,225.71		X	AWARD * MBE 9.79 WBE 5.15 IVBE 0.69
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	\$ 5,911,177.75			
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	\$ 6,099,434.60		X	AWARD * MBE 9.79 WBE 5.15 IVBE 0.69

*SEE NOTE ON BOTTOM OF PAGE 18B.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 18B
 DATE: 01/28/16

CONTRACT R -37393-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140060500ST2 MBE GOAL: 7.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
 (continued) DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION, NEW BRIDGE AND BRIDGE RECONSTR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 20,062,000.00
 CALL: 295 ROUTE: 900N FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON CR 900N FROM US 24 TO FOGWELL
 COUNTY: HUNTINGTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 967,580.87			
	SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE						
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 744,717.88			
	SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE						
35-1698047	GRADEX INC	CARMEL	317-573-3970	\$ 12,942,448.07			
	SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	IN					
35-1698047	GRADEX INC	CARMEL	317-573-3970	\$ 6,195,454.40			
	SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	IN					
35-1698047	GRADEX INC	CARMEL	317-573-3970	NO BID			
	SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	IN					

*RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF THE COMMON ITEMS SECTION, ALTERNATE SECTION BID AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

THE LOWEST RANKING

AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0002 + PVFM 0002
 = \$13,046,225.71 + \$ 6,099,434.60 + \$ 744,717.88 = \$ 19,890,378.19
 ACTUAL CONTRACT AMOUNT = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0002 = \$ 19,145,660.31

*AWARD BASED ON INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, DIVISION OF SUPPLIER DIVERSITY, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

PAGE: 19
DATE: 02/24/16

FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

CONTRACT R -37877-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140120400ST5 MBE GOAL: 7.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE WBE GOAL: 5.00
CALL: 301 ROUTE: ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 395,000.00
SEYMOUR DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT CLIFTY FALLS STATE PARK

CODE	COUNTY: JEFFERSON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0844079	PAUL H ROHE COMPANY	AURORA Indiana	812-926-1471	\$ 397,445.40	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 359,500.00	R		
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 287,674.40	R		REJECT *
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 375,300.00	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 353,993.20	R	X	AWARD MBE 7.63 WBE 6.21 IVBE 4.38

*REJECT BY ORDER OF THE COMMISSIONER PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(b) AND (c)10.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 20
 DATE: 02/24/16

CONTRACT R -38967-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 150031800LC DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 777,000.00
 CALL: 311 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON 5TH STREET FROM US 50 TO CSX RAILROAD TRACKS IN THE CITY
 OF NORTH VERNON
 COUNTY: JENNINGS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 582,700.00	R		REJECT *
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 798,594.19	R	X	AWARD ** DBE 22.52%

*REJECT BY ORDER OF THE COMMISSIONER PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(b) AND (c)10.

**AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 21
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT RS-34930-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006203
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE
 CALL: 351 ROUTE: 1
 LOCATION: ON SR 1 FROM SR 218 TO 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF SR 116

DBE GOAL: 8.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,361,000.00
 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: WELLS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 1,113,221.00	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,055,855.59	R	X	AWARD DBE 8.37%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	RICHMOND Indiana	765-935-4231	\$ 1,362,235.90	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 22
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT RS-34931-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1296417, 1296890 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,280,000.00
 CALL: 361 ROUTE: SR 127 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 127 FROM US 20 2.55 MILES NORTH OF US 20 AND ON SR 120
 FROM 0.89 MILE WEST OF SR 827 TO 0.51 EAST OF SR 827
 COUNTY: STEUBEN

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 2,005,246.80	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,990,772.17	R		
62-1492793	API CONSTRUCTION CORP	LAOTTO Indiana	260-897-2743	\$ 1,917,531.99	R	X	AWARD DBE 12.04%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 23
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT RS-34932-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140186000ST2 DBE GOAL: 11.00
 DESCRIPTION: SLIDE CORRECTION AND ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,785,000.00
 CALL: 371 ROUTE: 105 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 105 FROM 1.98 MILES NORTH OF US 24 TO 2.38 MILES NORTH
 OF US 24
 COUNTY: HUNTINGTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC	MILFORD Indiana	574-658-4166	\$ 1,491,355.49	R		
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 1,214,824.00	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,191,339.07	R	X	AWARD DBE 11.08%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 24
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT RS-37040-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138338900ST DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 520,000.00
 CALL: 381 ROUTE: SR 14 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 14 FROM 0.14 MILE WEST TO 1.0 MILE EAST OF SR 19

CODE	COUNTY: FULTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC	MILFORD Indiana	574-658-4166	\$ 523,297.90	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 520,144.59	R	X	AWARD * DBE 12.11%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 25
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT RS-37695-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138360200ST4 DBE GOAL: 6.00
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 8,790,000.00
 CALL: 391 ROUTE: 65 LAPORTE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON I-65 FROM 2.2 MILES N OF US 231 TO 2.0 MILES N OF SR 114
 AND FROM 3.32 MILES S OF SR 14 TO 2.91 MILES N OF SR 14
 COUNTY: JASPER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	LAFAYETTE Indiana	765-447-2324	\$ 6,792,659.68	R	X	AWARD DBE 6.05%
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 9,219,834.28	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	LAFAYETTE Indiana	765-772-7500	\$ 8,669,705.14	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 26
DATE: 02/05/16

CONTRACT RS-37898-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1401264, 1401265 MBE GOAL: 7.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: ULTRATHIN BONDED WEARING COURSE WBE GOAL: 5.00
CALL: 401 ROUTE: 37 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 3,544,000.00
LOCATION: ON SR 37 FROM 146TH STREET TO 2.44 MILES NORTH OF SR 32 AND
ON SR 37 FROM SR 28 TO SR 26 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: GRANT BIDDER	MADISON ADDRESS	HAMILTON PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW			REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 3,760,877.00	R			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 3,430,531.85	R	X		AWARD * MBE 8.96% WBE 0.37% IVBE 3.01%

*AWARD BASED ON INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, DIVISION OF SUPPLIER DIVERSITY, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 27
 DATE: 01/28/16

CONTRACT RS-37963-A	FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1401430		MBE GOAL: 7.00	IVBE GOAL: 3.00
CALL: 411	DESCRIPTION: ULTRATHIN BONDED WEARING COURSE		WBE GOAL: 5.00	
	ROUTE: US 31		ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,029,000.00	
	LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM SR 16 TO 9.32 MILES NORTH OF SR 16		FT. WAYNE DISTRICT	

CODE	COUNTY: MIAMI BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC	MILFORD		\$ 2,044,009.33	R		
		Indiana	574-658-4166				
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON		\$ 1,842,797.16	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	765-643-5358				MBE 1.19 WBE 8.48 IVBE 0.00

*AWARD BASED ON INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, DIVISION OF SUPPLIER DIVERSITY, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 28
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -31498-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400825 DBE GOAL: 7.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 799,000.00
 CALL: 451 ROUTE: 163 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 163 OVER HUMPHREYS BRANCH, 0.48 MILE EAST OF SR 71

CODE	COUNTY: VERMILLION BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE		\$ 999,946.70	R		
		Indiana	812-280-4404				
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 975,851.44	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	317-284-1195				DBE 8.49%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 29
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -31512-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129601800ST1 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 CALL: 453 ROUTE: 32 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 32 AND ON US 41 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

CODE	COUNTY: VERMILLION BIDDER	FOUNTAIN ADDRESS	PARKE PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE	812-280-4404	\$ 3,617,939.00	R		REJECT *
		Indiana					
35-1801998	CLR INC	BLOOMINGTON	812-336-3438	\$ 3,548,699.13	R		REJECT *
		Indiana					

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECT ALL BIDS; MAY BE READVERTISED FOR A FUTURE LETTING.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 30
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -31559-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800911 DBE GOAL: 9.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 CALL: 455 ROUTE: 70 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON I-70 OVER TABORTOWN STREET, 4.22 MILES EAST OF SR 46, AND
 OVER HONEY CREEK, 3.67 MILES EAST OF SR 46
 COUNTY: VIGO

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE		\$ 3,233,455.10	R		REJECT *
		Indiana	812-280-4404				
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	SPRINGFIELD		\$ 3,138,460.24	R		REJECT *
		Illinois	217-753-0027				

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECT ALL BIDS; MAY BE READVERTISED FOR A FUTURE LETTING.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 31
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34294-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006129 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,068,000.00
 CALL: 461 ROUTE: 1 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 1 OVER NETTLEHORST DRAIN, 5.85 MILES EAST OF I-69

CODE	COUNTY: ALLEN BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 1,184,045.13	R	X	AWARD * DBE 12.03%
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000	\$ 1,355,131.12	R		

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 32
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34304-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0401101
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION
 CALL: 471 ROUTE: 19
 LOCATION: ON SR 18 AND SR 19 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

DBE GOAL: 12.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,549,000.00
 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: MIAMI BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1339168	LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I	LAPORTE Indiana	219-393-5555	\$ 1,685,164.04	R		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 1,947,945.63	R		
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND Indiana	219-474-6542	\$ 1,674,305.60	R	X	AWARD * DBE 12.53%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 33
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34376-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172326 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 4,314,000.00
 CALL: 481 ROUTE: 24 LAPORTE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON US 24 OVER THE WABASH RIVER, 0.66 MILES WEST OF SR 25,
 AND AT US 35, 1.3 MILES WEST OF SR 25
 COUNTY: CASS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 4,479,477.72	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 4,208,453.41	R	X	AWARD DBE 12.03%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 34
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34412-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0201082 DBE GOAL: 10.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 775,000.00
 CALL: 491 ROUTE: 38 GREENFIELD DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 38 OVER FOSTER BRANCH, 2.94 MILES EAST OF SR 13

CODE	COUNTY: MADISON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 857,668.46	R		
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 687,618.45	R	X	AWARD DBE 10.00%
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 970,063.63	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	RICHMOND Indiana	765-935-4231	\$ 811,750.00	R		
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	SPRINGFIELD Illinois	217-753-0027	\$ 899,457.94	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 35
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34681-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173863 DBE GOAL: 7.00
 DESCRIPTION: REPLACE SUPERSTRUCTURE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,424,000.00
 CALL: 501 ROUTE: 74 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON COUNTY LINE ROAD OVER I-74, 4.63 MILES EAST OF SR 244

CODE	COUNTY: SHELBY BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 1,816,544.81	R	X	AWARD * DBE 7.24%
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2254	\$ 1,909,663.94	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 2,047,168.32	R		
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 1,981,816.35	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 1,974,669.56	R		
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 2,129,476.50			

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 36
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34881-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129684100ST2 DBE GOAL: 4.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 CALL: 511 ROUTE: 9 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 9 OVER SALAMONIE RESERVOIR, 0.52 MILES NORTH OF SR 124

CODE	COUNTY: HUNTINGTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY	260-625-3443	\$ 2,975,661.70	R		REJECT *
		Indiana					
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE	260-478-1548	\$ 2,990,933.48	R		REJECT *
		Indiana					

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECT ALL BIDS; MAY BE READVERTISED FOR A FUTURE LETTING.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 37
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34882-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129702500ST2 DBE GOAL: 5.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 602,000.00
 CALL: 521 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE
 FORT WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: ALLEN BIDDER	ELKHART ADDRESS	KOSCIUSKO PHONE	NOBLE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
32-0154474	JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC	LAPORTE Indiana	219-324-9393		\$ 1,449,086.00	R		
35-1690004	NORTHERN INDIANA CONSTRUCTION	MISHAWAKA Indiana	574-256-1811		\$ 617,782.88	R	X	AWARD * DBE 5.29%
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000		\$ 798,341.00	R		

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 38
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34889-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. CN129627700ST2 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 CALL: 531 ROUTE: 930 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 930 OVER N & S RR, 5.07 MILES WEST OF I-469, AND ON SR
 14 OVER BEAL TAYLOR DITCH, 8.3 MILES EAST OF SR 9
 COUNTY: ALLEN

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY Indiana	260-625-3443	\$ 1,395,695.13	R		REJECT *
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000	\$ 1,095,407.37	R		REJECT *
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 851,879.08	R		IRREGULAR **

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECT ALL BIDS; MAY BE READVERTISED FOR A FUTURE LETTING.

**BIDDER FAILED TO BID A REQUIRED ITEM (ITEM NO 73). BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(3)(B).

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 39
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -34929-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129671300ST2
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY
 CALL: 541 ROUTE: 69
 LOCATION: ON I-69 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

DBE GOAL: 11.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,414,000.00
 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: HUNTINGTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY Indiana	260-625-3443	\$ 1,552,853.10	R		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 1,469,545.93	R	X	AWARD * DBE 11.04%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 40
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -35194-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173243 DBE GOAL: 6.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 CALL: 551 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SOUTH BROADWAY STREET OVER LITTLE WABASH RIVER IN THE
 CITY OF HUNTINGTON
 COUNTY: HUNTINGTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY	260-625-3443	\$ 1,795,945.40	R		REJECT *
		Indiana					
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE	260-478-1548	\$ 1,686,470.91	R		REJECT *
		Indiana					

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECT ALL BIDS; MAY BE READVERTISED FOR A FUTURE LETTING.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 41
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -35399-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129616000ST1 DBE GOAL: 3.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE PAINTING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 564,000.00
 CALL: 561 ROUTE: 850W CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON CR 850N OVER I-65 AND ON CR 350W OVER I-65, 5.72 MILES
 NORTH OF SR 47
 COUNTY: BOONE CLINTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1602596	CIVIL COATINGS AND CONSTRUCTIO	VALPARAISO Indiana	219-531-5300	\$ 347,891.15	R		
35-1645115	THREE STAR PAINTING INC	MERRILLVILLE Indiana	219-947-3021	\$ 367,500.00	R		
35-1841931	VENUS PAINTING COMPANY	VALPARAISO Indiana	219-531-9364	\$ 489,406.00	R		
35-2019240	CENTRAL PAINTING INC	ST JOHN Indiana	219-942-3623	\$ 689,426.00	R		
36-4696205	OLYMPUS PAINTING LLC	VALPARAISO Indiana	219-476-1507	\$ 285,386.00	R	X	AWARD DBE 11.63%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 42
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -37130-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138316100LC3 DBE GOAL: 0.00
 DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRAIN FACILITIES ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 218,000.00
 CALL: 571 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ALONG CR 600W OVER DRY BRANCH SCHULZ DITCH

CODE	COUNTY: HANCOCK BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-4305155	R A MYERS CONSTRUCTION CO	MUNCIE	765-896-9704	\$ 500,604.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE	812-933-0205	\$ 285,219.00	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana					

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 43
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -37162-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140033900ST3
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY
 CALL: 581 ROUTE: 65
 LOCATION: ON I-65, 0.48 MILE SOUTH OF I-865

DBE GOAL: 4.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 368,000.00
 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: BOONE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 322,887.89	R		
38-1164400	RAM CONSTRUCTION SRVCS OF MICH	LIVONIA Michigan	734-464-3800	\$ 229,734.48	R	X	AWARD DBE 10.39%
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 238,167.75	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 44
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -37388-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140059200ST4 DBE GOAL: 9.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION AND REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 330,000.00
 CALL: 591 ROUTE: 29 LAPORTE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 29 OVER WILDCAT CREEK, 0.48 MILE NORTH OF SR 22, AND
 ON US 24 OVER WABASH RIVER, 4.91 MILES EAST OF OF US 35

CODE	COUNTY: CARROLL BIDDER	CASS ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
32-0154474	JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC	LAPORTE Indiana	219-324-9393	\$ 639,800.60	R		
35-1339168	LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I	LAPORTE Indiana	219-393-5555	\$ 531,825.54	R	X	AWARD * DBE 9.14%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 45
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -37390-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140028400ST4
 DESCRIPTION: CULVERT CLEAN AND REPAIR
 CALL: 601 ROUTE: 10
 LOCATION: ALONG SR 10, 2.10 MILES EAST OF I-65

DBE GOAL: 0.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 140,000.00
 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: JASPER BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1526557	MIDWEST MOLE INC	GREENFIELD Indiana	317-545-1335	\$ 110,066.00	R		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 176,115.00	R		
35-2141150	T & T EXCAVATING & PAVING LLC	SCOTTSBURG Indiana	812-595-2274	\$ 92,900.00	R	X	AWARD

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 46
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -37404-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140045600ST1 DBE GOAL: 9.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE THIN DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 646,000.00
 CALL: 611 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE
 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: FOUNTAIN BIDDER	TIPPECANOE ADDRESS	MONTGOMERY PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND Indiana	219-474-6542	\$ 803,442.35	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 999,502.25	R		
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 746,623.27	R	X	AWARD * DBE 9.40%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 47
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -37486-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140028500ST4 DBE GOAL: 0.00
 DESCRIPTION: CULVERT CLEAN AND REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 67,000.00
 CALL: 621 ROUTE: 104 LAPORTE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ALONG SR 104, 1.36 MILES EAST OF THE COUNTY LINE

CODE	COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-2141150	T & T EXCAVATING & PAVING LLC	SCOTTSBURG		\$ 154,000.00	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	812-595-2274				

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 48
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -37693-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140019300ST6 DBE GOAL: 9.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 640,000.00
 CALL: 631 ROUTE: 154 VINCENNES DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 154 OVER WEST FORK BUCK CREEK, 1.40 MILES WEST
 OF US 41
 COUNTY: SULLIVAN

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 694,726.50	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 746,892.38	R		
35-1801998	CLR INC	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-3438	\$ 594,121.58	R	X	AWARD DBE 9.20%
35-1878024	RAGLE INC	NEWBURGH Indiana	812-853-9558	\$ 693,470.60	R		
36-2839689	ILLINOIS CONSTRUCTORS CORP	ELBURN Illinois	630-232-7280	\$ 786,000.00	R		
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	SPRINGFIELD Illinois	217-753-0027	\$ 780,595.51	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 49
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -38000-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140117800ST5 DBE GOAL: 2.00
 DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 499,000.00
 CALL: 641 ROUTE: I-265 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON I-265 UNDER PAYNE KOEHLER ROAD, 1.97 MILES WEST OF I-65

CODE	COUNTY: FLOYD BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 575,765.90	R		
35-1526557	MIDWEST MOLE INC	GREENFIELD Indiana	317-545-1335	\$ 531,224.00	R	X	AWARD * DBE 3.10%
35-2141150	T & T EXCAVATING & PAVING LLC	SCOTTSBURG Indiana	812-595-2274	\$ 635,460.00	R		

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 50
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT B -38948-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 159223100ST5 MBE GOAL: 7.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR WBE GOAL: 5.00
 CALL: 651 ROUTE: 65 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 162,000.00
 LOCATION: ON I-65 OVER BIGGS ROAD, 1 MILE SOUTH OF SR 160 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: CLARK BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON		\$ 127,940.00	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana	765-643-5358				MBE 7.82% WBE 5.20% IVBE 3.00%
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE		\$ 151,571.11	R		
		Indiana	812-280-4404				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 51
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT T -35021-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129696400ST3
 DESCRIPTION: VISIBILITY IMPROVEMENTS
 CALL: 701 ROUTE:

DBE GOAL: 1.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 485,000.00
 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE GREENFIELD DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0392360	HOOSIER COMPANY INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-872-8125	\$ 537,286.05	R		
35-0965412	SHAMBAUGH & SON LP	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-487-7777	\$ 529,121.50	R		
35-1262778	MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-545-7641	\$ 551,614.75	R		
35-1710202	SIGNAL CONSTRUCTION INC	GREENFIELD Indiana	317-894-0120	\$ 387,064.50	R	X	AWARD DBE 3.53%
35-2046222	MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-356-9250	\$ 468,100.80	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 52
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT T -35635-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1296850

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: VISIBILITY IMPROVEMENT

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 111,000.00

CALL: 711

ROUTE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE GREENFIELD
 DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
31-1035771	A & A SAFETY INC	AMELIA Ohio	513-943-6100	\$ 122,331.56	R		
35-0965412	SHAMBAUGH & SON LP	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-487-7777	\$ 78,185.90	R		
35-1710202	SIGNAL CONSTRUCTION INC	GREENFIELD Indiana	317-894-0120	\$ 71,961.50	R	X	AWARD
35-2046222	MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-356-9250	\$ 112,075.00	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 53
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT T -35866-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173188 DBE GOAL: 0.00
 DESCRIPTION: SIGN REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 344,000.00
 CALL: 721 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE CITY OF NEW ALBANY

CODE	COUNTY: FLOYD BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1657131	MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC	PLYMOUTH		\$ 249,738.50	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana	574-936-8613				
35-2040834	GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 495,805.00	R		
		Indiana	317-541-2727				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 54
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT T -37587-A
 CALL: 731

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140096900LC2
 DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODERNIZATION
 ROUTE:

DBE GOAL: 0.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 448,000.00
 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE CITY OF FORT WAYNE

COUNTY: ALLEN
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0965412	SHAMBAUGH & SON LP	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-487-7777	\$ 298,233.00	R	X	AWARD
35-1262778	MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-545-7641	\$ 415,147.00	R		
35-1657131	MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC	PLYMOUTH Indiana	574-936-8613	\$ 329,864.00	R		
38-2677797	J RANCK ELECTRIC INC	MT PLEASANT Michigan	800-792-3822	\$ 481,304.00	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2016

PAGE: 55
 DATE: 01/22/16

CONTRACT T -38066-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140006600ST3 DBE GOAL: 0.00
 DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNALS, NEW OR MODERNIZED ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 192,000.00
 CALL: 741 ROUTE: 109 GREENFIELD DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON SR 109 AT 67TH STREET, 3.13 MILES NORTH OF US 36

CODE	COUNTY: MADISON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0392360	HOOSIER COMPANY INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-872-8125	\$ 188,632.91	R		
35-0965412	SHAMBAUGH & SON LP	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-487-7777	\$ 186,436.60	R		
35-1710202	SIGNAL CONSTRUCTION INC	GREENFIELD Indiana	317-894-0120	\$ 165,891.05	R		
35-2046222	MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-356-9250	\$ 164,575.10	R	X	AWARD