

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF April 18, 2012

PAGE: 1A
 DATE: 04/25/12

CONTRACT IR-30129-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710757

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 34,260,000.00

CALL: 135

ROUTE: 31

LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 31, NEW ALIGNMENT FROM WEST 4A ROAD TO US 6

COUNTY: MARSHALL
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION			\$ 2,280,804.13	R		
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION			\$ 1,673,488.90	R		
34-4456871	MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	ARCHBOLD OH	419-445-1015	\$ 26,046,452.25	R		
34-4456871	MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	ARCHBOLD OH	419-445-1015	No Bid			
34-4456871	MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	ARCHBOLD OH	419-445-1015	\$ 9,909,270.51	R		
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	SOUTH BEND IN	574-288-8321	\$ 25,262,895.84	R		
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	SOUTH BEND IN	574-288-8321	\$ 8,787,502.10	R		
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	SOUTH BEND IN	574-288-8321	\$ 8,771,208.60	R		
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	MILFORD IN	574-658-4166	\$ 29,283,031.89	R		
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	MILFORD IN	574-658-4166	\$ 8,299,945.51	R		
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	MILFORD IN	574-658-4166	\$ 9,502,472.57	R		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	\$ 26,992,661.20	R		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	No Bid			
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	\$ 8,840,588.59	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF April 18, 2012

PAGE: 1B
 DATE: 04/25/12

CONTRACT IR-30129-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710757

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 34,260,000.00

CALL: 135

ROUTE: 31

LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 31, NEW ALIGNMENT FROM WEST 4A ROAD TO US 6

COUNTY: MARSHALL
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1487677	G E MARSHALL INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	VALPARAISO IN	219-462-3415	\$ 29,134,580.69	R		
35-1487677	G E MARSHALL INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	VALPARAISO IN	219-462-3415	\$ 8,034,449.28	R		
35-1487677	G E MARSHALL INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	VALPARAISO IN	219-462-3415	\$ 9,105,310.72	R		
38-3082681	D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	LEROY MI	231-768-4403	\$ 22,634,397.48	R		
38-3082681	D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	LEROY MI	231-768-4403	No Bid			
38-3082681	D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	LEROY MI	231-768-4403	\$ 9,067,170.92	R		
99-9996267	WALSH CONSTR II / T J LAMBRECHT J/V SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	\$ 22,126,754.50	R	X	AWARD DBE 6.03%
99-9996267	WALSH CONSTR II / T J LAMBRECHT J/V SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	No Bid			
99-9996267	WALSH CONSTR II / T J LAMBRECHT J/V SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	\$ 8,748,245.50	R	X	AWARD

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION BIDS, AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0002; OR
 SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0003.

THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0003 + PVFM 0003
 = \$22,126,754.50 + \$8,748,245.50 + \$1,673,488.90 = \$32,548,488.90

LOW BID CONTRACT AMOUNT = \$30,875,000.00

*ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED TO SECURE FHWA AWARD CONCURRENCE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
 FOR THE LETTING OF April 18, 2012

PAGE: 2
 DATE: 04/25/12

CONTRACT R -33668-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900213
 DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT
 CALL: 311 ROUTE: 46
 LOCATION: ON SR 46 AT COLLEGE MALL ROAD

DBE GOAL: 10.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,370,000.00
 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: MONROE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 2,480,627.15	R		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-4452	\$ 2,448,477.34	R	X	AWARD * DBE 10.00%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 2,739,111.30	R		

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.