

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF May 13, 2011

PAGE: 2
 DATE: 05/13/11

CONTRACT R -28812-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9931015

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: ADDED TRAVEL LANES

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,553,775.00

CALL: 211

ROUTE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CRANDALL-LANESVILLE ROAD FROM I-64 INTERCHANGE
 TO OLD LANESVILLE ROAD

COUNTY: HARRISON

| CODE | BIDDER | ADDRESS | PHONE | AMOUNT OF BID | TYPE | LOW | REMARKS |
|------------|--------------------------------|---------------------------|--------------|-----------------|------|-----|---------|
| 35-1487672 | MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING | NEW ALBANY Indiana | 812-941-7895 | \$ 1,897,000.00 | | | |
| 35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana | 812-280-4404 | \$ 2,228,724.02 | | | |
| 35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE Indiana | 812-282-1349 | \$ 1,879,000.00 | | | |

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 PROPOSAL BIDDERS LIST
 FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

PAGE 1

CALL: 265

DATE RUN : 05/10/11

CONTRACT R -30254-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9957037

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION

ROUTE:

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 3,392,000.00

LOCATION: ON DOWLING STREET FROM 200 FEET WEST OF PARK AVENUE TO US 6

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

ACE: \$ 3,900,900.00

| CODE | BIDDER | ADDRESS | PHONE/FAX | AMOUNT OF BID | TYPE | LOW | REMARKS |
|------------|---|------------------|--------------|---------------|------|-----|---------|
| | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | | | \$ 351,656.94 | | | |
| | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | | | \$ 205,783.31 | | | |
| | SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS | | | \$ 9.00 | | | |
| 31-0533105 | HARPER COMPANY SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | HEBRON KY | 859-586-8890 | | | | |
| 31-0533105 | HARPER COMPANY SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | HEBRON KY | 859-586-8890 | | | | |
| 31-0533105 | HARPER COMPANY SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | HEBRON KY | 859-586-8890 | | | | |
| 35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | SOUTH BEND IN | 574-288-8321 | | | | |
| 35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | SOUTH BEND IN | 574-288-8321 | | | | |
| 35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | SOUTH BEND IN | 574-288-8321 | | | | |
| 35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | MILFORD IN | 574-658-4166 | | | | |
| 35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | MILFORD IN | 574-658-4166 | | | | |
| 35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | MILFORD IN | 574-658-4166 | | | | |

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 PROPOSAL BIDDERS LIST
 FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

PAGE 2

DATE RUN : 05/10/11

CALL: 265

CONTRACT R -30254-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9957037

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION

ROUTE:

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 3,392,000.00

LOCATION: ON DOWLING STREET FROM 200 FEET WEST OF PARK AVENUE TO US 6

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

ACE: \$ 3,900,900.00

| CODE | BIDDER | ADDRESS | PHONE/FAX | AMOUNT OF BID | TYPE | LOW | REMARKS |
|------------|--|------------------|--------------|---------------|------|-----|---------|
| 35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | FORT WAYNE IN | 260-478-1990 | 1,499,275.64 | R | | |
| 35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | FORT WAYNE IN | 260-478-1990 | No Bid | | | |
| 35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | FORT WAYNE IN | 260-478-1990 | 1,975,079.00 | R | | |
| 35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | SOUTH BEND IN | 574-288-4811 | | | | |
| 35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | SOUTH BEND IN | 574-288-4811 | | | | |
| 35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | SOUTH BEND IN | 574-288-4811 | | | | |
| 35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | ANDERSON IN | 765-643-5358 | 1,341,058.10 | R | | |
| 35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | ANDERSON IN | 765-643-5358 | No bid | | | |
| 35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | ANDERSON IN | 765-643-5358 | 2,237,310.88 | R | | |
| 35-1185040 | NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | BRISTOL IN | 574-848-4437 | 1,594,191.82 | R | | |
| 35-1185040 | NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | BRISTOL IN | 574-848-4437 | No bid | | | |
| 35-1185040 | NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | BRISTOL IN | 574-848-4437 | 1,961,190.42 | R | | |

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 PROPOSAL BIDDERS LIST
 FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

PAGE 3

DATE RUN : 05/10/11

CALL: 265

CONTRACT R -30254-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9957037

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION

ROUTE:

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 3,392,000.00

LOCATION: ON DOWLING STREET FROM 200 FEET WEST OF PARK AVENUE TO US 6

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

ACE: \$ 3,900,900.00

| CODE | BIDDER | ADDRESS | PHONE/FAX | AMOUNT OF BID | TYPE | LOW | REMARKS |
|------------|--|------------------|--------------|---------------|------|-----|---------|
| 35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | FORT WAYNE IN | 260-478-1548 | No Bid | | | |
| 35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | FORT WAYNE IN | 260-478-1548 | 1,635,919.96 | R | | |
| 35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | FORT WAYNE IN | 260-478-1548 | 2,007,773.43 | R | | |
| 35-1841857 | CRI CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | LARWILL IN | 260-327-3300 | No bid | | | |
| 35-1841857 | CRI CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | LARWILL IN | 260-327-3300 | 1,917,922.58 | R | | |
| 35-1841857 | CRI CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | LARWILL IN | 260-327-3300 | 2,302,766.95 | R | | |
| 38-1625197 | SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | NILES MI | 269-684-0842 | | | | |
| 38-1625197 | SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | NILES MI | 269-684-0842 | | | | |
| 38-1625197 | SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | NILES MI | 269-684-0842 | | | | |
| 62-1492793 | API CONSTRUCTION CORP SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | LAOTTO IN | 260-897-2743 | 1,346,874.03 | | | |
| 62-1492793 | API CONSTRUCTION CORP SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | LAOTTO IN | 260-897-2743 | No bid | | | |
| 62-1492793 | API CONSTRUCTION CORP SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | LAOTTO IN | 260-897-2743 | 1,670,633.34 | | | |