INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 06/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -33247-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810347 DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 812,000.00
CALL: 381 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON WABASH HERITAGE TRAIL EXTENSION, PHASE 11, FROM HAPPY
HOLLOW PARK TO ROSE STREET
COUNTY: TIPPECANOE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1386990 | JACK 1SOM CONSTRUCTION CO | REYNOLDS | $ 895,703.30 |R | X1 AWARD *
| | Indiana 219-984-5765 | | | | DBE 3.97%
35-1415044 | F & K CONSTRUCTION INC | FLORA | $ 904,412.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 574-967-4543 | | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 992,927.75 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP ] COLUMBUS | $ 952,135.75 |R | |
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 06/22/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -32661-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710474 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 528,000.00
CALL: 331 ROUTE: 300N GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT FORTVILLE PIKE AND CR 300N

COUNTY: HANCOCK

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-4351261 | SHELLY & SANDS INC AND SUBSIDI | NOBLESVILLE | $ 424,429.22 |R | X1 AWARD *
I | Indiana 317-773-2351 | | 11 DBE 4.65%
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 489,186.43 [R | |
1 | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 468,290.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 458,085.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |

*AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 06/16/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30845-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715016 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 20,900,000.00
CALL: 141 ROUTE: 25 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 1.42 MILE EAST OF TIPP/CARROLL CO LINE TO
0.15 MILE EAST OF US 421
COUNTY: CARROLL

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $18,712,673.36 |[R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 20,364,854.80 IR | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 17,730,676.35 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-336-4452 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 17,033,258.24 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | | DBE 5.85%
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT | $ 9,463,478.97 |[R | |
| | Indiana 219-661-2450 | | | |
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET | $ 9,058,184.75 |[R | |
| | 1ilinois 815-726-7722 | | | |
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK | $ 18,971,977.09 |R | |
| | Michigan 269-965-1207 | | | |

*AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 06/16/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -30313-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0621011 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD REHABILITIATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 15,100,000.00
CALL: 271 ROUTE: SR 46 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 46 FROM SR 246 TO WEST JUNCTION OF SR 67 AND US 231

COUNTY: OWEN

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 15,619,386.18 |R | | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |

35-1385672 | FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC | COLUMBUS | $14,983,844.03 |[R | | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 812-372-8441 | I 11

35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON | $16,670,223.88 |[R | | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 812-336-4452 | | | |

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 14,977,800.00 |R | | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |

*REJECTED ALL BIDS PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(c) DUE TO FUNDING ISSUES. PROJECT TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED AT A LATER DATE.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 06/07/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT IR-33042-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 22,838,900.00
CALL: 161 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM SR 61 TO CR 650

COUNTY: PIKE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
32-0289822 | KOLB GRADING LLC | ST CHARLES | $ 21,993,505.86 |R | |
| | Missouri 636-441-0200 | | | |
34-0907180 | E S WAGNER COMPANY | OREGON | $20,089,554.83 IR | |
| | Ohio 419-691-8651 | | | |
35-0958970 | LUTGRING BROTHERS INC | TELL CITY | $ 23,709,299.00 IR | |
| | Indiana 812-836-4300 | | | |
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 21,421,497.62 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-336-4452 | | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 20,545,763.98 IR | |
I | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | | |

35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE | $ 19,973,500.00 |R | X AWARD

I
| | Indiana 812-282-1349 | | | | DBE 3.07%



CONTRACT IR-30845-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

0715016

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

0.15 MILE EAST OF US 421

CALL: 141 ROUTE: 25
LOCATION:
COUNTY: CARROLL
CODE BIDDER

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

ON SR 25 FROM 1.42 MILE EAST OF TIPP/CARROLL CO LINE TO

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE: 1
DATE: 05/26/11

6.00
$ 20,900,000.00

REMARKS

| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN-
| TENANCE SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION |

| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN- |
| TENANCE SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION]

| SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE |
| ITEMS |

35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION I
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION I

35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION |

35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS |

35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION |

35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION |

35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS |

ADDRESS PHONE
LAFAYETTE 765-447-2324
IN

LAFAYETTE 765-447-2324
IN

LAFAYETTE 765-447-2324
IN

MILFORD 574-658-4166
IN

MILFORD 574-658-4166
IN

MILFORD 574-658-4166
IN

35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION |

35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION |

INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758
IN

| CRIDER & CRIDER INC |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS |

INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758
IN



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/26/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30845-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715016 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 20,900,000.00

CALL: 141 ROUTE: 25 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CONTINUED LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 1.42 MILE EAST OF TIPP/CARROLL CO LINE TO

0.15 MILE EAST OF US 421
COUNTY: CARROLL

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 8,602,557.52 |R | | AWARD PENDING *
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 9,295,246.95 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 8,430,690.72 |[R | | AWARD PENDING *
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I | 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | NO BID | 1
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | I 1
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 9,091,421.19 [R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 9,463,468.97 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 1
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | 1L | | 11
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | $ 10,663,231.36 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | 1L I I 1
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | $ 9,058,174.75 [R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 7,755,707.91 |[R | |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | M | | 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 8,420,023.99 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | M | | 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 11,216,259.18 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 11

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDDERS 1S DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE
PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002,
SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 ARE FIXED BY INDOT FOR ALL BIDDERS.)

*ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION DISCOVERED AN ERROR WAS MADE IN THE EVALUATION OF THE APPARENT LOW BIDDERS AFFIRMATIVE ACTION
CERTIFICATION. AWARD OF THIS CONTRACT ON 05-24-11 HAS BEEN RESCINDED PENDING THE OUTCOME OF A GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.

TOTAL OF LOW BID IS $ 17,033,268.24.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

MBE GOAL:
CONTRACT TM-32977-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901965 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 741 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE
LAPORTE DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

35-1262778 | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 169,166.00 |R | |

| | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | 11

*AWARDED OF THIS CONTRACT ON 05-17-11 HAS BEEN RESCINDED DUE TO BUDGETARY ISSUES. BIDS HAVE BEEN REJECTED.
AND ADVERTISED AS CONTRACT TM-34114 IN A FUTURE LETTING.

PAGE: 3
DATE: 05/26/11

©# OO
oo
oo

98,300.00

REMARKS

PROJECT WILL BE RESCOPED



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/24/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30845-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715016 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 20,900,000.00
CALL: 141 ROUTE: 25 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 1.42 MILE EAST OF TIPP/CARROLL CO LINE TO
0.15 MILE EAST OF US 421
COUNTY: CARROLL

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN- | | $ 1,535,349.54 | 11
| TENANCE SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | | | 1
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN- | | $ 977,998.63 | 11
| TENANCE SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION| I I 11
| SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE | | $ 10.00 |[R | X | AWARD *
| ITEMS I I I 1
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | LAFAYETTE 765-447-2324 | $ 9,233,766.67 |[R | |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | LAFAYETTE 765-447-2324 | $ 10,180,195.76 |R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | LAFAYETTE 765-447-2324 | $ 9,478,896.69 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 11
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 9,313,600.16 |[R | |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 9,822,209.00 |R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN | I 11
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 11,051,244.64 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 1
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $ 8,878,521.70 |[R | |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $ 9,176,024.74 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN | | 1
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $ 8,852,144.65 |[R | |

| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I [



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/24/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30845-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715016 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 20,900,000.00

CALL: 141 ROUTE: 25 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CONTINUED LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 1.42 MILE EAST OF TIPP/CARROLL CO LINE TO

0.15 MILE EAST OF US 421
COUNTY: CARROLL

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 8,602,557.52 |R | X | AWARD *
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 9,295,246.95 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 8,430,690.72 |R | X | AWARD *
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I | 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | NO BID | 1
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | I 1
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 9,091,421.19 [R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 9,463,468.97 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 1
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | 1L | | 11
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | $ 10,663,231.36 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | 1L I I 1
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | $ 9,058,174.75 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 7,755,707.91 |[R | |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | M | | 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 8,420,023.99 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | M | | 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 11,216,259.18 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 11

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDDERS 1S DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE
PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002,
SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 ARE FIXED BY INDOT FOR ALL BIDDERS.)

* TOTAL OF LOW BID IS $ 17,033,258.24.



CONTRACT IR-30850-A

CALL: 145 ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:

CODE BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500620, 0401299
DESCRIPTION:

NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

25

ON SR 25 FROM 0.11 MILE EAST OF CR 100W TO

CR 500S
CARROLL

ADDRESS

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

DBE GOAL:

ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
LAPORTE DISTRICT

.16 MILE EAST OF

PAGE: 3
DATE: 05/24/11

5.00
$ 26,200,000.00

REMARKS

GOSHEN
Indiana

35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC

MILFORD
Indiana

35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC

BLOOMINGTON
Indiana

COLUMBUS
Indiana

CROWN POINT
Indiana

| JOLIET

Illinois



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/20/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -32661-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710474 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 528,000.00
CALL: 331 ROUTE: 300N GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT FORTVILLE PIKE AND CR 300N

COUNTY: HANCOCK

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-4351261 | SHELLY & SANDS INC AND SUBSIDI | ZANESVILLE | $ 424,429.22 |R | X1 AWARD PENDING *
[ | Ohio 740-453-0721 | [ [
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 489,186.43 [R | |
1 | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 468,290.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 458,085.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |

*ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION DISCOVERED AN ERROR WAS MADE IN THE EVALUATION OF THE APPARENT LOW BIDDERS AFFIRMATIVE ACTION
CERTIFICATION. AWARD OF THIS CONTRACT ON 05-17-11 HAS BEEN RESCINDED PENDING THE OUTCOME OF A GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/19/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-30340-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500279 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,577,000.00
CALL: 421 ROUTE: 35 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 35 FROM US 24 TO SR 16

COUNTY: CASS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 1,279,926.52 |[R | |
I | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | 11
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 1,414,470.93 |[R | |
I | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | 11
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 1,273,784.35 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 11 DBE 4.00%
35-1621699 | CENTRAL PAVING INC | LOGANSPORT |$ 1,392,552.20 [R | |

| | Indiana 574-722-4727 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/19/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33430-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005953 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT WEDGE AND LEVEL ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 629,990.00
CALL: 501 ROUTE: 105 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 105 FROM SR 124 TO SR 16

COUNTY: HUNTINGTON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD |'$ 477,111.43 R | |
I | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | 11
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE |$ 517,318.22 |[R | |
I | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | 11
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 476,833.58 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 11 DBE 4.01%
35-1505753 | GAUNT & SON ASPHALT INC | WABASH |'$ 814,045.06 [R | |

| | Indiana 260-563-1821 | | | |



CONTRACT B

CALL: 631

-33355-A

DESCRIPTION:

ROUTE:

LOCATION:

COUNTY:

BIDDER

SR 32
DELAWARE

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902310
BRIDGE REHABILITATION

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

ON TILLOTSON AVENUE OVER EIGHTH STREET, CSX RAILROAD AND

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

5.00
$

2,660,0

REMARKS

PAGE: 3
DATE: 05/19/11

00.00

MUNCIE
Indiana

| BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC

BOGGSTOWN
Indiana

| DUNCAN ROBERTSON

INC

FRANKLIN
Indiana

AWARD

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

JEFFERSONVILLE
Indiana

SPRING LAKE
Michigan

| HIS CONSTRUCTORS

INC

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 4
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/19/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT T -33632-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005259 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNALS MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 346,000.00
CALL: 711 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON DR ANDREW J BROWN AVENUE AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

COUNTY: MARION

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0392360 | HOOSIER COMPANY INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 373,008.16 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-872-8125 | | [
35-0821499 | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 415,182.63 [R | |
1 | Indiana 317-876-3739 | | | |

35-1262778 | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 353,844.57 |R | X1 AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | | |
35-2046222 | MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 359,149.30 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-356-9250 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



