
PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

JAN 2 5 2019 
COMMISSION 

STAFF 

2. f)95f:lefi .l.iRe #i~Bbll}R FRlilterilil/ te he Eie/etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

__ .., , w,_, __ 

Received 

I /25 ZO/ 
Code Proposa I number 

Code title 

Indiana Residential Code 
Section number and title 

RS07.4.1 Deck post to deck footing connection. 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

220 W Van Buren St, Columbia City, IN 46725 

Representing (if applicable) 

IABO 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE {check one) 

_J{_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Edition 

2020 
Page Number 

1 of 1, codebook page 163 

Telephone number 

260-248-3111 

Delete without substitution 

R507.4.1 Deck post to deck footing connection. Where posts bear on concrete footings in accordance with 
Section R403 and Figure R507.4.1 R507.3, lateral restraint shall be provided by manufactured connectors or a 
minimum post embedment of 12 inches (305 mm) in surrounding soils or concrete piers. Other footing systems 
shall be permitted. 

Exception: Where expansive, compressible, shifting or other questionable soils are present, surrounding soils 
shall not be relied on for lateral support. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal references the correct table number. 

Fiscal impact: none 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

ECElVED 
DIS 

LEGALA!TD CODE 
ERVICES 

2. Da5J:ied JiRe #lro1:1gJ:i R'lateriaJ te ee deJeted. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Proposal number -ti: // b 
Code title 

Indiana Residential Code 
Section number and title 

R602.1.1 Sawn lumber (walls) 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

220 W Van Buren St, Columbia City, IN 46725 

Representing (if applicable) 

IABO 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Delete the last sentence of R602. I. I without substitution: 

R602.1.1 Sawn lumber. 

Edition 

2020 
Page Number 

1 of 1, codebook page 173 

Telephone number 

260-248-3111 

_X_ Delete without substitution 

Sawn lumber shall be identified by a grade mark of an accredited lumber grading or inspection agency and have 
design values certified by an accreditation body that complies with DOC PS 20. 1B lieu of a grade mark, a 
eertifieatioa of iaspeetioR issued by a lumber gradiag or iaspeetioa ageaey meetiag the requiremeats of this 
seetioa shall be aeeepted. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal reflects the current requirement for a grade stamp. 

Fiscal impact: no fiscal impact 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

5eco/lj 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

ECEIVED 
DHS 

LEGAL AI' 'D CODE 
SERVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. IJ95hefi tine tnr:e1,1gh mate,ciat te be fietetefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

6//I I /'3 
Code 

wti I/:-C 
Proposal number # / 17 

Code title : Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 
-

Page Number Section number and title 
1

i 
Table R602.7(1) GIRDER SPANSa AND HEADER SPANSa FO EXTERIOR BEARING WALLS 1 of 1, Codebook, page 262 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

In Table R602.7(1) change the forth row down, directly under row marked as "Building Width", by deleted the 
three "12"s and substituting three "20"s in their place as follows : 

I Building Widthc (feet) 

IR 20 I 24 I 36 +2-- 20 I 24 I 36 +2- 20 I 24 I 36 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal is one of the errata for the 2018 IRC as published by ICC. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION . 

Approve 

/Ylo-1-IM, 5e c;,pn/ A JJ /) ft; v-t J 9,,1bm /lf-.e/ (il5 
Reject 

, 
I I \. 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

I 
I 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

EC VED 
IDHS 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. f)a5J:1efi tine #1ro1:JgJ:i fflateriat te se fietetefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. ~,., , wu,crw.-.._ 

Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 
Section number and title Page Number 

R602.10 Wall bracing 
Proponent 

Matthew Brown 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

101 W Ohio Street, Indianapolis, IN. 46204 

Representing (if applicable) 

Indiana Builders Association 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

4'11 Change to read as follows X Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Adi 

Telephone number 

800-377-6334 

Delete without substitution 

R602.10 Wall bracing. Buildings shall be braced in accordance with this section or, when applicable, Section 
. R602.12. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply with one or more of the bracing requirements in this 
section, those portions shall be designed and constructed in accordance with Section R301.1. 

Exce tion: APA Sim lified Wall Bracin Method SR-102 ma be used as an alternate method of wall 
bracing subject to limitations in document. 

°'jJ "V5
11 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: 
The base code requirements assume WSP at 3/8 Category in our area all builders use 7 /16 Category Wood Structural panels. The APA simplified 
method simplify' s code compliance by utilizing the extra capacity of 7 /16 Category panels and reduces the amount of adjustment factors, thus 
reducing the time to calculate a wall bracing plan and simplifying review of wall bracing plans. 

Fiscal impact: No fiscal impact. 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Foml 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

13 
LEGAL Al 'D CODE 

SERVICES 

2. .[}ashed-Jin& thffltl§h--maleriel te-be-deletee; underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiringmorBSpace. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Se,vices, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, lndfana 46204. 

Code title 

Indiana Residential Code 
Section number and title 

R602.10.9 Braced Wall Panel Support 
P,oponent Representing (if applicable) 

Joe Heinsman 

Edition 

2020 
Page number 

Telephone number 

( 317 ) 423~1550 

Ill Change to read as follows D Add to read as follows O Delete and substitute as follows D Delete without substitution 

Change Jm 4rz to read as follows: 

2. The capacity of~raised floor system post or pier foundations supporting braced wall panels to transmit lateral loads ~ .the floor 
system and into the foundation shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice. -I/ti r 

0
':J Ji 

Adds scope clarity. 
no fiscal impact. 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

, 
/()/1 



INSTRUCTIONS: 

Received 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGAL Ar' D CODE 
SE VICES 

2. f)95heg URe tf:lr:01:Jgh materiaf ta he 9e1ete9. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

6/11/1~ 
Code 

YJfo 7JcC 
Proposal number 

' 
Code title: Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

#//CJ 

Section number and title Page Number 

R604.1 Identification and grade 1 of 1, Codebook, page 262 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Craig Wagner Indiana ·Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section R604.1 as follows: 

R604.1 Identification and grade. 
Wood structural panels shall conform to DOC PS 1, DOC PS 2 or ANSI/ AP A PRP 210, CSA 0325 or CSA 
043 7. Panels shall be identified by a grade mark Sf eeftifieate Sf iRs~eetisR isseeEI by aR 6fJPffwetJ. ageRey. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal reflects the language in our current rule that requires a grade mark. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION A 

Approve 

fYlot/on, ~ecoric/ A 1)/)/ove/ sdfi? i' /k) as 
Reject ' 

, fl 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGALAl,D CODE 
SE VICES 

2. Q95/uui fine #1re1,1g~ FFJateriat te se fl.e'etefl.. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet/or any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

code title : Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

R605.1 Identification and grade (particleboard) 
Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 262 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section R605.1 as follows: 

R605.l Identification and grade. 
Particleboard shall conform to ANSI A208. l and shall be so identified by a grade mark or eertifieate of 
inspeetion issued by an apprioved ageney. Particleboard shall comply with the grades specified in Table 602.3( 4). 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal reflects the language in our current rule that requires a grade mark. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 

Approve 

a5 ubmi 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) LEC. · Ai 'DCODE 

-- .VICES 
INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. f>eshefi JiRe thr-e1:1gl:i ~ate.rial te se fie1etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Code 

C 
Proposal number 

Code title : Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

#IZ/ 

Section number and title 

R606.3.5.2 Cleanouts 
Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 265 
Representing (if applicable) Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 {260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section R606.3.5.2 as follows: 

R606.3.5.2 Cleanouts. 
Provisions shall be made for cleaning the space to be grouted. Mortar that projects more than½ inch (12.7 mm) 
into the grout space and any other foreign matter shall be removed from the grout space prior to iRsraeetioR 
aA4 grouting. Wt=iere refl~ireEi ey tt=ie e~ilEiiRg offiEial, deaRo~ts Cleanouts shall be provided in the bottom 
course of masonry for each grout pour where the grout pour height exceeds 64 inches (1626 mm). In solid 
grouted masonry, cleanouts shall be spaced horizontally not more than 32 inches (813 mm) on center. The 
cleanouts shall be sealed before grouting and after inspection. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal reflects the language in our current rule that removes the discretion of the building official. Inspection requirements are 
a local ordinance issue. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

5eeo 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



/ 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

JUL 1 O(' 

G LAl~D CO 
VICE 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. fJasheri liRe thr:et:Jyh rnater:ial ta be £ie1ete£i. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

7/11/1i 
Code 

1-,0fb 1/l-C-
Proposal number 

code title: Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

if /2q 
I 

Section number and title Page Number 

R702.7.2 Material vapor retarder class. 1 of 1, Codebook, page 363 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section R702.7.2 as follows: 
R702.7.2 Material vapor retarder class. The vapor retarder class shall be based on the manufacturer's certified 
testing or a tested assembly. 

The following shall be deemed to meet the class specified: 

1. Class I: Sheet polyethylene, on 13erforateEI unperforated aluminum foil. 
2. Class II: Kraft-faced fiberglass batts. 
3. Class Ill: Latex or enamel paint. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal corrects a mistake in the 2018 IRC. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION ~ 

Approve 

/Ylot~11, ;-eco/)o/ Anor0~~ Sttj/ll ~s 
Reject ( f l/ 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

I~ 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

:JL 

EGALAND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Qa5/:le6f .'iRe #1reugh material ta se 6fe,<ete6f. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 

7/ 11/ ti 
Code 

7_of6 I/?.C 
Proposal number 

ff , 
Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 
Section number and t itle Page Number 

Table R703.8.4(1) 376 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Lynn Madden Hallmark Homes 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

/30 

_x_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution - - -

TABLE R703.8.4(1) TIE ATTACHMENT AND AIRSPACE REQUIREMENTS 

BACKING AND MINIMUM TIE 
MINIMUM TIE AIRSPACE 

TIE FASTENERa 

Wood stud 
22 U.S. ga~e backing with 8d common nail b Nominal 1 in. ¾ in. minimum between 

corrugated sheet 
(0.0299 in.) x /8 in. 

(21
/ 2 in. x 0.131 in.) sheathing and veneer 

metal 
wide 

W1 .7 (No. 9 U.S. gage; Minimum nominal 
Maximum 

Wood stud 41
/2 in. 

backing with 
0.148 in.) 8d common nail b 4--ffi:. ¾ in. minimum 

between 
metal strand wire 

with hook embedded in (i/2 in. x 0.131 in.) between sheathing 
backing 

mortar joint and veneer 
and veneer 

Cold-formed steel 
W1 .7 (No. 9 U.S. gage; 

No. 10 screw 
Minimum nominal 

Maximum 
stud extending through 41

/2 in . 
backing with 

0.148 in.) 
the steel framing a 

4--ffi. ¾ in. minimum 
between 

adjustable 
with hook embedded in 

minimum of 
between sheathing 

backing 
metal strand wire 

mortar joint 
three exposed threads 

and veneer 
and veneer 

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm. 

a. In Seismic Design Category D0, D1 or D2, the minimum tie fastener shall be an 8d ring-shank nail (2 1
/2 in. x 0.131 

in.) or a No. 10 screw extending through the steel framing a minimum of three exposed threads. 

b. All fasteners shall have rust-inhibitive coating suitable for the installation in which they are being used, or be 
manufactured from material not susceptible to corrosion. 

c. An airspace that provides drainage shall be permitted to contain mortar from construotion. Mortar is permitted to 
encroach into the airspace or make incidental contact with the sheathing or the sheathing paper or eguivalent. 



REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: per the 2005 Indiana Residential Code, Section R703.7.4.2 air space 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

f(l of-; on 1/o P/s0i ff m IAL ~ 
No ~eor-. d\ 

fYlotio1, -to 0/sa-rrrov-e_ 

tiloh'on 1JJ 1111~ove- - fhi ( 
r;ec01J - /3; /1 
llrPtro~J on h0--n/ Je_ 
w 1/ b volt ~ · 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

GA MDCODE 
S V CES 

2. Q95/:leEi .liRe #lre!lgR FReterie/ ra be Eie!eteEi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 

3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. ,_..,,M ... s.c.,._, 

Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 
Section number and title Page Number 

R703.8.6 Weepholes 376 
Proponent 

Lynn Madden 
Representing (if applicable) 

Hallmark Homes 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code} Telephone number 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows _x_ Delete and substitute as fol lows Delete without substitution 

Delete the title and text of SECTION R703.8.6 and substitute as follows: ~703.8.6 Drained cavity. The¾ inch (19 mm) air 
cavity sha ll be drained to the exterior of the structure at intervals of not more than 33 inches (838 mm) on center. Each 
drain shall be not less than 3 /16 inch (4.8 mm in dia er located immediately above the flashing. For dwellings with 
craw spaces, e air cavity may be drained as shown in FIGURE R703 .8.6(1). For dwellings with basements, the air cavity 
may be drained as shown in FIGURE R703.8.6(2). 

Insert Figures R703.8.6(1) and R703.8.6(2) . .. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: This proposal was rejected by the committee on 7 /18/18, and therefore would require a 2/3 vote of the committee to 
reconsider. The Southwestern Indiana BA (SIBA) has submitted a support letter signed by home builders and 3 building officials 
requesting that the committee reconsider action taken on this proposal. SIBA members will be at the meeting on 12/19/18 to offer 
testimony in support of the proposal, which directly contradicts information shared at the meeting that builders in southern Indiana 
do not use this amendment, and to answer questions. 

Fiscal Impact: ,11/o c/- - c~ 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Secon 
Further study 



FIGURE R703.8.6(1) 

0 1~-'C•E re· 

11\A:' ~ rlvlfS f•Fill f, 1 • ti"° r, . 

1,_.Pl:Ll ct! l'O.!Z IM'A-'1",1111 
1,1111,, .Ill 0015-1 Uf! ~ ',:,S,:, l'I 

FIGURE R703.8.6(2) 

11!Ji111St.l!:5ION C.f ~ i':!,,i ttOlll~ 
lrl«~~ml' ◄ r 

Ml! l"'-1. n · 

HOU51! W,;,J, I, t:llte to .ll'l!l! l.o:.W -
!.ILL P L,..11! (!Z C P.U•l 1 'lt 

l!J.::-l~~~~~!ffi:':1
0 

: ,~ ;~•,_•~:,.u• '"A;.:'?~;,,, f!:/0~ 

~ .... ,w-:.:i•~iv 
t!O LLOl', ,:.a, e ,: LUJ 

~-i'i: Rilf>lr™ E<:!I Jl (,A.(.fivR •,p y· ~~~~ 

~ME•J'l 

[fl.AN,•¥,; !. 'tS.ltW ( S10:- ... ~:, .ln=t::::iiil:::::1 ..... = •ni=!!~ in::t,r;;;:l::!f::!:!:=:::I. 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

·._:uL 

2. f)e&Rel:i URe thre1:1gh meter.is! te be Eie!etel:i. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

7/11 /'i 
Code title: Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

R802.1.1 Sawn lumber. 

Code 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number # 
133 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 383 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section R802.l.1 as follows: 

R802.1.1 Sawn lumber. 
Sawn lumber shall be identified by a grade mark of an accredited lumber grading or inspection agency and have 
design values certified by an accreditation body that complies with DOC PS 20. In liel:I of a graae mark, a 
certificate of inspection issues ey a lumber graaing or inspection agency meeting the requirements of this 
section shall ee acceptea. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal requires a grade stamp on lumber as is required in the rest of Indiana's code. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

JUL 1 1uro 

LEGAL AT ·n CODE 
SERVICES 

2. f)w.;he6' U~ie thce1:J~h nqateda1 te be 6'eJete6'. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received Code 

code title: Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

R802.10.1 Truss design drawings. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

C 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 408 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section R802.10.1 as follows: 

R802.10.1 Truss design drawings. 
Trnss design drawings, prepared in conformance to Section R802.10.l, st=iall be pro,;iided to tt=ie Jauftding effic!a! 
and a13woved prior to installation. Truss design drawings shall be provided to the building official as required by 
the General Administrative Rules (675 IAC 12) for Class 1 structures or by local ordinance for Class 2 structures. 
Truss design drawings shall be provided with the shipment of trusses delivered to the job site. Truss design 
drawings shall include, at a minimum, the following information: 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal follows GAR requirements for drawings. 

Fiscal impact: T · rovides a savings from the 2018 IRC. 14,068 x .60 = 8441 affected structures x $30 (estimates cost savings per 
structure) 253,230 savings. 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

For 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

,I JL 1 1.1118 

LEG -L AND CODE 
l..f.HVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. fJ.B5hefi 'il'le t/:i:ceE:Jg/:i rr:wte:cie1 te he fie1etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

7 /1 I /<g 
Code Proposal number 

Code title : Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

Section number and title Page Number 

(35 

R803.2.1 Identification and grade. 1 of 1, Codebook, page 409 
Representing (if applicable) Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section R803.2.1 as follows: 

R803.2.1 Identification and grade. 
Wood structural panels shall conform to DOC PS 1, DOC PS 2, CSA 0437 or CSA 0325, and shall be identified for 
grade, bond classification and performance category by a grade mark or certificate of ins13ection issued by an 
ef)f)fe~,efi agency. Wood structural panels shall comply with the grades specified in Table RS03.2.1.1(1). 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal requires a panel grade stamp as is required in Indiana's codes. 

Fiscal impact is neutral. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



RECEIVED 
IDHS 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) LEGAL AND CODE 

SERVICES 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 
2. DesJ:iefi fiRe #:lro1:1~J:i ffl€JEeriet to ee fieJetefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

7 /7; 
Code title 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

R806.1 Ventilation required 
Proponent 

Lynn Madden 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Code 

Representing (if applicable) 

Hallmark Homes 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows _x_ Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Add an exception to Section R806.1 Ventilation required to read as follows: 

Edition 

2018 
Page Number 

427 

Telephone number 

Delete without substitution 

EXCEPTION: Mechanical ventilation is permjtted provided the following conditions are met: 
1. The installation complies with manufacturer's instructions. 
2. A humidistat is included with the installation. 
3. An ammeter or equivalent device is installed in a readily visible locatio ._ 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: per the 2005 Indiana Residential Code 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Appcoveasamended fl 
Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGALAi~D CODE 
SER 1ICES 

2. fJa5"1efi 1ir:ie t"1ro1,1g"1 fflateria! to ae fie!etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. ~-•M•s«n..._ 

Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 
Section number and title Page Number 

R902.4 Rooftop-mounted photovoltaic panel systems 431 
Proponent 

Lynn Madden 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Representing (if applicable) 

Hallmark Homes 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Telephone number 

_X_ Delete without substitution 

R902.4 Rooftop-mounted photovoltaic panel systems. Rooftop-mounted photovoltaic panels and modules 

installed on or above the roof covering shall be tested, listed and identified with a fire classification in accordance with 

UL 1703. Class A, B or C photovoltaie panels and modules shall be installed in jurisdietions designated by law as 

requiring their use or where the edge of the roof is less than a feet (914 mm) from a lot line. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Approve 

Su 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

. l 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. f>a5J:ied liRe #lreugf:i material te he deleted. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. ~-•••------

Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 
Section number and title Page Number 

R905.2.6 Attachment 436 
Proponent 

Lynn Madden 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Representing (if applicable) 

Hallmark Homes 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Telephone number 

_X_ Delete without substitution 

R905.2.6 Attachment. Asphalt shingles shall have the minimum number of fasteners required by the manufacturer's 

approv-od installation instructions, but not less than four fasteners per strip shingle or two fasteners per individual 

shingle. Where the roof slope exceeds 21 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (21 :12, 175-percent slope), shingles 

shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's approv-ed installation instructions. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

No 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



RECEIVED 
IDHS 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

LEGAL A~D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Qa5l=lefi .'iRe #Jr-eugl=I materia.' ta l3e fieJetefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

Code title 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

R905.2.8 Flashing 
Proponent 

Lynn Madden 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Representing (if applicable) 

Hallmark Homes 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Edition 

2018 
Page Number 

437 

Telephone number 

_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows _X_ Delete without substitution 

R905.2.8 Flashing. Flashing for asphalt shingles shall comply with this section and the asphalt shingle 

manufacturer's appt:O'IOd installation instructions. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

R scCt/ 
Approve 

5e 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGAL A1 'D CO E 
SERVICES 

2. fJa5/:led liRe #Jreug/:1 material te 13e deleted. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

C 
Proposal number II I l/ §' 

Code title 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

R905.2.8.4 Other flashing 
Proponent 

Lynn Madden 
Representing (if applicable) 

Hallmark Homes 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

R905.2.8.4 Other Flashing. Flashing against a vertical front wall, as well as 

Edition 

2018 
Page Number 

437 

Telephone number 

_X_ Delete without substitution 

soil stack, vent pipe and chimney flashing, shall be applied in accordance with the asphalt shingle manufacturer's 

f)fffiteG instructions. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



RECEIVED 
IDHS 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

LEGAL A 'D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. £)95/:,ed liRe #lreug/:J mate,r:ia! te 19e de,<eted. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

/0 
Code title 

International Resident ial Code 
Section number and title 

Figure 1003.9 Termination 
Proponent 

Lynn Madden 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Code 

Representing (if applicable) 

Hallmark Homes 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows _X_ Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

After section R1003.9 Termination, add Figure 1003.9 Termination as follows : 

FIGURE 1003.9 TERMINATION 

10' ua,htAbove any ..,_ ___ .. __ RoofSadMc 

REASON STATEMENT A 

Wilbin 10' 
Bmu.cmtaJly 

S'min. 

Per the 2005 Indiana Residential Code, Figure R1001.6 -Fl S C(il 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

Edition 

2018 
Page Number 

452 

Telephone number 

Delete without substitution 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

I 1111 

LEGAL Ai\'D CODE 
SERVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

2. QasheEI lJne t/:lr:e"'g/:1 R'IBteriat ta ee Ele'eteEI. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

I 
Code 

Code title : Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

N1101.5 Information on construction documents 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

0/<6 IC 

Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 459 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows Add to read as follows X Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Delete Sections N1101.5 and Nll0l.5.1 and substitute as follow: 

Nll0l.5 Construction documents. Energy conservation construction documents shall be submitted for Class 
1 structures as required by the General Administrative Rules (675 IAC 12-6) and for Class 2 structures as 
required by local ordinance. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal reflects the language in our current rule for plans 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

J · i6 

LEGALAr,n CODE 
SERVICES 

2. D95/:ieg .'.JRe tJ:1r01,1§J:, Fflatet=ia.' ta Jae ge.'ete9. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received Code 

1-0,i I C 
Proposal number H / 

Code title 

Indiana Residential Code 
Section number and title 

N1101.6 Defined terms 
Proponent 

Phil Gettum, Gettum Associates 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

_)(_ Change to read as follows 

Representing (if applicable) 

IABO 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Change Section NllOl.6 as follows: 

Edition 

2020 
Page Number 

1 of 1, codebook page 460 

Telephone number 

Delete without substitution 

HEATED SLAB. Slab-on-grade construction in which the heating elements, hydronic tubing, or hot air 
distribution system is in contact with, or placed within or ttfl:deF, the slab. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal defines heated slab in a way that best works with other 2018 IRC sections and proposed sections. 

Fiscal impact: no fiscal impact 

Approve 

5e 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

/ 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

L 1 '. I\ 

LEGALANDC 
. -. .RVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

7 

2. Q95hee .line thret:Jg/:1 FA67terJ67l te 13e €fe1etee. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Code Proposal number 

code title : Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

150 

Section number and title 

Nll0l.6 Defined terms 1 of 1, Codebook, page 459 
Representing (if applicable) Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section NllOl.6 to read as follows: 

Residential Building. For this chapter, includes detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single 

family d1Nellings (townRouses} as well as Group R 2, R 3 and R 'I lauildings tt=iree stories or less in ReigRt a001o<e 

grade plane. , townhouses, applicable Class 1 structures, and their accessory structures. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal reflects the language in our current rule. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

as 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

- ECEIVED 
IDHS 

,fLJL I I. IJ j (' 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

7 

2. Qasl=lefl tine tl=l-=el:lgh matedaf te he €le 1ete€1. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

' ' 
Code Proposal number # / (;' 

code title Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2019 

Section number and title Page Number 

Table N1102.1.2 INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENTa 1 of 2, Codebook page 480 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 

Representing (if applicable) 

Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Telephone number 

{260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows Add to read as follows X Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Delete Table N1102.1.2 and substitute as follows: 
CLIMATE FENESTRATION SKYLIGHT CEILING WOOD FRAME MASS WALL FLOOR BASEMENT SLAB 
ZONE Li -FACTOR U-FACTORb R-VALUE R-VALUE R-VALUEg R-VALUE WALL R-VALUEAND 

R-VALUEc DEPTHd 

4 0.35 0.60 38 15 5/10 19 10/13 10; 2 feet 
5 0.35 0.60 38 20 or 13+5f 13/17 3oe 10/13 10; 2 feet 

CRAWLSPACE 

WALL 
R-VALUE 

10/13 

10/13 

a. R-values are minimums. U-factors are maximums. Batts compressed in to a framing cavity such that the R-value is reduced by R-1 or 
more shall be marked with the compressed batt R-value in addition to the full thickness R-value. 
b. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. 

sheathing covers, 25% or less of the exterior, R-5 sheathing is not required where structural sheathing is used. If structural sheathing 
covers more than 25% of exterior, structural sheathing shall be supplemented with insulated sheathing of at least R-2. 
g. The second R-value applies when more than half the insulation is on the interior. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal brings forward the current energy conservation values as was done with Class 1 buildings except for a change in Climate 
Zone 4 where the wall R-value is increased to R-15. R-15 is readily available and fits into a 2X4 wall. This will narrow the difference that 
is currently in our energy rule between Climate Zone 4 and Climate Zone 5 and will benefit homeowners with increased energy 
efficiency without subjecting them to the R-20 required in the 2018 IRC. 
Fiscal impact: This proposal is a credit from the 2018 IRC. 

Assuming: 14,640 houses (1/3 of which, or 4,831 of those houses, are in Climate Zone 4), 1,500 SF per house and one-half of those are two story. 
Installed insulation prices from insulating company: Sidewall R-13 $.59, R-15 $.79, R-20 $.95 Blown attic cellulose R-38 $.70, R-49 $.95 

Attics: 

One-half of the homes single story (14,640/2=7,320) 7,320 x 1500 SF=l,0980,000 SF x .25 (difference between R-38 and R-49) = $ 2,745,000 

One-half of the homes are two story (1,500/2=750 SF per house) 7,320 X 750= 5,490,000 SF x .25= $1,372,500 

Sidewalls: 

No impact for Climate Zone 5, R-values stay the same as the 2018 IRC. 

Region 4 impact: 

Total attic impact $ 4,117,500 

Assuming 1,500 SF is a 30' x 50' house, 30' + 30" +50' +50'=160 lineal feet of wall x 8" of height =1,280 SF per structure 

1,280 x 4,831 (houses in Climate Zone 4)=6,183,680 total SF sidewall x $ .16 (difference R-20 and R-15)= Total sidewall impact$ 989.389 



Total Sidewall and attic fiscal impact of($ 4,117,500 +989.389) = $5,106,889 This is a credit difference between the 2018 IRC and this proposal. 
Because of the variables encountered when trying to place a fiscal impact on the 2018 increase in fenestration U-values I decided to not try to 
estimate the U-value difference across the state and just used the total SF R-value in Climate Zone 4 as the offset for the fenestration U-value 
difference. 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

I_!~ 1 ' ;n1 

State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 

LEGALAI\D CODE 
SERVICES 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

2. D€15hefl 1-iRe #i.r:o1:1gh fflateria! to be fle!etefl. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 

'ir ( /l/ /20/<t 
Code 

lDI~ I£G 
Proposal number 

:fl: ;q3 . 
Code title Edition 

Indiana Residential Code 2020 
Section number and title Page Number 

Table N1102.1.4 Equivalent U-factorsa 1 of 1, codebook page 480 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Craig Wagner IABO 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows - Add to read as follows _X_ Delete and substitute as follows - Delete without substitution 

Delete Table NI I 02.1.4 and substitute as follows: 

TABLE N1102.1.l 'i 
EQUIVALENT U-F ACTO S a 

CU- FENES- SKY- CEILING FRAME MASS FLOOR BASEMENT CRAWL 
MATE TRATION LIGHT U-FACTOR WALL WALL b U-FACTOR WALL U- SPACE 
ZONE U-FACTOR U-FACTOR U-FACTOR U-FACTOR FACTOR WALL 

U-FACTOR 

-1 0.35 ___MQ 0.030 0.082 ___Qlli 0.047 0.059 0.065 

5 0.35 0.60 0.030 0.067 0.082 0.033 0.059 0.065 
a. Non-fenestration U-factors shall be obtained from measurement, calculation or an ai:mroved source. 
b. When more than half the insulation is on the interior, the mass wall U-factors shall be a maximum of 0.10 in zone 

4 and the same as the frame wall U-factor (0.057} in zone 5. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal lists the equivalent U-factors to match the R-value table previously approved by the committee. 

Fiscal impact: no fiscal impact 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve I 

Reject 

I J 
Approve as amended 

fflolior?. Secon/ JlpfJ/o~ a9 ~Id 
Further study 

, • f . ,, I 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. fJas/:leGI JiRe #Jr:o1:1g/:I fflateriaJ te se GleJeteGI. Underline or bold face material to be added. 

3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received ti It/ /2Dlf 

Code 

Zo~ T_/ZC 
Proposal number 

#111 
' 

Code title Edition 

Indiana Residential Code 2020 
Section number and title Page Number 

Table N1102.2.6 Steel-frame ceiling, wall and floor insulation R-values 1 of 2, codebook page 481 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Craig Wagner IABO 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows - Add to read as follows _X_ Delete and substitute as follows - Delete without substitution 

Delete Table Nl 102.2.6 and substitute as follows: 

TABLE Nl 102.2.6 
STEEL-FRAME CEILING, WALL AND FLOOR INSULATION R-V ALUES 

WOOD FRAME R-V ALUE REQUIREMENT COLD-FORMED STEEL EQUIVALENT R-VALUE a 

Steel Truss Ceilings a 

R-30 R-38 or R-30 + 3 or R-26 + 5 
R-38 R-49 or R-38 + 3 
R-49 R-38 + 5 

Steel Joist Ceilings b 

R-30 R-38 in 2 x 4 or 2 x 6 or 2 x 8; R-49 in any framing 
R-38 R-49 in 2 x 4 or 2 x 6 or 2 x 8 or 2 x 10 

Steel Framed Wall 
R-13 R-13 + 5 or R-15 + 4 or R-21 + 3 or R-0 + 10 
R-15 R-11 + 5 or R-13 + 4 or R-21 + 3 or R-0 + 15 
R-19 R-13 + 9 or R-19 + 8 or R-25 + 7 
R-21 R-13 +10 or R-19 + 9 or R-25 + 8 

Steel Joist Floor 
R-13 R-19 in 2 x 6 or R-19 + R-6 in 2 x 8 or 2 x 10 
R-19 R-19 + R-6 in 2 x 6 or R-19 + R-12 in 2 x 8 or 2 x 10 

For SI: 1 inch= 25.4 mm. 
a. Cavity insulation R-value is listed first, followed by continuous insulation R-value. 
b. Insulation exceeding the height of the framing shall cover the framing. 



REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 
This proposal lists the equivalent R-values for light-gauge steel frame structures for the table previously approved by the committee. 

Fiscal impact: no fiscal impact 

Approve 

fYl 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 {R3 / 5-10) 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGALAND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. 1;)95/ief/ .'.'Re tRraugli Fflateria.l ta be €ie.1eteEJ. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 

12 20/3 
Code Proposal number 

Code title 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

N1102.4.1 Building thermal envelope 
Proponent 

Bill Kaufholz 
Address {number and street, city, state, and ZIP cade) 

Representing {if applicable) 

Fischer Homes 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Edition 

2018 
Page Number 

Telephone number 

373 

_x_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

N1102.4.1 Building thermal envelope. The building thermal envelope 
shall comply with Sections Nl 102.4.l.l ~Nl 102.4.1.2. The sealing 
methods between dissimilar materiit!'1hall allow for differential 
expansion and contr~ o?/. f ofl 

N1102.4.1.1 ~~io~ Visattl ln~pection Optionr The components 
of the building thermal envelope as indicated in Table Nl 102.4.1.1 
shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions 
and the criteria indicated in Table N 1102.4.1.1, as applicable to the 
method of construction. Wbe1e Fe'iuired b)-- the cede official, an 
appreved thiFEi party shall i0speet all eompo0e0ts anEi ,,erify 
eomplianee. -~al QftHnaes@, aR-!!19~FO\>'ed pm Lv independent ffom tM 

iRstaH8f ef tbevta~i:~ ~-~;ee~ the air bat=rillr aREi i0sulatiou 

N1102.4.1.2 ~m./ftwn . ..... ... 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: This change maintains the current language in the Indiana Residential Code giving builders the option to 
either test the homes air leakage or to complete the inspection and installation checklist. 

Fiscal im~ r aoert@,t_ ~•""" .. 1 D ,-,, 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

, Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Code title 

2. -Gashed-line throtigh-ffla#er/61 tfHJIH:leleted; underline or bold face material ta be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiringmorespace. 
4. Return this completed fann to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security. Cade Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

N 1102.4.1.2 Testing 
Proponent Representing (If app/lcab/e) 

Edition 

2018 
Page number 

482 

Indiana Builders Association 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

101 WOhio Street, Indianapolis, IN 46204 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Ill Change to read as follows Ve( ~ J 'll ~_ea/,}as follows □ Delete and substitute as follows 

Nll0l.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) ~ tlie ~~b'mg or :, 
dwelling unit shall b~ sted and verified as having an air 
leakage rate of not e~C\!eding five air changes per hour-;-tft 
Climate Zanes 1 llftd 2, llftd th,ee oir ehenges per hour in 
Climate Zanes 3 thre11gh 8. Testing shall be conducted 
in accordance with ASTM E 779 or ASTM E 1827 and 
reported at a pressure of0.2 inches w.g. (50 Pascals). 
Where required by the building official, testing shall be conducted 
by an approved third party. A written report of 
the results of the test shall be signed by the party conducting 
the test and provided to the building official. Testing shall be perfonned 
at any time after creation of all penetrations of the building thermal envelope. 
During testing: 
I. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove 

Telephone number 

( 800 ) 377-6334 

D Delete without substitution 

{)/ 

doors shall be closed, but not sealed, beyond the intended weatherstripping or other infiltration control measures. 

Note: Text continues to list items 2-6 and no changes are made to those items. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 
Going from our current of 7 ACH to 3 ACH would be very difficult. Most states that have adopted the 2015 IECC/IRC have amended the air 
leakage rate to 5 ACH to provide a step towards 3 ACH. The proposed 5 ACH while still an aggressive tightness level will provide a tight, 
comfortable, energy-efficient home. Additionally, homes with less than 5 ACH should be provided with mechanical ventilation. 

f5o Y N,ot? _s- i7o3 lfXJ 
12/ I q I ti /Ylee·ltj : 4Jd ;-l,11n9 I V(1 rJ murl 5 >ei_ :, ~o 5 11°W. "'-l-

~d_o_~o_f _~_,_-lu-_ n_~_ ti_,~_a_{ _~~-· ----~✓--7 /_Ii~~ ~ttfij 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

on tz/ 10, (l<t 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

-ECEIVED 
IDHS 

!IJ lb 

LEGA AI 'D COD 
SERVICES 

2. fJBS/:iefi .line t/:ic01:Jg/:i mateciaf t0 he fie'etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

7 / / / 
code title: Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

N1103.3.1 Insulation 

Code 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number # / ~£ 
Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 484 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

N1103.3.1 (R403.3.1) Insulation (Prescriptive). 
Supply and return ducts in attics shall be insulated to an R-value of not less than R-8 for ducts 3 inches (76 mm) 
in diameter and larger and not less than R-6 for ducts smaller than 3 inches (76 mm) in diameter. Supply and 
return ducts in other portions of the building shall be insulated to not less than R-6 for ducts 3 inches (76 mm) 
in diameter and larger and to not less than R-4.2 for ducts smaller than 3 inches (764 mm) in diameter. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal corrects mistakes in this section. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 
RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Secon 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

AUG 5 10io 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. -9aslted-liFte- thfot:Jfjh-materiel te-be-<Jeleted; underline or bold face material to be added. 

Code title 

3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

N 1103.3.3 Duct testing (Mandatory) 
Proponent Representing (if applicable) 

Page number 

.... .J 

.Dlf~ 
IJfllZIANA. DEAUITM 

IIUIIIIELANlf Sn>I 
f ! 

2018 

Indiana Builders Association 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

101 W Ohio Street, Indianapolis, IN 46204 ( 800 ) 377-6334 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Ill Change to read as follows D Add to read as follows D Delete and substitute as follows D Delete without substitution 

N1103.3.3 (R403.3.3) Duct testing (Mandatory). Ducts shall be pressure tested to determine air leakage by one of the following methods: 
1. Rough-in test: Total leakage shall be measured with a pressure differential of 0.1 inch w.g. (25 Pa) across the system, including the manufacturer's 
air handler enclosure if installed at the time of the test. Registers shall be taped or otherwise sealed during the test. 

2. Postconstruction test: -Total Leakage to outside shall be measured with a pressure differential of 0.1 inch w.g. (25 Pa) across the system, including 
the manufacturer's air handler enclosure if installed at the time of the test. Registers shall be taped or otherwise sealed during the test. 

Exceptions: 
1. A duct air-leakage test shall not be required where the ducts and air handlers are located entirely within the building thermal envelope. 

2. A duct air-leakage test shall not be required for ducts serving heat or energy recovery ventilators that are not integrated with ducts serving heating or 
cooling systems. 

A written report of the results of the test shall be signed by the party conducting the test and provided to the building official. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

f LJ[, r,: !.lt 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. -f>asltee--liFte- thfol::lfjh-materiel te--be--<Jeleted; underline or bold face material to be added. 

Code title 

3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code SeNices, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

N 1103.3.4 Duct leakage (Prescriptive) 
Proponent Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2018 
Page number 

Indiana Builders Association 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

101 W Ohio Street, Indianapolis, IN 46204 ( 800 ) 377-6334 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Ill Change to read as follows D Add to read as follows D Delete and substitute as follows D Delete without substitution 

N1103.3.4 (R403.3.4) Duct leakage (Prescriptive). The total leakage of the ducts, where measured in accordance with Section 
N1103.3.3 (R403.3.3), shall be as follows: 

1. Rough-in test: The total leakage shall be less than or equal to 4 cubic feet per minute (113.3 L/min) per 100 square feet (9.29 m2) of 
conditioned floor area where the air handler is installed at the time of the test. Where the air handler is not installed at the time of the test, 
the total leakage shall be less than or equal to 3 cubic feet per minute (85 L/min) per 100 square feet (9.29 m2) of conditioned floor area. 

2. Postconstruction test: =Fetal Leakage to outside shall be less than or equal to 4 cubic feet per minute (113.3 L/min) per 100 square feet 
(9.29 m2) of conditioned floor area. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

LEGALA~D COD 
SERVICES 

2. Da5l=leEI JiRe #1ro1:1gl=I FRateria! te se Ele!eteEI. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. ~,w,wuacrsee .. ..._ 

Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 
Section number and title Page Number 

N1103.3.5 Building cavities 
Proponent 

Bill Kaufholz 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

_x_ Change to read as follows 

Representing (if applicable) 

Fischer Homes 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

N1103.3.5 Building cavities (Mandatory). 
Building framing cavities shall not be used as filll2l2.ly ducts or plenums. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: 

Telephone number 

Delete without substitution 

This maintains the current code language and allows building cavities to be used for return ducts. Changing the testing from Total leakage to 
Leakage to Outside that we approved a few meetings ago allows this exception to be valid. 

Fiscal impact: Requiring all homes to have fully ducted return ducts will add $2,000-$5,000/new home. 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGALAI,D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. f)95/cie0 fi,:,e t/cir.e1::1gh rr:iateria! t0 he 0etete0. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

7 1i 
Code 

Code title : Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

N1103.6 Mechanical ventilation 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number # / §,,_ 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 486 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

N1103.6 (R403.6) Mechanical ventilation (Mandatory). 
The building shall be provided with ventilation that complies with the requirements of Section M1507 MlSOS or 
with other approved means of ventilation. Outdoor air intakes and exhausts shall have automatic or gravity 
dampers that close when the ventilation system is not operating. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal corrects a mistake in this section. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

EC 'IVED 
HS 

' L ~ i t:fJ18 

L GALAh'D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Q95he€1 fiAe #1r:e1:Jgh rn9ter:i9( te l:>e €/e!etef/. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 1i Code 

Code title : Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

Nll0S.3 Performance based compliance. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number # / 5'7 
Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 487 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 {260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

N1105.3 (R405.3) Performance-based compliance. 
Compliance based on simulated energy performance requires that a proposed residence (proposed design) be 
shown to have an annual energy cost that is less than or equal to the annual energy cost of the standard reference 
design. Energy prices shall be taken from a source approved by the building official, such as the Department of 
Energy, Energy Information Administration's State Energy Data System Prices and Expenditures reports. 
BuildiRg officials shall be permitted to require time of use priciRg iR eRergy cost calculatioRs. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal will not allow a local jurisdiction to require energy raters to use specific time-of-use data for calculations. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

5econ aS 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

' J 1 ; fJ 1 ~ 

LEGAL A 1\ 'D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. fJesheri JlRe thce1:Jgh rneterief te he rie'eteri. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received Code 

code title: Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

Nll0S.3 Performance based compliance. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number # / §'fl 
Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 487 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change the first paragraph of Section Nl 105.4.2 as follows: 

Nll05.4.2 (R405.4.2) Compliance report. 
Compliance software tools shall generate a report that documents that the proposed design complies with Section 
Nl 105.3. A compliance report on the proposed design shall be submitted 1.vith the applieatioH for the buildi0g 
f)emHt for Class 1 structures as required by the General Administrative Rules 675 IAC 12 and as required by 
local ordinance for Class 2 structures. Upon completion of the building, a compliance report based on the as-built 
condition of the building shall be submitted to the building official before a certificate of occupancy is issued. 
Batch sampling of buildings to determine energy code compliance shall only be allowed for stacked multiple­
family units. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal recognizes the Indiana rule for submittal of plans. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since I have no idea how many, if any, jurisdictions require a draft energy report at the time of 
permit application. If the number of jurisdictions that do not require the draft report was known the impact would be a credit for the new rule 
when compared to the 2018 IRC. 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



D 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. fJasheri JiRe th:=e1:1gh material te be riefoteri. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 

ID 
Code Proposal number 

II 
Code title 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

Table Nll0S.5.2(1) 
Proponent 

Bill Kaufholz 
Representing (if applicable) 

Fischer Homes 

Edition 

2018 
Page Number 

Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code} Telephone number 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_J(_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Modify Table Nll0S.5.2{1) as follows:I 

Air ex,change rate Tlre air leakage r.ate at a preuure of O .2 The measured air ,exchange ~ -
ind1 ~.;,g. (50 P.a) shall be 

Gl91~ ~·~ I aali ": ~ .- ehag@s 
~ 
G?R'16•t6 Z ~1~ ~ tmeugh 9: ~ aiE ~ mechanical ventilation ~ ... 
~ag@s per hom:. shall be m. addition to the air 

l~.akage rare and shall be as 
5 .iw:- :cha:nge.s per hour proposed 

Th,e mechanical. ventilation rate shall be 
in addition to the air leakage rate and 
sh.all 'be the same as in nutproposed 
design, but not greater than 
0.0 x CF:i + 7.5 x v,.\i,+ l) " 

where: 
CFA = conditioned floor .are.a, fu . 
l&;., =number of bedrooms. 
Energy re0overy sh.all not be as sum,ed 
for medi.antcal ventilation. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: Adjusts the table for the performance path software calculations to properly calculate the change from 3ACH in the base 2018 to 
5ACH already by the committee. 

Fiscal impact: 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

UL 
LEGALAi,D CODE 

SERVICES 
INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. Q95hefl liRe tJ:lr:01,1gh mater:iaf te be Ele1etefl. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

7 
Code 

C 
Proposal number ,#- / r;'i 

Code title: Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

Page Number Section number and title 

N1107 .1 Scope 1 of 1, Codebook, page 492 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 

Representing (if applicable) 

Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Telephone number 

(260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section Nll07.1 as follows: 

N1107.1 Scope. The provisions of Sections N1107 through N1111 shall control the alteration,~ addition 
and change of occupancy of existing buildings and structures. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal reflects the language in our current rule to remove repairs from the code. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

/?1 I 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

, U._ I O, 

LEGALAl\D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Q95he€1 liRe t/:J c01:1gh mater:ia! t0 he €Je!ete€1. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

17 
Code 

code title: Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

N1107.1.1 Additions, alterations, or repairs: General. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

2Df6 IC 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number 

Edition 

2019 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 492 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 {260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change the title and text of Section N1107.1.1 as follows: 

N1107.1.1 Additions7 and alterations, er repairs: General. Additions; and alterations, or re13airs to an existing 
building, building system or portion thereof shall comply with Section N1108, N1109 or N1110. Unaltered 
portions of the existing building or building supply system shall not be required to comply with this chapter. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal removes reference to repairs as in our current rule. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

as 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

HJL 1 l 

EGALAl 'D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. £!85heE1 fiRe thce1,1~h rnateda1 te be Eie1eteE1. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 

7 
Code Proposal number If 16 / 

Code title : Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

N1107.3 Maintenance. 
Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2019 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 492 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section N1107.3 as follows: 
N1107.3 Maintenance. Builelings anel structures, anel parts thereof, shall '3e Fflaintainea in a safe ans sanitary 

conelition. Devices anel systeFfls that are requireel lay this coele shall '3e Fflaintaineel in conforFflance \.\'ith the coele 
eelition uneler which installeel. The owner or the owner's authorizeel agent shall '3e responsilale for the 
Fflaintenance of '3uilelings anel structures. The requirements of this chapter shall not provide the basis for removal 
or abrogation of energy conservation, fire protection and safety systems and devices in existing structures. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal removes reference to repairs as in our current rule. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve ,,,,. 

I Oil 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

,l 

LEGALA1,D CODE 
SERVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. Q95/:JeEI Hne t/:Jcet,Jg/:J rnaterJa! te he Ele1eteEI. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Code 

C 
Proposal number 

Code title: Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

if /tz 
Section number and title 

N1107.4 Compliance. 
Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 493 
Representing (if applicable) Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 {260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows Add to read as follows X Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Delete Section Nll07.4 and replace as follows: 

N1107.4 Compliance. Alterations. additions. changes in occupancy or relocation of existing buildings shall 
comply with this chapter and the General Administrative Rules. I-AC 675 12. 

l:,715 C 2... 
REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal identifies the GAR as the rule for compliance in these situations . 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since this reflects the current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

L ll'i 

LEGALA1,D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. {;)a5heti Ur:ie thr:01:1gh mater:ia1 t0 be tie1eteti. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Code 

codetitle: Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

N1107 .5 New and replacement materials. 
Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 493 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260} 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

N1107.5 (R501.5) New and replacement materials. 
Except as otherwise required or permitted by this code, materials permitted by the applicable code for new 
construction shall be used. Like materials shall be permitted for repairs, provided that ha:Zards to lifu, health or 
property are aot created. Hazardous materials shall not be used where the code for new construction would not 
allow their use in buildings of similar occupancy, purpose and location. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal removes text relating to repairs since the Indiana rule does not address repairs. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally. 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

J L- 1 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. fJeshefi J.iRe th.r=aE:Jgh rAateria1 ta '3e fie!etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Code title: Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

N1107.6. Historic buildings 
Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook, page 493 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows Add to read as follows X Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

N1107.6 (R501.6) Historic buildings. 
Provisions of this ehapter relating to the eonstruetion, rcpei:r, e#cwetien, restoration and movement of struetures, 
and chengc af eccupency shall net be mandatory for hisl0ric hHikl-ings provided that a report has been submitted 
to the building offieial and signed by the ovmer, a registered riesignprofessienel, or a representative of the State 
Historie Preservation Offiee or the historie preservation authority having jurisdietion, demonstrating that 
eomplianee 1.vith that provision would threaten, degrade or destroy the historie form, fabrie or funetion of the 
hHikl-i1tg. See General Administrative Rules 675 IAC 12. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal references the GAR for historical buildings. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

f;econ q5 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

111 

LEGALAI,D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Qa5/:JeEI Jine t/:Jr-01,19/:J fflateriat t0 ee EleteteEI. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

7 
code title Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

M1201.1 Scope 

Code 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 495 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 {260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

The provisions of Chapters 12 through 24 shall regulate the design, installation, ffiaintenance, alteration and 
inspection of mechanical systems that are permanently installed and used to control environmental conditions 
within buildings. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal removes maintenance from the scope of the code, Indiana rules do not cover maintenance. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since it reflects the requirement of our current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

JUL 1 111 

LEGAL A l 'D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Q95heEI f.JRe thc01:Jgh materia' t0 be Ele!eteEI. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received 

7 
code title Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

M 1201.2 Application 

Code 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

C 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 495 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code} Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows X Delete without substitution 

Mla01,:l ApplisatieR. IA aelelitioA to tl=ie geAeral aelmiAistrative reE1t::1iremeAts of Cl=ia13ter 1, tl=ie aelmiAistrative 
13rovisi0As of tl=iis cl=ia13ter sl=iall a1313ly to tl=ie mecl=iaAical reE1t::1iremeAts of Cl=ia13ters B tl=irot::1gl=i 24. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal deletes the section since the administrative provisions for the Indiana Residential Code are contained in Chapter 1. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since it reflects the requirement of our current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

s 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGAL AI 'D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. fJa5J:iefi liRe #lre~g/:1 ma~ria! te he fie!etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 7/ 11 I fl Code 

?.,o/(t" I/2-.C 
Proposal number #/0~ 

Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 
Section number and title Page Number 

M1202 Existing Mechanical Systems 495 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Phil Gettum Gettum Associates 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_ Change to read as follows - Add to read as follows _X_ Delete and substitute as follows - Delete without substitution 

Delete SECTION M1202 and substitute to read as follows: f or existing installations see Chapter 1 and the General 

Administrative Rules (675 IAC 12). 

REASON STATEMENT A ~D FISCAL IMPACT 

Per the 2005 Indiana Residential Code - No tsca irnfa c-/- . 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION" 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

>eco;-J/ A/J/Jad tr-1'17~ /fl o/; ~r1 . t:tS 
Further study ' 

, ,, 1 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

.~UC 15 2f\i8 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. -9ashed-liFte- thfoti!Jh-maleriel te--be--deleted; underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Code title 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

M 1301.2 Identification 
Proponent 

Phil Gettum 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Representing (if applicable) 

Gettum Associates 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Ltnorsh/p fo,, s,r, ind Stcur Ind/ n 

Edition 

2018 
Page number 

Telephone number 

( 

)(change to read as follows D Add to read as follows D Delete and substitute as follows Ill Delete without substitution 

M UHt ?Jjdentification 
Eac7"errgth of pipe and tubing and each pipe fitting utilized in a mechanical system shall bear the identification of the 

manufacturer. . IYJ \~ II b1fwee/1 -lhe wor/5 "eo.ct 1/ M 

W1cttr 
\ \ (t, fl I I f1j h , 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

For piping already labeled at x feet, there would be wasted materials when less than a full piece is used because you'd be 
limited to using the labeled section of another full piece. 

; fYJf (1,Ci Is 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

a.5 
Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

AU( 0 7 8 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Qashe€l J.iRe thr-et:Jgh nwteria1 ta 13e €le1ete€1. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

code title Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

Section number and title 

M1302 Approval 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 497 
Representing (if applicable) 

Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City,· IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

M1302.1 Listed and Labeled. Appliances regulated by this code shall be listed and labeled for the application in 
which they are installed and used, unless otherwise approved in accordance with Section R104.11 R106.1. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal sends the code user to Indiana Amendment R106.l for approval of alternate materials, methods and equipment. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



RECEIVED 
IDHS 

UG 5 "01b 

A ANDCODE 
S ,. VICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Code title 

2. -90.s/:tee-liRe- thfotJgl'Hnateriel te-be-<ieletetl; underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

M 1305.1 Appliance access for inspection service, repair and replacement 
Proponent 

Phil Gettum 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Representing (if applicable) 

Gettum Associates 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Edition 

2018 
Page number 

Telephone number 

( 

.9(change to read as follows D Add to read as follows D Delete and substitute as follows D Delete without substitution 

M1305.1 Appliance access for inspection service, repair and replacement 
Appliances shall be accessible for inspection, service, repair and replacement without removing permanent construction, 
other appliances, or an"y other piping or duets not eonneeted to the appliance being inspected, serviced, repaired or 
replaced. A level working space not less than 30 inches deep and 30 inches wide (762 mm by 762 mm) shall be provided in 
front of the control side to service an appliance. 

AmtdmVi( Oh!J s-f r;Jt 
fo(Yl rrvposeJ ~tnUt/ to 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This amendment allows for repairs of appliances in close proximity to one another. 

JS 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

5eco 
Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

I U1J 1 5 'l]i8 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. £Je5he€1 .'iRe E-hr01:1gh ffleterie! te be €/e!etef:J. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 

zofD 
Code Proposal number 

If /72 
Code title 

International Residential Code 
Section number and title 

M1305.1.3.1 Ground clearance 
Proponent 

Hank Kidwell 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

_)(_ Change to read as follows 

M1305.1.3.1 Ground clearance 

Representing (if applicable) 

RJ Builders 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Edition 

2018 
Page Number 

Telephone number 

Delete without substitution 

Equipment and appliances supported from the ground shall be level and firmly supported on a concrete slab or 
other approved material extending not less than 3 inches (76 mm) above the adjoining ground not less than~ 2 
inches above the finished grade. Such support shall be in accordance with the manufacturer's installation ..,, 
instructions. Appliances suspended from the floor shall have a clearance of not less than 6 inches (152 mm) from the 
ground. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: 

Per Indiana Amendment to the 2005 Indiana Residential Code, Section M1308. 

A ro X t tnc>A· eli Fiscal impact: ooo 
, 

~VI 
REVIEW RECOM 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 

s 



INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. -Gashed-line- thfotlf}h-fflaterial- ter-bfHfeletetJ; under#ne or bold face material to be added. 

Code title 

3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security. Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, lndlanapolls, Indiana 46204. 

Indiana Residential Code (International Residential Code) 
Section number and title 

M1307.3.1 Protection from impact 
Proponent Representing (ifapp/lcable} 

Page number 

!:; _: ... ::-.-... ::;.: .. />·--::!! 
:~i,-~ ~'ij~-.~J~~~¼i~~_: 

2020 (2018) 

499 

Randy Gulley Wayne Township Fire Department 
Address (number and street, city, state. and ZIP code) 

700 North High School Road 

D Change to read as follows D Add to read as follows 

See attached page for-proposal in it's entirety. 

0 Delete and substitute as follows D Delete without substitution 

5-: 
Estimated _j0'percent of new homes where the building appliances are located within the vehicle travel path and need protection. 
, new homes x average price of protection Is $80.00 equals a~&:00 fiscal impact. 

730 ~ 511, 'joo .oo 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



Indiana Residential Code 2018 
Section M1307.3.l Protection from impact. 

Building appliances and their appurtenances shall be installed outside the 
intended vehicle travel path. Vehicle travel path shall be determined by 
the garage door rough opening width. When building appliances and their 
appurtenances cannot be installed outside the vehicle travel path due to 
design and construction restraints, such appliances shall be protected by 
one of the following methods: 

( 1) Installed in an adjacent but separate equipment room within the 
garage; or 

(2) Installed in an adjacent equipment alcove within the garage that has a 
raised floor or platform that is at least twenty-four (24) inches higher 
than the garage floor; or 

(3) Install bollard(s) that are a minimum three-inch diameter schedule 40 
steel pipe embedded a minimum of 18 inches below grade and at least 
24 inches above the garage floor with pipe cap, or 

(4)1nstall bollard(s) that are a minimum three-inch diameter schedule 40 
steel pipe with a welded 8inch by 8inch by 114inch base plate 
anchored to the garage floor slab using 112inch wedge anchors or 
equivalent with a minimum embedment of 2-1/4inch. Height of 
bollard to be at least 24 inches above garage floor with pipe cap; or 

(5) Install a minimum 72" long x 6" wide x 4" high bumper curb that is 
anchored to the concrete floor. 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

t, l j l 1 5 I I J1 ' 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

2. Da5J:ieti liRe #lr:01:1gR fflateria! to se tie!eteti. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Received 

<ti 17 /zol<t 
Code 

?..Of<l 71!-C 
Proposal number 

Code title Edition 

International Residential Code 2018 

-ff 

Section number and title Page Number 

M1411.3.1 Auxiliary and secondary drain systems 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Hank Kidwell RJ Builders 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) - Telephone number 

PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

/75 

Change to read as follows X Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows fft,,, tt- 5 · - - -
Delete without substitution -

I~ ""~ pti~o :'° tbe en<i of itemA in Section Ml~l,~3- ~J. '-b~ as follows: 

hee13t i0R.. When installed on a water-resistant floor-wi.t.R~ floor drain in the same room or space. 
I\ 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Reason: I 

Per Indiana Amendment to the 2005 Indiana Residential Code, Section M1411.3.1 

Fiscal impact: N ~u+ {°' I 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

~ • n 
Approve as amended 

fl ofi o/1 r;ecoflc( A Pofnw_ ~-el I as 
Further study 

, I I f I 



Received 

Code title 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 

CE VED 
DI-IS 

·State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 

EGA ANDCODE 
SERVICES 

1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

2. D€15Refi .!iRe #lro1:1gR fflateria.< to l3e fie.!etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

'8' /7/zo/8 
Code 

?JJ/'r; Iec Proposal number 

' 
, 

Edition 

Indiana Resident ial Code 2020 

# 

Section number and title Page Number 

/)~ 

M1502.4.2 Duct installation 1 of 1, codeboo_k page 509 
Proponent I Representing (if applicable) 

Craig Wagner IABO 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_x Change to read as follows - Add to read as follows - Delete and substitute as follows - Delete without substitution 

Change Ml 502.4.2 Duct Installation as follows: 

M1502.4.2 Duct installation. 
Exhaust ducts shall be supported at intervals not to exceed 12 feet (3658 mm) and shall be secured in place. The 
insert end of the duct shall extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of airflow. Exhaust duct joints 
shall be sealed in accordance with Section M1601.4.1 and shall be meehanieally fastened mechanically or by 
other approved metqods . Ducts shall not be joined with screws or similar fasteners that protrude more than 1/8 
inch (3.2 mm) into the inside of the duct. Where dryer exhaust ducts are enclosed in wall or ceiling cavities, such 
cavities shall allow the installation of the duct without deformation. I 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal allows other methods other than just screws to fasten clothes dryer ducts together. 

Fiscal impact: no fiscal impact. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION n 

Approve 

((\of-/ nn , Secorld, A PO ,ov-e, di 
, 

5ab f(l ~fie o 
1 as 

Reject - ' ii 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

ECE rED 
IDHS 

,·.LJ1j I) i IIJ10 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Q95/:ied lir:ie t/:1 rf>l:JfJR R'leteriet te he de feted. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

code title Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

M1601.1.2 Underground duct systems 
Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 513 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

M1601.1.2 Underground duct systems. 
Underground duct systems shall be constructed of approved concrete, clay, metal or plastic. The maximum design 
temperature for systems utilizing plastic duct and fittings shall be 150°F (66°C). Metal ducts shall be protected 
from corrosion in an approved manner or shall be completely encased in concrete not less than 2 inches (51 mm) 
thick. Nonmetallic ducts shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions. Plastic pipe and 
fitting materials shall conform to cell classification 12454-B of ASTM D1248 or ASTM DI 784 and external 
loading properties of ASTM D2412. Ducts shall slope to a drainage point that has access. Ducts shall be sealed 
according to the manufacturer's installation instructions or Section M1601.4 seeured and tested prior to encasing 
the ducts in concrete or direct burial. Duet tightness shall be verified as required by SeetioR 1'H 103.3. Metallic 
ducts having an approved protective coating and nonmetallic ducts shall be installed in accordance with the 
manufacturer's instructions. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal removes requirements for testing of underground duct systems. Duct joints are inspected for correct sealing by 
inspectors before burial and a requirement for testing would be extremely difficult and offer little in the way of enhanced energy 
conservation. 
Fiscal impact: This proposal will reduce the cost of construction in comparison to the 2018 IRC since testing of the underground ducts will 
not be required. Assuming one third of the houses are slab or partial slab type foundations then 14»068 + 3 = 4689, 4689 x 150.00 = $703,350.00 
credit from the 2018 I RC. 

REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 
Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

tUG J 7 ?ll1~ 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. fJ6fSRe6' J.ine #lre1,1g~ r:r::iaterJal te se 6'elete6'. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 

4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 
402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

code title Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

M1601.4.5 Fireblocking 
Representing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 515 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

M1601.4.5 Fireblocking. Duct installations shall be fireblocked in accordance with Section R602.8 R302.11. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 
This proposal sends the code user to the correct section for fireblocking. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



ECEI 'ED 
ID S 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
r ur, o 7 1r11( 

State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) LE AL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 
2. Qas/:Jed line t/:Jret,Jg/:J fflateria.' te he de.'etefi.. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet/or any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

code title Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

M1602.2 Return air 
Represent ing (if applicable) 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 516 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows X Delete without substitution 

Delete Item #6 to Section M1602 and renumber Item #7 as Item #6 as follows: 

M1602.2 Return air openings. 
e. Taking ret1::1rn air frorn an 1::1nconditioned crawl space shall not ee accomplished thro1::1gh a direct connection 

to the ret1::1rn side of a forced air f1::1rnace. Transfer openings in the cra 1avl space enclos1::1re shall not ee 

prohieited. 

* 6. Return air from one dwelling unit shall not be discharged into another dwelling unit. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

Builders have long been concerned with the potential odors from crawl spaces; allowing return air to be drawn from the 
unconditioned crawl space provides a direct path for potential odors into the living space of the dwelling. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

{YJ of l~/1 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



Received 

1 
Code title 

PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 
1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

''Ectn £.v 
IDH 

U 07 l.Oi8 

LEGAL AI\'D CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Da5J:iefi !-iRe #lro1:1gf:I R'lateria! ta se fie!etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 
Code Proposal number 

Indiana Residential Code 
Edition 

2020 
Page Number 

Zl 

Section number and title 

M1801.9 Fireblocking 1 of 1, codebook page 519 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) 

Representing (if applicable) 

IABO 

220 W Van Buren Street, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

_}(_ Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows 

Change M1801.9 as follows: 

Telephone number 

260-248-3111, Cell 260-212-2943 

Delete without substitution 

M1801.9 Fireblocking. Vent and chimney installations shall be fireblocked in accordance with Section R6Q2.8 
R302.11 and R1003.19. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This proposal sends the code user to the correct sections for fireblocking. 

Fiscal impact: no fiscal impact 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

See-on 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

r - . ,, 
•~ I ;,, 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. f)95hefi tine th,r:01:Jgl:1 fflateriaf te he fie 1etefi. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet/or any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

zo/'3 
Code 

Zo/ C 
Proposal number 

code title Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

# 
Section number and title 

M2001.1.2 Regulated boilers 
Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 525 
Representing (if applicable) Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 260-248-3111, cell 260-212-2943 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows X Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Add Section M2001.1.2 to read as follows: 
M2001.1.2 Regulated boilers. Boilers and water heaters regulated by the Boiler and Pressure Vessel Rules 
Board (680 IAC 2) under IC 22-13-2-9 are not regulated by this code. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This section clarifies which boilers are regulated by this code. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since it reflects the requirement of our current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

ECEIVED 
IDHS 

S ~ r (l 9 1 n IR 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

Received 

2. Qesher:I .liRe ttlr01,1g/:I material t0 he r:le!eter:I. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this ~ompleted form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

z.01i 
Code zo;i 1ec Proposal number 

code title Indiana Residential Code Edition 

2020 

~1ot • lNll-' S•un1 

tf I 

Section number and title Page Number 

M2201.3 Underground tanks 1 of 1, Codebook page 533 
Representing (if applicable) Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

Change to read as follows Add to read as follows X Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Delete M2201.3 and substitute as follows: M2201.3 Underground tanks. Excavations for underground tanks 
shall not undermine the foundations of existing structures. Underground tanks shall be set on firm foundations 
and surrounded with at least 6 inches (152.4 mm) of noncorrosive inert material, such as clean sand or gravel 
well tamped in place or in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions. Tanks shall be covered 
with a minimum of 2 feet (609.6 mm) of earth or shall be covered by not less than 1 foot (304.8 mm) of earth, 
on top of which shall be placed a slab of reinforced concrete not less than 4 inches (101.6 mm) thick. When 
underground tanks are, or are likely to be, subjected to traffic, they shall be protected against damage from 
vehicles passing over them by at least 3 feet (914.4 mm) of earth cover, or 18 inches (457.2' mm) of well-tamped 
earth plus 6 inches (152.4 mm) of reinforced concrete, or 8 inches (203.2 mm) of asphaltic concrete. When 
asphaltic or reinforced concrete paving is used as part of the protection, it shall extend at least 1 foot (304.8 
mm) horizontally beyond the outline of the tank in all directions. The clearance from the tank to the nearest 
wall of a basement, pit, or property line shall not be less than 1 foot (305 mm). Corrosion protection shall be 
provided in accordance with SECTION M2203.7. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This section reflects other Indiana rules that affect underground tanks. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since it reflects the requirement of our current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

n 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 



PROPOSAL FOR CODE CHANGE 
State Form 41186 (R3 / 5-10) 

INSTRUCTIONS: 1. Only a TYPED copy will be accepted. 

RECEIVED 
IDHS 

:t:r O 9 01 

LEGAL AND CODE 
SERVICES 

2. Qe&/:leEI Une t/:lre1,1g/:i ~eterie1 te l3e Ele1eterJ.. Underline or bold face material to be added. 
3. Use a second sheet for any material requiring more space. 
4. Return this completed form to: Indiana Department of Homeland Security, Code Services, 

402 West Washington Street, Room W246, Indianapolis, Indiana 46204. 

Received q 4 · 
20 

/ </ 
Code title Indiana Residential Code 

Section number and title 

M2301.1 General 

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY 

Zo/7> ItC 

Representing (if applicable) 

Proposal number · WD 

Edition 

2020 

Page Number 

1 of 1, Codebook page 535 
Proponent 

Craig Wagner Indiana Association of Building Officials 
Address (number and street, city, state, and ZIP code) Telephone number 

220 W Van Buren St, Ste 204, Columbia City, IN 46725 (260) 248-3111 
PROPOSED CODE CHANGE (check one) 

X Change to read as follows Add to read as follows Delete and substitute as follows Delete without substitution 

Change Section M2301.1 as follows: M2301.1 General. This section provides for the design, construction, 
installation, and alteration, aAEI re13air of equipment and systems using solar thermal energy to provide space 
heating or cooling, hot water and swimming pool heating. 

REASON STATEMENT AND FISCAL IMPACT 

This section removes repair from the text. 

Fiscal impact: This proposal is fiscally neutral since it reflects the requirement of our current rule. 
REVIEW RECOMMENDATION 

Approve 

5econ 
Reject 

Approve as amended 

Further study 


	201902061529
	IRCC's Final Approved Amendments (Proposed Code Changes) to 2018 IRC - as of 12-19-18 (Part 3)
	IRCC's Final Approved Amendments (Proposed Code Changes) to 2018 IRC - as of 12-19-18
	IRCC's Final Approved Amendments (Proposed Code Changes) to 2018 IRC - as of 12-19-18
	Approved Amendments (Proposed Code Changes) to 2018 IRC - as of 11-20-18
	Approved Amendments (Proposed Code Changes) to 2018 IRC - as of 11-20-18
	Residential Code Amendments - Part 8
	Residential Code Amendments - Part 9
	Residential Code Amendments - Part 10








