INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -31220-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100715, 140098200ST3 DBE GOAL: 10.00
DESCRIPTION: PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT AND UTILITY RELOCATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 4,140,000.00
CALL: 140 ROUTE: 26 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 26 FROM US 27 TO 0.78 MILE EAST OF US 27

COUNTY: JAY

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 4,244,987.30 |R [ X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | | DBE 10.00%
35-1609544 | SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 4,944,535.42 |R |
| | Indiana 317-484-1500 | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | RICHMOND | $ 4,414,420.90 |R |
| | Indiana 765-935-4231 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -31536-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800856 DBE GOAL: 14.00
DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 729,000.00
CALL: 150 ROUTE: 231 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 231 OVER UNNAMED TRIBUTARY TO OWL CREEK, 0.07 MILES
SOUTH OF US 36
COUNTY: PUTNAM

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 1,137,642.41 |R |
| | Indiana 317-634-5561 | | |
35-2046222 | MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 799,000.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-356-9250 | | | | DBE 14.35%
38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 941,305.99 |R |
| | Indiana 317-284-1195 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 3
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -31649-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800360 DBE GOAL: 12.00
DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT, ROUNDABOUT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 653,000.00
CALL: 160 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON FRUITRIDGE ROAD AT HAYTHORNE ROAD

COUNTY: VIGO

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 897,958.25 |C |
| | Indiana 812-933-0205 | | |
37-0797609 | FEUTZ CONTRACTORS INC | PARIS | $ 774,303.13 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Illinois 217-465-8402 | | | | DBE 12.34%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 4
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -31952-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200599 DBE GOAL: 12.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION AND BRIDGE WIDENING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 2,289,000.00
CALL: 170 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON ENTERPRISE DRIVE FROM MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVD TO
RIDGEVIEW DRIVE
COUNTY: MADISON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 2,621,210.00 |R |
| | Indiana 317-634-5561 | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 2,423,890.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | | DBE 12.11%
35-1609544 | SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 2,502,201.80 |R |
| | Indiana 317-484-1500 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 2,492,718.97 |R |
| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | | |
36-2839689 | ILLINOIS CONSTRUCTORS CORP | ELBURN | $ 2,596,946.20 |R |
| | Illinois 630-232-7280 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.



CONTRACT R

CALL: 180

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

2015

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

PAGE:
DATE:

14.00
$ 4,804,000.00

5
03/13/15

REMARKS
AWARD
DBE 14.01%

-32464-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0501089
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION
ROUTE :
LOCATION: ON 16TH STREET FROM SR 37 TO US 50
COUNTY: LAWRENCE
BIDDER ADDRESS
| E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON
| | Indiana
| CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON
| | Indiana
| RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH
| | Indiana
| MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS

Indiana

TYPE LOW
IR [
[ [ [
IR [ X |
| | |
IR I
I I I
IR [



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 6
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -33557-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100504 DBE GOAL: 14.00
DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 1,155,000.00
CALL: 190 ROUTE: 35 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 35 OVER LONG BRANCH CREEK, 0.95 MILES WEST OF I-69

COUNTY: GRANT

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 1,104,867.15 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | | DBE 14.01%
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 1,345,008.56 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |
35-2094565 | 3D COMPANY INC | MUNCIE | $ 1,169,688.05 |R |

| | Indiana 765-288-3326 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 7
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -33952-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006760 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 695,000.00
CALL: 200 ROUTE: 30 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 30, 0.97 MILE EAST OF SR 39

COUNTY: LAPORTE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 1,200,835.67 |R |
| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | |
35-1035122 | GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC | GARY | $ 1,127,500.00 |R |
| | Indiana 219-887-5233 | | |
35-1058916 | WOODRUFF & SONS INC | MICHIGAN CITY | $ 806,041.10 |R |
| | Indiana 219-872-8605 | | |
35-1677832 | L G S PLUMBING INC | CROWN POINT | $ 769,970.44 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 219-663-2177 | | | | DBE 6.63%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

CONTRACT R -34562-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0300446
DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT
CALL: 210 ROUTE: 54

LOCATION: ALONG SR 54, 1.73 MILES EAS

COUNTY: GREENE

T OF SR 59

2015

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:
VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

8
03/17/15

PAGE:
DATE:
11.00
$ 503,000.00
REMARKS
AWARD *

DBE 11.00%

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON
| | Indiana
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON
| | Indiana
*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS

THAN $1,000,000.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 9
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -34644-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006682 DBE GOAL: 7.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 709,000.00
CALL: 220 ROUTE: 110 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 110 FROM SR 10 TO US 231

COUNTY: JASPER

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GARY | $ 558,978.60 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 219-977-0722 | | | | DBE 7.20%
35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH | S 695,423.17 |R |
| | Indiana 219-924-5900 | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 621,870.14 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |
35-1550663 | TOWN & COUNTRY CONSTRUCTION IN | DEMOTTE | S 616,121.38 |R | IRREGULAR *2

| | Indiana 219-987-5450 | | |

*2 FAILED TO SUBMIT A PERFORMANCE BOND AND DRUG PLAN BY THE BID SUBMITTALS DEADLINE. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A) (1).



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 10
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/26/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -34672-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173751 DBE GOAL: 14.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD REHABILITATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,936,000.00
CALL: 230 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON MADISON AVENUE AND FIFTH STREET FROM O&M AVENUE TO US 50

COUNTY: JENNINGS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 2,374,653.00 [R | |

I | Indiana 812-346-4135 | I 1
35-1487672 | MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING | NEW ALBANY | $ 2,171,786.78 |[R | X | AWARD *

I | Indiana 812-941-7895 | I 11 DBE 17.89%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 11
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -34719-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129630400ST4 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 1,633,000.00
CALL: 240 ROUTE: 16 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 16 FROM US 231 TO US 421

COUNTY: JASPER WHITE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | LAFAYETTE | $ 1,844,165.92 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 765-447-2324 | | | | DBE 8.11%
35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH | $ 1,926,094.20 |R |
| | Indiana 219-924-5900 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

129718400LC1

ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES

20

ALONG VARIOUS ROADS THOUGHOUT THE RACCOON STATE
RECREATION AREA

15

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

PAGE:
DATE:

14.00
$ 832,000.00

CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

REMARKS

12
03/27/15

AWARD *1
DBE 5.38%

CONTRACT R -35163-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO.
DESCRIPTION:
CALL: 250 ROUTE:
LOCATION:
COUNTY: PARKE
CODE BIDDER
35-1582525 | JERRY AIGNER CONSTRUCTION
I
35-1606893 | OLCO INC
I
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY
|
41-2126414 | JS MCCULLOUGH EXCAVATING LLC

ADDRESS PHONE
BOONVILLE |
Indiana 812-897-5815 |
BATESVILLE |
Indiana 812-933-0205 |
ANDERSON |
Indiana 765-378-5783 |
BAINBRIDGE |
Indiana 765-386-6514 |

TYPE LOW
IR |
| | |
IR X |
[ [ [
IR [ [
I I I
IR I

IRREGULAR *2

*1 AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A)
*1 AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW BY

*2 BIDDER FAILED TO SUBMIT A POWER OF ATTORNEY

- LOW

BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.

00.

DEPARTMENT’S ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION.

LETTER FOR PERFORMANCE BOND WITH BID.

BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A) (1).



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 13
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -35544-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173621 DBE GOAL: 11.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 4,150,000.00
CALL: 260 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON POST ROAD FROM I-70 TO 46TH STREET

COUNTY: MARION

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 4,300,000.00 |R |
| | Indiana 317-634-5561 | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 4,949,341.61 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 4,458,000.00 |R |
| | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | |

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS | S 4,038,000.00 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 317-788-6885 | | | | DBE 11.02%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 14
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/09/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -35612-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173694 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 110,000.00
CALL: 270 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE TOWN OF SUNMAN

COUNTY: RIPLEY

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-1323837 | SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | WEST CHESTER | $ 187,433.43 |R |
| | Ohio 513-326-6000 | | |
35-0844079 | PAUL H ROHE COMPANY | AURORA | $ 213,288.50 |R |
| | Indiana 812-926-1471 | | |
35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 157,374.51 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-933-0205 | | | |
35-1636776 | LINKEL COMPANY | BATESVILLE | S 387,897.00 |R |
| | Indiana 812-934-5190 | | |
35-2155873 | KINGS TRUCKING & EXCAVATION IN | SEYMOUR | $ 219,697.25 |R |
| | Indiana 812-522-6973 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

PAGE: 16
DATE: 03/09/15

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015
CONTRACT R -37096-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1383341 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD - ROAD RECONSTRUCTION AND BRIDGE REHAB ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 97,000,000.00
CALL: 320 ROUTE: 65 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON I-65 FROM 0.85 MILES SOUTH OF SR 44 TO 6.18 MILES SOUTH
OF I-465
COUNTY: JOHNSON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | $ 9,843,078.25 | |

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | | |

| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | $ 7,866,377.52 | |

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | | |
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC| CROWN POINT 219-661-2450 | NO BID | |

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN | | |
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC| CROWN POINT 219-661-2450 | $ 98,619,225.58 | |

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN | | |
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN 574-875-5183 | $ 95,607,908.84 | |

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN | | |
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN 574-875-5183 | NO BID | |

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON 765-643-5358 NO BID |

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON 765-643-5358 $ 87,211,773.73 |

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS 317-788-6885 $ 84,030,501.10 [ X | AWARD *

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN | | DBE 8.11%
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS 317-788-6885 NO BID |

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN |
NOTE: RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF THE ALTERNATE SECTION BIDS AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE
MAINTENANCE:
THE LOWEST RANKING
AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 (A) + PVFM 0001

= $ 84,030,501.10 + $ 9,843,078.25 = $ 93,873,579.35



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 17
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT R -37147-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140027600LC1 DBE GOAL: 14.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 488,000.00
CALL: 330 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 100N FROM CR 900E TO COMBS RUN LANE, AND CR 100S FROM
WINING LANE TO SEQUOIA LANE
COUNTY: HENDRICKS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 572,525.00 |R |
| | Indiana 317-634-5561 | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 568,022.00 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 457,950.00 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | | | DBE 14.01%
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 471,759.00 |R |

| | Indiana 317-788-6885 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 18
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT RS-35283-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129628300ST1 DBE GOAL: 10.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 665,000.00
CALL: 370 ROUTE: 26 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 26, FROM 1.36 MILES WEST OF SR 29 TO 0.40 MILE EAST OF
SR 29
COUNTY: CLINTON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | LAFAYETTE | $ 719,774.14 |R |
| | Indiana 765-447-2324 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | S 599,929.51 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | | DBE 10.03%
35-1621699 | CENTRAL PAVING INC | LOGANSPORT | $ 647,395.80 |R |
| | Indiana 574-722-4727 | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE | $ 724,721.45 |R |

| | Indiana 765-772-7500 | | | |



CONTRACT RS-35331-A

CALL: 380

ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:

BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297628
DESCRIPTION:

SURFACE TREATMENT, THIN HMA OVERLAY

37
ON SR 37,
OF SR 62
PERRY

FROM 0.11 MILE SOUTH OF SR 70 TO

ADDRESS

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:
VINCENNES DISTRICT

0.25 MILE SOUTH

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE:
DATE:

8.00
$ 1,291,000.00

REMARKS

19
03/17/15

| EVANSVILLE
| Indiana

| ANDERSON
| Indiana



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 20
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/27/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

MBE GOAL: 7.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
CONTRACT RS-35356-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297659 WBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: INSTITUTION AND PARK ROAD MANTENANCE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 411,000.00
CALL: 390 ROUTE : FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE SALAMONIE RIVER
STATE FOREST
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 443,238.88 |R |

| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | |
35-1016737 | WAYNE ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | FORT WAYNE | $ 409,944.80 |R | | TRREGULAR *1

| | Indiana 260-747-7531 | | |
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 384,810.00 |R | X | AWARD *2

| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | IMBE 7.00% WBE 14.55% IVBE 0.00%
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | S 459,335.83 |R |

| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |

*1 FAILED TO SUBMIT NOTARIZED PERFORMANCE BOND AND POWER OF ATTORNEY WITH THE BID. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A) (1).

*2 AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN'S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

CONTRACT RS-37117-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1383224
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, THIN HMA OVERLAY

CALL: 400 ROUTE: 46
LOCATION: ON SR 46,

COUNTY: MONROE

FROM RED HILL ROAD TO SR 37

ADDRESS

2015

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:
SEYMOUR DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE:
DATE:

13.00
$ 2,458,000.00

REMARKS

21
03/13/15

| ANDERSON
| Indiana

CODE BIDDER
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC
I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP

| INDIANAPOLIS
| Indiana



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT RS-37255-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138367000ST5 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE AND TRAFFIC SIGNALS MODERNIZATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 410 ROUTE: 46 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 46 AND US 31 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

COUNTY: BARTHOLOMEW VARIOUS

PAGE:
DATE:

14.00
$ NONE BELOW

REMARKS

22
03/09/15

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 3,160,644.82 |R |
| | Indiana 317-634-5561 | | |
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 2,873,377.48 |R |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 3,088,893.94 |R |
| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | |

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - ALL BIDS REJECTED; TO BE READVERTISED.



CONTRACT RS-37758-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

140111100ST3

DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE

CALL: 420 ROUTE: 40

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 3 FROM US 40 TO SOUTH WEST RAMP OF I-70

COUNTY: HENRY

ADDRESS

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

6.

$

00

674,000.00

REMARKS

PAGE:
DATE:

23
03/13/15

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

ANDERSON
Indiana

NORTH VERNON
Indiana

CODE BIDDER

35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION
I

35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC
I

35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC
|

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

| $ 656,000.00 |R |
| | | |
| $ 535,175.00 |R | X |
| | | |
| $ 544,798.85 |R |
| | | |
| $ 548,854.89 |R |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS

RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT RS-37875-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140120200ST2
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE
CALL: 430 ROUTE: 69

LOCATION: ON COLDWATER ROAD OVER I-69 FROM 0.31 MILE
TO 0.37 MILE NORTH OF I-69
COUNTY: ALLEN

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

SOUTH OF I-69

AMOUNT OF BID

0.

$

00

PAGE:
DATE:

166,000.00

REMARKS

24
03/13/15

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE
| | Indiana 260-478-1990
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON
| | Indiana 765-643-5358
62-1492793 | API CONSTRUCTION CORP | LAOTTO
| | Indiana 260-897-2743

TYPE LOW
IR X |
[ [ [
IR I
| | |
IR I

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 25
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT RS-37887-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138322300ST5 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, THIN HMA OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 289,000.00
CALL: 440 ROUTE: 446 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 446, FROM EAST MOORES PIKE TO SR 46

COUNTY: MONROE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 267,611.00 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 222,098.83 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 317-788-6885 | | |



CONTRACT RS-38148-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

ASPHALT RESURFACE

150005900S8T6

2015

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:
VINCENNES DISTRICT

FROM SR 145 TO 0.20 MILE WEST OF US 150

ADDRESS

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

26
03/17/15

| JASPER
| Indiana

DESCRIPTION:

CALL: 450 ROUTE: 56

LOCATION: ON SR 56,
COUNTY: ORANGE
CODE BIDDER
11-3838875 | CALCAR PAVING INC
I
35-0626844 | J H RUDOLPH & COMPANY

| EVANSVILLE
| Indiana

PAGE:
DATE:
8.00
$ 539,000.00
REMARKS
AWARD
DBE 9.65%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 27
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -29066-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0301059 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 204,000.00
CALL: 500 ROUTE: 18 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 18 OVER SPRING CREEK, 4.32 MILES EAST OF SR 43

COUNTY: WHITE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 179,235.00 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | |
35-1339168 | LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I | LAPORTE | $ 245,265.44 |R |
| | Indiana 219-393-5555 | | |
35-1523985 | YATES CONSTRUCTION INC | KENTLAND | $ 283,813.26 |R |

| | Indiana 219-474-6542 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -29719-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 5242009 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT AND NEW BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:
CALL: 520 ROUTE: 58 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 58 OVER BRANCH OF MARIAH CREEK AND UNNAMED TRIBUTARY
TO MARIAH CREEK,1.22 MILES WEST OF SR 159
COUNTY: KNOX

PAGE:
DATE:

10.00
$ 1,770,000.00

REMARKS

28
03/17/15

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 1,709,812.30 |R | X |
| | Indiana 812-336-3438 | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 2,020,015.70 |R |
| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | BLOOMINGTON | $ 1,997,758.96 |R |

| | Indiana 812-355-2674 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 29
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -30197-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9940020 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: COVERED BRIDGE REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 402,000.00
CALL: 530 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 575W OVER SAND CREEK, 0.24 MILES NORTH OF SR 7

COUNTY: JENNINGS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1310611 | DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC | FRANKLIN | $ 749,119.50 |R |
| | Indiana 317-736-6024 | | |
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 781,816.55 |R |
| | Indiana 812-336-3438 | | |
35-2109889 | BRADSHAW BUILDING SPECIALTIES | NORTH VERNON | $ 542,357.37 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-346-1742 | | | | DBE 9.78%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

0800870

2015

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $

PAGE: 30
DATE: 03/13/15

14.00
1,460,000.00

CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
ON SR 59 OVER EEL RIVER, 3.29 MILES SOUTH OF SR 46 AND ON

7.34 MILES EAST OF SR 59

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

REMARKS

CONTRACT B -31591-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900286,
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY
CALL: 540 ROUTE: 59
LOCATION:
SR 42 OVER EEL RIVER,
COUNTY: CLAY
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE
| | Indiana
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON
| | Indiana

AWARD *
DBE 15.54%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (C)

- LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15%

OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 31
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/09/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -33286-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100372 DBE GOAL: 11.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § NONE BELOW
CALL: 560 ROUTE: 450N GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 450N OVER KILLBUCK CREEK

COUNTY: MADISON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
36-2839689 | ILLINOIS CONSTRUCTORS CORP | ELBURN | $ 2,380,000.00 |R | | REJECT *
| | Illinois 630-232-7280 | | |

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - BID REJECTED; TO BE READVERTISED.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 32
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34019-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006697 DBE GOAL: 11.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 425,000.00
CALL: 580 ROUTE: 55 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 55 OVER IROQUOIS RIVER, 0.29 MILE NORTH OF SR 16

COUNTY: NEWTON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1339168 | LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I | LAPORTE | $ 808,642.36 |R |
| | Indiana 219-393-5555 | | |
35-1523985 | YATES CONSTRUCTION INC | KENTLAND | $ 552,323.66 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 219-474-6542 | | | | DBE 11.02%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 33
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34155-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173090 DBE GOAL: 11.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 992,000.00
CALL: 590 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON WHITE LICK ROAD, 0.74 MILE SOUTH OF HENDRICKS COUNTY
LINE ROAD
COUNTY: MORGAN
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 1,128,160.15 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-634-5561 | | | | DBE 11.29%
36-2839689 | ILLINOIS CONSTRUCTORS CORP | ELBURN | $ 1,216,000.00 |R |
| | Illinois 630-232-7280 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 34
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34313-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 100614 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 253,000.00
CALL: 610 ROUTE: 24 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON OLD US 24 OVER US 24, 1.2 MILES EAST OF SR 9

COUNTY: HUNTINGTON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
26-4305155 | R A MYERS CONSTRUCTION CO | MUNCIE | $ 228,516.29 |R |
| | Indiana 765-896-9704 | | |

35-1057237 | R L MCCOY INC | COLUMBIA CITY | $ 205,591.38 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 260-625-3443 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 35
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34627-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173842 DBE GOAL: 11.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 746,000.00
CALL: 630 ROUTE: 56 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 56 OVER HIGHLAND CREEK AND CSX RR, 0.07 MILE EAST OF
SR 60
COUNTY: WASHINGTON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 774,725.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | | DBE 11.22%
35-1487672 | MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING | NEW ALBANY | $ 934,284.31 |R |
| | Indiana 812-941-7895 | | | |
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 865,180.87 |R |
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS

RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34651-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173895
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY
CALL: 640 ROUTE: 23

LOCATION: ON SR 23 OVER JUDAY CREEK, 0.90 MILE SOUTH

COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT
OF I-90

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

36
03/17/15

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE

32-0154474 | JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC | LAPORTE

| | Indiana 219-324-9393
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GARY

| | Indiana 219-977-0722
35-1339168 | LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I | LAPORTE

| | Indiana 219-393-5555
35-1690004 | NORTHERN INDIANA CONSTRUCTION | MISHAWAKA

| | Indiana 574-256-1811

PAGE:
DATE:
9.00
$ 380,000.00
REMARKS
AWARD
DBE 9.26%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 37
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34726-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129631700ST DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 231,000.00
CALL: 650 ROUTE: 53 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 53 OVER TURKEY CREEK, 2.31 MILES NORTH OF US 30

COUNTY: LAKE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GARY | $ 314,223.20 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 219-977-0722 | | |
35-1035122 | GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC | GARY | $ 338,700.00 |R |
| | Indiana 219-887-5233 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

2015

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:
LAPORTE DISTRICT
1.5 MILES NORTH OF US

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE: 38
DATE: 03/17/15

CONTRACT B -34727-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1296318
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK REHABILITATION
CALL: 660 ROUTE: 55
LOCATION: ON SR 55 OVER MAIN BEAVER DAM DITCH,
231
COUNTY: LAKE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE
32-0154474 | JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC | LAPORTE
| | Indiana

0.00

$ 384,000.00
REMARKS
AWARD *

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A)

- LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 39
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/26/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34833-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129620300ST6 DBE GOAL: 13.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 567,000.00
CALL: 690 ROUTE: 231 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 231 OVER PLUMMER CREEK, 2.42 MILES SOUTH OF SR 54

COUNTY: GREENE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 755,315.56 |R | |
[ | Indiana 812-280-4404 | [ [
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 652,562.82 |[R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-336-3438 | | 11 DBE 11.21%
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 714,176.40 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.

*AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW BY DEPARTMENT”S ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

CONTRACT B -34835-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006461

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK
CALL: 700 ROUTE: 67

LOCATION: ON SR 67 OVER US 41,

COUNTY: KNOX

REPLACEMENT

ADDRESS

5.06 MILES SOUTH OF SR 550

2015

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

PAGE: 40
DATE: 03/17/15

9.00
$ 1,800,000.00

| ANDERSON
| Indiana

REMARKS
AWARD *
DBE 9.29%

| JEFFERSONVILLE
| Indiana

| NEWBURGH
| Indiana

CODE BIDDER

35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC
I

35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE
I

35-1878024 | RAGLE INC
|

36-2839689 | ILLINOIS CONSTRUCTORS CORP

| ELBURN
| Illinois

PHONE
IS
765-643-5358 |
I $
812-280-4404 |
[
812-853-9558 |
[

TYPE LOW
IR X |
| | |
IR I
| | |
IR I
\ \ \
IR [

BIDDER IS ONE OF

FOUR OR MORE BIDS

RECEIVED.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 41
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34838-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129622300ST6 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 329,000.00
CALL: 710 ROUTE: 245 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 245 OVER CROOKED CREEK, 3.92 MILES NORTH OF SR 70

COUNTY: SPENCER

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 521,548.63 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 528,441.60 |R |
| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 42
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -34846-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173828 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 398,000.00
CALL: 720 ROUTE: VARIOUS VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 64 OVER EAST FORK CREEK, 0.17 MILE EAST OF SR 57, AND
ON SR 68 OVER NEW PIGEON CREEK, 1.82 MILES EAST OF SR 57

COUNTY: GIBSON WARRICK
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 439,992.12 |R |
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | |
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 372,652.00 |R |
| | Indiana 812-336-3438 | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 350,117.82 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 43
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35221-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129633800ST4 DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE PAINTING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 1,001,000.00
CALL: 730 ROUTE: 6 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 6 OVER DEEP RIVER, ON US 12 OVER LAKE GEORGE CANAL
AND ON US 231 OVER HOWE DITCH

COUNTY: LAKE JASPER

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1602596 | CIVIL COATINGS AND CONSTRUCTIO | VALPARAISO | $ 672,930.40 |R |
| | Indiana 219-531-5300 | | |
35-1645115 | THREE STAR PAINTING INC | MERRILLVILLE | $ 889,000.00 |R |
| | Indiana 219-947-3021 | | |
35-1841931 | VENUS PAINTING COMPANY | VALPARAISO | $ 636,349.40 |R |
| | Indiana 219-531-9364 | | |

35-2019240 | CENTRAL PAINTING INC | ST JOHN | $ 634,369.40 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 219-942-3623 | | | | DBE 3.00%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 44
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35733-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138220900ST4 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD-BRIDGE MAINTENANCE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 333,000.00
CALL: 760 ROUTE: 49 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 49 OVER I-94, 1.02 MILES SOUTH OF US 20

COUNTY: PORTER
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

32-0154474 | JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC | LAPORTE | $ 298,005.00 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 219-324-9393 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 45
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35738-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138213400ST5 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 223,000.00
CALL: 770 ROUTE: 11 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 11 OVER BUCK CREEK ROAD, 0.96 MILE NORTH OF SR 135,
AND ON WYANDOTTE CAVE RD OVER I-64, 4.13 MILES EAST OF SR 66
COUNTY: HARRISON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 266,181.50 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 241,770.52 |R |
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | |

35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 206,708.00 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | |
38-1164400 | RAM CONSTRUCTION SRVCS OF MICH | LIVONIA | S 234,898.50 |R |
| | Michigan 734-464-3800 | | |
38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 264,830.40 |R |

| | Indiana 317-284-1195 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 46
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35740-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138215800ST5 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 137,000.00
CALL: 780 ROUTE: 446 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 446 OVER LEATHERWOOD CREEK, 0.08 MILE EAST OF SR 58,
AND OVER LITTLE SALT CREEK, 2.55 MILES WEST OF SR 58
COUNTY: LAWRENCE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 186,108.42 |R |
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | |
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 173,164.90 |R |
| | Indiana 812-336-3438 | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 157,693.00 |R |
| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | |

38-1164400 | RAM CONSTRUCTION SRVCS OF MICH | LIVONIA | S 136,263.00 |R | X | AWARD
| | Michigan 734-464-3800 | | |
38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 174,224.93 |R |

| | Indiana 317-284-1195 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 47
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/27/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35742-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138222100ST6 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 463,000.00
CALL: 790 ROUTE: 41 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE VINCENNES DISTRICT

COUNTY: GIBSON GREENE LAWRENCE SULLIVAN
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 735,222.52 |R |

| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | |
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 612,059.10 |R | X | AWARD *

| | Indiana 812-336-3438 | | | | DBE 12.20%
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 671,315.86 |R |

| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | | |
38-1164400 | RAM CONSTRUCTION SRVCS OF MICH | LIVONIA | S 715,806.26 |R |

| | Michigan 734-464-3800 | | | |

*AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW BY DEPARTMENT’S ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION.

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT B -35743-A

CALL: 800

DES

FED/STATE PROJECT NO.
BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR
VARIOUS
ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE VINCENNES DISTRICT

CRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:

BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

1382235008T6,

VARIOUS

ADDRESS

138223200ST6

2015

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

PAGE: 48

| JEFFERSONVILLE
| Indiana

812-280-4404

| NEWBURGH
| Indiana

DATE: 03/17/15
9.00
$ 415,000.00
REMARKS
AWARD *
DBE 9.05%

LIVONIA
| Michigan

TYPE LOW
IR [
| | |
IR X |
| | |
IR I

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A)

- LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 49
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35749-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138227400ST6 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 196,000.00
CALL: 810 ROUTE: 37 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG SR 37, 1.12 MILES NORTH OF SR 237

COUNTY: PERRY

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM | s 142,800.00 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY | ANDERSON | $ 184,591.00 |R |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | |
35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC | SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 129,811.00 |R | | IRREGULAR *2
| | Indiana 765-533-5040 | | | |

*2 BIDDER FAILED TO SUBMIT A POWER OF ATTORNEY LETTER FOR PERFORMANCE BOND WITH BID. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A) (1).



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 50
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35763-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138230500ST1 DBE GOAL: 12.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 388,000.00
CALL: 820 ROUTE: 28 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 28 OVER WEA CREEK, ON SR 38W OVER NORFOLK AND SOUTHERN
RAILROAD AND ON SR 38E OVER NORFOLK AND SOUTHERN RR
COUNTY: TIPPECANOE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 440,324.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | | DBE 12.00%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 51
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/26/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35764-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138228600ST1 DBE GOAL: 7.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  486,000.00
CALL: 830 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
COUNTY: FOUNTAIN VERMILLION  WARREN
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE |'$ 674,422.10 [R | X | AWARD *
I | Indiana 812-280-4404 | I 1 DBE 10.59%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 52
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -35940-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100358 DBE GOAL: 12.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 786,000.00
CALL: 850 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 400S OVER CABIN CREEK, 0.74 MILES WEST OF CR 500W

COUNTY: RANDOLPH

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 969,318.55 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-788-6885 | | | | DBE 12.04%
36-2839689 | ILLINOIS CONSTRUCTORS CORP | ELBURN | $ 1,073,915.50 |R |
| | Illinois 630-232-7280 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 53
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -37267-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140058300ST3 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: CULVERT REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 73,000.00
CALL: 930 ROUTE: 74 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG I-74, 2.42 MILES EAST OF I-465

COUNTY: MARION

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 112,954.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-933-0205 | | |
35-2046222 | MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 169,064.00 |R |
| | Indiana 317-356-9250 | | |
35-2155873 | KINGS TRUCKING & EXCAVATION IN | SEYMOUR | $ 249,144.00 |R |
| | Indiana 812-522-6973 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 54
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT B -37958-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140139900ST6, 140141900ST1 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: REPAIR OR REPLACE JOINTS ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 197,000.00
CALL: 940 ROUTE: VARIOUS VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROUTES THROUGHOUT THE VINCENNES DISTRICT

COUNTY: DAVIESS OWEN POSEY CLAY
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 193,711.00 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 812-933-0205 | | |
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 297,530.52 |R |
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 196,806.00 |R |

| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE:
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE:

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

55
03/13/15

CONTRACT B -37962-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140142700ST5 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 119,000.00
CALL: 950 ROUTE: 462 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 462 OVER BLUE RIVER, ON US 50 OVER SMALLWOOD DITCH
AND ON SR 135 OVER KIPER CREEK
COUNTY: HARRISON JACKSON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 132,211.00 |R | X | AWARD *

| | Indiana 812-933-0205 | | |
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 245,961.05 |R |

| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 56
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

MBE GOAL: 7.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
CONTRACT M -35972-C FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1382607 WBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: PATCH AND REHAB PAVEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 307,000.00
CALL: 954 ROUTE: 64 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 64, FROM 1.79 MILES WEST OF I-69 TO 1.33 MILES WEST
OF I-69
COUNTY: GIBSON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0626844 | J H RUDOLPH & COMPANY | EVANSVILLE | $ 302,445.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-476-4921 | | | IMBE 7.48% WBE 6.21% IVBE 0.57%
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 437,456.00 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |

*AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN'S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 57
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

MBE GOAL: 0.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
CONTRACT M -37747-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1401097 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, HERBICIDE TREATMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 160,000.00
CALL: 958 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE FORT WAYNE DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1038926 | TOWNSEND CORPORATION | PARKER CITY | $ 136,651.08 |R |
| | Indiana 765-468-3007 | | |

35-1944148 | DALTONS INC | WARSAW | $ 136,032.54 |R [ X | AWARD

| | Indiana 574-267-7511 | | | | DBE 3.01%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 58
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

MBE GOAL: 0.00 IVBE GOAL: 3.00
CONTRACT M -38003-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1401653 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, MOWING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: S 259,000.00
CALL: 960 ROUTE : CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE CRAWFORDSVILLE
DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 224,045.00 |R |
| | Indiana 812-933-0205 | | |
35-2034028 | C & H MOWING INC | HEBRON | $ 196,805.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 219-996-7273 | | | | IVBE 0.00%
35-2045735 | J & M CONTRACTING INC | SHELBYVILLE | $ 243,766.00 |R |
| | Indiana 317-979-7805 | | | |
35-2154772 | COMPTONS MOWING SERVICE INC | STAR CITY | S 274,805.00 |R |
| | Indiana 574-595-7370 | | | |

*AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN'S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 59
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/17/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT T -33906-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006607 DBE GOAL: 9.00
DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 387,000.00
CALL: 964 ROUTE: 41 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 41 AT SR 114

COUNTY: NEWTON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GARY | $ 427,193.02 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 219-977-0722 | | | | DBE 9.00%
35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH | $ 445,970.35 |R |
| | Indiana 219-924-5900 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 60
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/13/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT T -34862-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173414 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: RAISED PAVEMENT MARKINGS, REFURBISHED ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 206,000.00
CALL: 970 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE GREENFIELD DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-1035771 | A & A SAFETY INC | AMELIA | $ 176,357.55 |R |
| | Ohio 513-943-6100 | | |

35-1983873 | M A S MARKERS INC | LEBANON | $ 173,548.01 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 317-769-7200 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 61
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 03/09/15
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

CONTRACT T -36320-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129753900LC3 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ITS COMMUNICATION SYSTEM ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 43,000.00
CALL: 974 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT
LOCATION: AT VARIOUS RAILROAD CROSSINGS THROUGHOUT THE CITY OF
ANDERSON
COUNTY: MADISON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-2046222 | MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 81,592.20 |R |
| | Indiana 317-356-9250 | | |
90-0690005 | TC ELECTRIC INC | FRANKLIN | $ 66,295.50 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-313-4768 | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT T -37083-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO.
SIGN MODERNIZATION

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF March 04,

138331000LC5

RIPLEY

ADDRESS

AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN BATESVILLE

2015

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

PAGE:
DATE:

259,000.00

REMARKS

62
03/09/15

AMELIA
Ohio

BATESVILLE
Indiana

LEBANON
Indiana

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

DESCRIPTION:
CALL: 984 ROUTE:
LOCATION:
COUNTY:
CODE BIDDER
31-1035771 | A & A SAFETY INC
I
35-1606893 | OLCO INC
I
35-1983873 | M A S MARKERS INC
|
35-2040834 | GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC
|
90-0690005 | TC ELECTRIC INC

FRANKLIN
Indiana



CONTRACT T

CALL: 990

-37134-A

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF March 04, 2015

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1383324

DESCRIPTION: ITS COMMUNICATION SYSTEM

ROUTE: 465

LOCATION: ON 1-465, FROM 1-69 TO 1-70

COUNTY: MARION
BIDDER

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

0.00
$

PAGE: 63
DATE: 03/26/15

1,320,000.00

REMARKS

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

| $ 1,395,345.70 |[R | X |
317-872-8125 | | 11

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

| $ 2,199,484.80 [R | |
317-876-3739 | I 11

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

| $ 1,503,855.50 [R | |
317-545-7641 | | 11

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE.





