

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 1  
 DATE: 12/03/14

CONTRACT IR-36375-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138249400ST3      DBE GOAL: 2.00  
 DESCRIPTION: NOISE ABATEMENT      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 15,600,000.00  
 CALL: 121      ROUTE: 65      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ALONG I-65 AT I-465, SOUTHSIDE

CODE	COUNTY: MARION BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II	CROWN POINT		\$ 16,768,046.97	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	219-661-2450				DBE 2.23%
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN		\$ 18,851,651.74	R		
		Indiana	317-835-2254				

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 2  
 DATE: 10/29/14

CONTRACT IR-36952-B      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138322000ST6  
 DESCRIPTION: DRAINAGE DITCH CORRECTION  
 CALL: 131      ROUTE: 69  
 LOCATION: ALONG I-69 FROM I-64 TO US 231

DBE GOAL: 8.00  
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,950,000.00  
 VINCENNES DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: DAVIESS BIDDER	GREENE ADDRESS	GIBSON PHONE	PIKE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1057095	BLANKENBERGER BROTHERS INC	CYNTHIANA Indiana	812-845-2717		\$ 1,986,955.00	R		
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190		\$ 1,423,955.00	R	X	AWARD DBE 8.13%
35-1801998	CLR INC	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-3438		\$ 1,848,032.50	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 3  
 DATE: 11/25/14

CONTRACT R -33561-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810116      DBE GOAL: 10.00  
 DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 413,000.00  
 CALL: 171      ROUTE: 327      FT. WAYNE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 327 OVER DIEHL DITCH, 0.29 MILE NORTH OF SR 8

CODE	COUNTY: DEKALB BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 293,199.15	R	X	AWARD DBE 10.03%
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 350,544.78	R		
35-2094565	3D COMPANY INC	MUNCIE Indiana	765-288-3326	\$ 327,450.65	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 4  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -34415-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1296279, 1006308      DBE GOAL: 6.00  
 DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 354,000.00  
 CALL: 181      ROUTE: 70      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ALONG I-70 AT 0.67 MILE EAST OF SR 59 AND 4.11 MILES EAST OF  
 SR 59  
 COUNTY: CLAY

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1004746	TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P	SALEM Indiana	812-883-6644	\$ 357,700.00	R		
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-933-0205	\$ 579,112.40	R		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 593,307.40	R		
35-2097364	INDIANA RELINE INC	SULPHUR SPRINGS Indiana	765-533-5040	\$ 310,773.00	R	X	AWARD DBE 56.57%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 5  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -34733-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129630700ST4  
 DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE PIPE LINING  
 CALL: 201      ROUTE: 31  
 LOCATION: ON US 31 0.03 MILE SOUTH OF SR 25

DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 131,000.00  
 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: FULTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1004746	TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P	SALEM Indiana	812-883-6644	\$ 66,300.00	R		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 76,682.00	R		
35-2097364	INDIANA RELINE INC	SULPHUR SPRINGS Indiana	765-533-5040	\$ 45,444.00	R	X	AWARD

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 6  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -34854-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173722      DBE GOAL: 4.00  
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,650,000.00  
 CALL: 211      ROUTE: 65      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON I-65 FROM 0.55 MILES NORTH OF I-465 TO 0.49 MILE SOUTH OF  
 SR 334

CODE	COUNTY: BOONE BIDDER	HENDRICKS ADDRESS	MARION PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS	317-634-5561	\$ 3,363,000.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON	765-643-5358	\$ 3,279,000.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1151771	CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC	WHITESTOWN	317-769-1900	\$ 3,639,000.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	INDIANAPOLIS	317-788-6885	\$ 3,273,658.00	R	X	AWARD * DBE 4.28%
		Indiana					

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 7  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -34855-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129632700ST3      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE PIPE LINING      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 82,100.00  
 CALL: 221      ROUTE: 1      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 1, 2.45 MILES SOUTH OF US 35

CODE	COUNTY: WAYNE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1004746	TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P	SALEM Indiana	812-883-6644	\$ 65,800.00	R		
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-933-0205	\$ 79,846.38	R		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 73,342.00	R		
35-2097364	INDIANA RELINE INC	SULPHUR SPRINGS Indiana	765-533-5040	\$ 39,241.50	R	X	AWARD

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 8  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -34856-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129633400ST3      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: CENTERLINE AND EDGE LINE RUMBLE STRIPES INSTALLATIO ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$      51,900.00  
 CALL: 231      ROUTE: 44      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 44 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

CODE	COUNTY: RUSH BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
25-1584843	SURFACE PREPARATION TECHNOLOGI	MECHANICSBURG		\$ 199,869.34	R		
		Pennsylvania	717-697-1450				
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	RICHMOND		\$ 187,493.30	R		
		Indiana	765-935-4231				
35-2040834	GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 95,767.79	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	317-541-2727				

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 9  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -34857-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129633700ST3      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: SIGHT DISTANCE IMPROVEMENT      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 115,000.00  
 CALL: 241      ROUTE:      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: VARIOUS (Obsolete) BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0821499	JAMES H DREW CORPORATION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-876-3739	\$ 124,375.80	R		
35-0965412	SHAMBAUGH & SON LP	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-487-7777	\$ 113,933.51	R	X	AWARD
35-2040834	GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-541-2727	\$ 123,765.25	R		
35-2046222	MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-356-9250	\$ 124,733.05	R		
90-0690005	TC ELECTRIC INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-313-4768	\$ 138,080.50	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 10  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -34859-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1296336      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT WITH NEW SIGNALS      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 481,000.00  
 CALL: 251      ROUTE:      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: VARIOUS (Obsolete) BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0821499	JAMES H DREW CORPORATION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-876-3739	\$ 634,136.65	R		
35-1262778	MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-545-7641	\$ 523,148.62	R	X	AWARD *
35-1710202	SIGNAL CONSTRUCTION INC	GREENFIELD Indiana	317-894-0120	\$ 566,062.00	R		
35-2046222	MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-356-9250	\$ 569,261.25	R		
90-0690005	TC ELECTRIC INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-313-4768	\$ 602,382.50	R		

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 11  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -37024-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138325300LC3      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: GUARDRAIL, MAINTENANCE OR REPAIR      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 252,000.00  
 CALL: 261      ROUTE:      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON BROOKS SCHOOL ROAD FROM FALL CREEK ROAD TO 116TH STREET

CODE	COUNTY: HAMILTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1643252	C-TECH CORPORATION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2745	\$ 306,852.50	R		
35-2110733	SPECIALTIES COMPANY LLC AND SU	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-594-0291	\$ 205,025.00	R	X	AWARD
38-2932367	RMD HOLDINGS LTD	CHESTERFIELD Michigan	586-749-6900	\$ 488,452.50	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 12A  
 DATE: 10/22/14

CONTRACT R -37075-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138334300ST3      DBE GOAL: 7.00  
 DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD ADDED TRAVEL LANES      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 41,100,000.00 (A ONLY)  
 CALL: 271      ROUTE: 65      \$ 41,790,300.00 (A + B)  
 LOCATION: ON I-65 AT I-465 SOUTH      GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: JOHNSON BIDDER	MARION ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 3,701,270.73			
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE						
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 2,941,967.67			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE						
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LL	CROWN POINT	219-661-2450	NO BID			
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE	IN					
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LL	CROWN POINT	219-661-2450	\$ 38,952,644.66			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE	IN					A + B =\$ 38,976,044.66
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS	317-634-5561	\$ 37,268,721.00			
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE	IN					A + B =\$ 37,268,721.00
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS	317-634-5561	NO BID			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE	IN					
35-1111003	WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC	CLINTON	765-832-8526	NO BID			
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE	IN					
35-1111003	WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC	CLINTON	765-832-8526	\$ 47,343,739.00			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE	IN					A + B =\$ 47,944,039.00
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON	765-643-5358	\$ 41,337,750.40			
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE	IN					A + B =\$ 41,872,350.40
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON	765-643-5358	\$ 41,122,067.93			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE	IN					A + B =\$ 41,656,667.93
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	INDIANAPOLIS	317-788-6885	\$ 35,816,694.00		X	AWARD DBE 7.40%
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE	IN					A + B =\$ 35,900,694.00
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	INDIANAPOLIS	317-788-6885	\$ 37,715,478.00			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE	IN					A + B =\$ 37,799,478.00

\*ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED FOR BID REVIEW BY PROJECT MANAGEMENT.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 12B  
 DATE: 10/22/14

CONTRACT R -37075-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138334300ST3      DBE GOAL: 7.00  
 DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD ADDED TRAVEL LANES      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ (A ONLY)  
 CALL: 271      ROUTE: 65      \$ 41,790,300.00 (A + B)  
 LOCATION: ON I-65 AT I-465 SOUTH      GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: JOHNSON BIDDER	MARION ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 3,701,270.73			
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE						
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 2,941,967.67			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE						
46-5342336	MILLSTONE WEBER LLC	ST CHARLES	636-949-0038	NO BID			
	SECTION 0001 HMA ALTERNATE	MO					
46-5342336	MILLSTONE WEBER LLC	ST CHARLES	636-949-0038	\$ 48,276,960.00			
	SECTION 0002 PCCP ALTERNATE	MO					A + B =\$ 48,807,960.00

NOTE: RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF THE ALTERNATE SECTION BIDS (A+B) AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

THE LOWEST RANKING  
 AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 (A) + TIME (B) + PVFM 0001  
 =\$ 35,816,694.00      +\$84,000.00 + \$ 3,701,270.73 = \$ 39,601,964.73

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 13  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT R -37889-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140009200ST3      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: DEMOLITION, REMOVE BUILDINGS, FOUNDATIONS      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 129,000.00  
 CALL: 311      ROUTE: 27      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ALONG US 27 FROM SOUTH O STREET TO 0.16 MILES NORTH OF  
 SR 227 AT SIM HODGIN PARKWAY  
 COUNTY: WAYNE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
20-2107424	RENASCENT INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-783-1500	\$ 134,903.08	R		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 128,725.00	R	X	AWARD

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 14  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT RS-31291-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710362      DBE GOAL: 10.00  
 DESCRIPTION: PCCP CLEANING AND SEALING JOINTS      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 3,470,000.00  
 CALL: 331      ROUTE: 36      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON US 36 FROM 0.96 MILE EAST OF SR 39 TO 0.09 MILES WEST OF  
 SR 267  
 COUNTY: HENDRICKS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 3,125,475.00	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana	317-634-5561				DBE 10.00%
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON		\$ 3,553,400.00	R		
		Indiana	765-643-5358				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 15  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT RS-34754-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900181  
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE  
 CALL: 341      ROUTE: 39  
 LOCATION: ON SR 39 FROM 2.85 MILES NORTH OF US 40 TO US 36

DBE GOAL: 8.00  
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,030,000.00  
 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: HENDRICKS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS	317-634-5561	\$ 1,520,500.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON	765-643-5358	\$ 1,768,500.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1151771	CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC	WHITESTOWN	317-769-1900	\$ 1,077,000.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	INDIANAPOLIS	317-788-6885	\$ 935,208.59	R	X	AWARD DBE 8.55%
		Indiana					

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 16  
 DATE: 11/25/14

CONTRACT RS-37011-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 138325100ST2      DBE GOAL: 12.00  
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 432,000.00  
 CALL: 351      ROUTE: 37      FT. WAYNE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 37 FROM 0.1 MILES WEST OF I-469 TO 1.13 MILES EAST OF  
 I-469  
 COUNTY: ALLEN

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 417,240.12	R	X	AWARD DBE 12.01%
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 438,934.84	R		
62-1492793	API CONSTRUCTION CORP	LAOTTO Indiana	260-897-2743	\$ 450,876.62	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 17  
 DATE: 11/18/14

CONTRACT RS-37043-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1383393  
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE  
 CALL: 361      ROUTE: 124  
 LOCATION: ON SR 124 FROM US 27 TO 0.98 MILE EAST OF US 27

DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 379,000.00  
 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: ADAMS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 447,534.68	R		
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 366,019.47	R	X	AWARD
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	RICHMOND Indiana	765-935-4231	\$ 560,387.90	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 18  
 DATE: 11/06/14

CONTRACT B -28735-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100753      DBE GOAL: 12.00  
 DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT AND REPLACE SUPERSTRUCTURE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 4,010,000.00  
 CALL: 401      ROUTE: 3      SEYMOUR DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 3 FROM POPLAR STREET TO HENRY STREET AND OVER CSX  
 RAILROAD, 0.30 MILES NORTH OF US 50  
 COUNTY: JENNINGS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON		\$ 3,944,700.00	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana	812-346-4135				DBE 12.67%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS		\$ 5,041,183.35	R		
		Indiana	812-579-5248				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 19  
 DATE: 11/06/14

CONTRACT B -29080-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0401103      DBE GOAL: 11.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 656,000.00  
 CALL: 421      ROUTE: 25      FT. WAYNE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 25 OVER WALNUT CREEK, 0.62 MILE WEST OF SR 15 AND ON  
 SR 19 OVER RIDENOUR DITCH, 0.34 MILE NORTH OF US 30  
 COUNTY: KOSCIUSKO

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
32-0154474	JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC	LAPORTE Indiana	219-324-9393	\$ 873,519.81	R		
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY Indiana	260-625-3443	\$ 840,738.33	R		
35-1339168	LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I	LAPORTE Indiana	219-393-5555	\$ 1,265,707.42	R		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 781,651.37	R	X	AWARD * DBE 11.13%

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 20  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -30968-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0300980      DBE GOAL: 2.00  
 DESCRIPTION: COVERED BRIDGE REHABILITATION      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,030,000.00  
 CALL: 431      ROUTE:      SEYMOUR DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ALONG CR 200N OVER THE EAST FORK OF THE WHITE RIVER,  
 0.9 MILES NORTH OF US 50  
 COUNTY: JACKSON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 1,036,287.30	R	X	AWARD * DBE 2.09%
35-1801998	CLR INC	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-3438	\$ 1,182,465.60	R		

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 21  
 DATE: 10/29/14

CONTRACT B -31569-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800840      DBE GOAL: 7.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION OR REPAIR      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW  
 CALL: 461      ROUTE: 32      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 32 OVER GRAHAM CREEK, 6.47 MILES EAST OF SR 63

CODE	COUNTY: FOUNTAIN BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND		\$ 751,956.36	C	X	REJECT *
		Indiana	219-474-6542				

\*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE READVERTISED.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 22  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -33559-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0300973      DBE GOAL: 9.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 436,000.00  
 CALL: 471      ROUTE: 105      FT. WAYNE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 105 OVER LOGAN CREEK 0.93 MILE NORTH OF SR 124

CODE	COUNTY: HUNTINGTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 432,968.00	R	X	AWARD DBE 9.01%
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 494,854.14	R		
35-2094565	3D COMPANY INC	MUNCIE Indiana	765-288-3326	\$ 448,144.28	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 23  
 DATE: 11/25/14

CONTRACT B -33589-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901184      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 149,000.00  
 CALL: 481      ROUTE: 8      FT. WAYNE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 8 OVER CEDAR CREEK, 1.56 MILES EAST OF I-69

CODE	COUNTY: DEKALB BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY		\$ 218,201.50	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	260-625-3443				

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 24  
 DATE: 11/25/14

CONTRACT B -33590-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901187      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 245,000.00  
 CALL: 491      ROUTE: 327      FT. WAYNE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 327 OVER PIGEON CREEK, 0.46 MILE NORTH OF US 20

CODE	COUNTY: STEUBEN BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY		\$ 268,533.95	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	260-625-3443				

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 25  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -33619-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710467      DBE GOAL: 6.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 579,000.00  
 CALL: 500      ROUTE: SR 42      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 42 OVER MILL CREEK, 3.47 MILES EAST OF US 231

CODE	COUNTY: PUTNAM BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 629,743.45	R		
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 582,106.70	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 618,366.33	R		
35-1801998	CLR INC	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-3438	\$ 517,646.38	R	X	AWARD DBE 7.45%
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 662,197.00	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 26  
 DATE: 11/06/14

CONTRACT B -33761-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710477      DBE GOAL: 12.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 779,000.00  
 CALL: 501      ROUTE: 38      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 38 OVER MCCLAMROCK DITCH AND ON SR 26 OVER  
 WILDCAT CREEK OVERFLOW  
 COUNTY: CLINTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	LAFAYETTE	765-447-2324	\$ 1,087,073.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND	219-474-6542	\$ 827,663.68	C		REJECT *
		Indiana					
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE	812-280-4404	\$ 940,399.02	R		
		Indiana					
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS	317-284-1195	\$ 909,207.62	R	X	AWARD ** DBE 11.23% ***
		Indiana					

\*BIDDER WAS AWARDED ITS REGULAR BID IN THE BRIDGE GROUP. CONDITIONAL BID VOID, PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-10 (B).

\*\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

\*\*\*AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW BY DEPARTMENT'S ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 27  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -33830-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006231      DBE GOAL: 9.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,973,000.00  
 CALL: 511      ROUTE: SR 156      SEYMOUR DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 156 OVER GRANT'S CREEK 1.4 MILES WEST OF SR 56

CODE	COUNTY: SWITZERLAND BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
31-1323837	SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	WEST CHESTER		\$ 1,823,650.89	R		
		Ohio	513-326-6000				
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON		\$ 2,040,450.00	R		
		Indiana	765-643-5358				
35-1549010	MCALISTER EXCAVATING CO INC	PATRIOT		\$ 1,771,369.20	R	X	AWARD
		Indiana	812-594-2402				DBE 13.39%

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 28  
 DATE: 11/25/14

CONTRACT B -34160-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173143  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT  
 CALL: 531      ROUTE:  
 LOCATION: ON CR 200W OVER BRUSH CREEK

DBE GOAL: 6.00  
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 565,000.00  
 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: CLINTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	LAFAYETTE Indiana	765-447-2324	\$ 998,434.00	R		
35-1151771	CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC	WHITESTOWN Indiana	317-769-1900	\$ 767,000.00	R		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-334-0758	\$ 958,579.60	R		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	LAFAYETTE Indiana	765-772-7500	\$ 771,143.50	R		
35-2094565	3D COMPANY INC	MUNCIE Indiana	765-288-3326	\$ 728,337.30	R	X	AWARD * DBE 6.01%
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 757,502.35	R		

\*AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW BY DEPARTMENT'S ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION.

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 29  
 DATE: 11/06/14

CONTRACT B -34305-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 100618      DBE GOAL: 11.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 398,000.00  
 CALL: 541      ROUTE: 13      FT. WAYNE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 13 OVER GRASSY CREEK, 4.72 MILES NORTH OF US 30

CODE	COUNTY: KOSCIUSKO BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
32-0154474	JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC	LAPORTE Indiana	219-324-9393	\$ 569,003.65	R		
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY Indiana	260-625-3443	\$ 495,367.88	R		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 480,746.07	R	X	AWARD * DBE 11.05%

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 30  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -34393-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400302      DBE GOAL: 7.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 373,000.00  
 CALL: 551      ROUTE: 32      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 32 OVER LITTLE EAGLE CREEK, 3.32 MILES WEST OF US 31

CODE	COUNTY: HAMILTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-634-5561	\$ 569,142.92	R		
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 467,038.70	R	X	AWARD * DBE 9.03%
35-1609544	SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-484-1500	\$ 559,651.28	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 552,996.05	R		
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 499,788.00	R		

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 31  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -34634-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173832      DBE GOAL: 7.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,140,000.00  
 CALL: 561      ROUTE: 50      VINCENNES DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON US 50 OVER SPIDER CREEK 0.81 MILES WEST OF SR 37  
 AND ON SR 37 OVER GULLETS CREEK 2.57 MILES NORTH OF SR 54  
 COUNTY: LAWRENCE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 2,265,500.00	R		
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 2,113,594.30	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 2,105,310.39	R	X	AWARD DBE 7.08%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 33  
 DATE: 11/18/14

CONTRACT B -34986-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006283      DBE GOAL: 12.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 659,000.00  
 CALL: 581      ROUTE: 41      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON US 41 OVER GOOSE CREEK, 0.64 MILE SOUTH OF SR 352

CODE	COUNTY: BENTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND		\$ 684,176.38	R	X	AWARD *
		Indiana	219-474-6542				DBE 15.18%
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 776,983.00	R		
		Indiana	317-284-1195				

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 34  
 DATE: 10/29/14

CONTRACT B -35277-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173883      DBE GOAL: 14.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 419,000.00  
 CALL: 591      ROUTE: 32      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 32 OVER THRELDKELD DITCH, 2.59 MILES WEST OF SR 75

CODE	COUNTY: BOONE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 607,066.59	R		
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND Indiana	219-474-6542	\$ 505,191.43	C		REJECT *
35-1609544	SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-484-1500	\$ 623,080.23	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 595,725.83	R	X	AWARD ** DBE 14.23%
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 610,955.65	R		

\*BIDDER WAS AWARDED ITS REGULAR BID IN THE BRIDGE GROUP. CONDITIONAL BID VOID, PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-10(B).

\*\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 35  
 DATE: 10/29/14

CONTRACT B -35279-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173899      DBE GOAL: 11.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 421,000.00  
 CALL: 601      ROUTE: 38      CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON SR 38 OVER WILSON DITCH 1.0 MILE SOUTHEAST OF US 52

CODE	COUNTY: TIPPECANOE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	LAFAYETTE	765-447-2324	\$ 550,110.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND	219-474-6542	\$ 520,710.80	R	X	AWARD * DBE 13.36%
		Indiana					
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS	317-284-1195	\$ 546,430.97	R		
		Indiana					

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 36  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -35462-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173878      DBE GOAL: 6.00  
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 485,000.00  
 CALL: 621      ROUTE: 865      GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: ON I-865 OVER I-65, 0.54 MILE EAST OF I-65

CODE	COUNTY: BOONE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	INDIANAPOLIS	317-634-5561	\$ 843,474.08	R		
		Indiana					
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN	317-736-6024	\$ 754,008.00	R		
		Indiana					
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE	812-280-4404	\$ 674,441.56	R	X	AWARD * DBE 6.95%
		Indiana					
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS	317-284-1195	\$ 720,444.49	R		
		Indiana					

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 37  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT B -35714-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600082

DBE GOAL: 11.00

DESCRIPTION: CHANNEL REALIGN AND RESHAPE

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 972,000.00

CALL: 631

ROUTE: 94

LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG I-94 AT WILLOW CREEK, 0.9 MILES EAST OF I-90

COUNTY: PORTER  
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1035114	SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY Indiana	219-886-3728	\$ 1,822,536.36	R		
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY Indiana	219-887-5233	\$ 1,547,500.00	R		
35-1068009	DYER CONSTRUCTION CO	DYER Indiana	219-865-2961	\$ 2,493,670.64	R		
35-1569222	GRIMMER CONSTRUCTION INC	HIGHLAND Indiana	219-924-1623	\$ 1,359,311.20	R	X	AWARD * DBE 11.01%
35-1677832	L G S PLUMBING INC	CROWN POINT Indiana	219-663-2177	\$ 1,575,207.48	R		

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 38  
 DATE: 11/18/14

CONTRACT B -37017-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1383295  
 DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD - BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY  
 CALL: 671      ROUTE: 74  
 LOCATION: ON CR 275E OVER I-74, 3.67 MILES EAST OF SR 39

MBE GOAL: 7.00      IVBE GOAL: 3.00  
 WBE GOAL: 5.00  
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 655,000.00  
 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: HENDRICKS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 790,812.80	R		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 799,605.00	R		
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 711,025.00	R	X	AWARD * MBE 0.89% WBE 17.52% IVBE 0.0%

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

\*AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN'S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 40  
 DATE: 12/03/14

CONTRACT M -31272-B      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800703      MBE GOAL: 7.00      IVBE GOAL: 3.00  
 CALL: 689      DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, TREE REMOVAL AND TRIMMING      WBE GOAL: 5.00  
 ROUTE:      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 170,000.00  
 LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE GREENFIELD DISTRICT  
 COUNTY: VARIOUS      GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-933-0205	\$ 169,568.00	R		REJECT *1
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$ 375,704.00	R		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE COMPANY	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 177,854.00	R	X	AWARD *2 MBE 7.39% WBE 7.70% IVBE 0.00%
61-1103168	SWARTZ MOWING INC	OLYMPIA Kentucky	606-674-2971	\$ 124,554.00	R		REJECT *1

\*1 BIDDER FAILED TO MEET M/WBE GOALS OR PASS IDOA GOOD FAITH EFFORT REVIEW. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(C).

\*2 AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN'S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.

\*2 AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

\*2 IVBE GOAL ATTAINMENT IS MONITORED BUT DOES NOT REQUIRE REVIEW OR APPROVAL. CONTRACTORS ARE ENCOURAGED TO SUBCONTRACT WITH IVBE WHEN POSSIBLE.









INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 45  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT T -34250-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800453  
 DESCRIPTION: ITS TRAFFIC MANAGEMENT SYSTEMS  
 CALL: 761      ROUTE: 94  
 LOCATION: ON I-94, I-65 AND SR 912

DBE GOAL: 4.00  
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW  
 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: LAKE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PORTER PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1262778	MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC	EAST CHICAGO		\$ 6,076,512.69	R		REJECTED *
		Indiana	219-397-4444				
36-3097857	L & H COMPANY INC	OAKBROOK		\$ 6,144,930.91	R		REJECTED *
		Illinois	630-571-7200				

\*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - ALL BIDS REJECTED; TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 46  
 DATE: 11/18/14

CONTRACT T -34711-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1296296      DBE GOAL: 1.00  
 DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODERNIZATION      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 917,000.00  
 CALL: 781      ROUTE:      LAPORTE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: AT VARIOUS INTERSECTIONS THROUGHOUT THE LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: VARIOUS (Obsolete) BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0965412	SHAMBAUGH & SON LP	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-487-7777	\$ 1,114,063.80	R		
35-1262778	MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC	EAST CHICAGO Indiana	219-397-4444	\$ 1,068,963.56	R		
35-1657131	MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC	PLYMOUTH Indiana	574-936-8613	\$ 928,512.23	R	X	AWARD * DBE 1.51%
62-1339540	HAWK ENTERPRISES INC	CROWN POINT Indiana	219-662-8090	\$ 942,722.30	R		

\*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 47  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT T -34712-A      FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129629700ST4      DBE GOAL: 0.00  
 DESCRIPTION: SIGHT DISTANCE IMPROVEMENT      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 183,000.00  
 CALL: 791      ROUTE:      LAPORTE DISTRICT  
 LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: VARIOUS (Obsolete) BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0965412	SHAMBAUGH & SON LP	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-487-7777	\$ 197,658.10	R		
35-1262778	MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC	EAST CHICAGO Indiana	219-397-4444	\$ 191,384.54	R		
35-1657131	MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC	PLYMOUTH Indiana	574-936-8613	\$ 169,377.60	R	X	AWARD
62-1339540	HAWK ENTERPRISES INC	CROWN POINT Indiana	219-662-8090	\$ 223,306.16	R		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
 FOR THE LETTING OF October 08, 2014

PAGE: 48  
 DATE: 10/17/14

CONTRACT T -37266-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 140058200ST5

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: RAISED PAVEMENT MARKINGS, REFURBISHED

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 115,000.00

CALL: 801

ROUTE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE SEYMOUR DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS (Obsolete)

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
31-1035771	A & A SAFETY INC	AMELIA Ohio	513-943-6100	\$ 121,360.40	R		
31-1657131	W L MARKERS INC	COLUMBUS Ohio	614-279-2544	\$ 126,971.00	R		
35-1983873	M A S MARKERS INC	LEBANON Indiana	317-769-7200	\$ 109,978.75	R	X	AWARD