INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 01/26/15
FOR THE LETTING OF December 17, 2014

CONTRACT IR-30187-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500194 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 3,256,000.00
CALL: 121 ROUTE: 61 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 61 FROM SR 62 TO 0.797 MILE NORTH OF SR 62

COUNTY: WARRICK

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
05-0558668 | WEDDLE BROTHERS HIGHWAY GROUP | BLOOMINGTON | $ 3,064,810.01 |R |
| | Indiana 812-339-9500 | [ [
20-1237324 | KERNS EXCAVATING LLC | BICKNELL | $ 2,659,969.00 |R |
| | Indiana 812-291-5156 | | |
35-1057095 | BLANKENBERGER BROTHERS INC | CYNTHIANA | S 2,266,474.70 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 812-845-2717 | | | DBE 6.01%
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 2,496,278.85 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | I
35-1582525 | JERRY AIGNER CONSTRUCTION | BOONVILLE | S 2,588,474.33 |R |
| | Indiana 812-897-5815 | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | S 2,782,024.70 |R |

| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | |
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 01/30/15
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CONTRACT R -30314-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400603 DBE GOAL: 9.00
DESCRIPTION: PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT AND BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: §$ 27,290,000.00
CALL: 161 ROUTE: 469 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON I-469 FROM 0.57 MILE WEST OF WINCHESTER ROAD TO 0.85 MILE
EAST OF US 27
COUNTY: ALLEN

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 24,760,302.48 |R |
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | |

99-9996275 | PRIMCO INC/E & B PAVING INC/JV | FORT WAYNE | $ 24,437,481.98 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 260-478-1548 | | | | DBE 9.01%
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DATE: 01/05/15

DBE GOAL: 10.00
$ 83,950,000.00

CONTRACT R -37115-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1383339

DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD, BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY AND ADDED TRAVEL ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 391 ROUTE: 65 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON 1-65 FROM 0.50 MILE SOUTH OF SR 38 TO 0.87 MILE NORTH OF
SR 25
COUNTY: TIPPECANOE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW REMARKS

| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | $6,999,914.25 | 11

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA I I 11

| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | $ 5,674,308.90 | 11

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | | 1
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY Il LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | NO BID | 11

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN | | 11
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 11 LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $82,813,411.30 | 11 AWARD

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN I | 1 DBE 10.04%
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS 317-634-5561 | $83,683,181.33 | 11

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN I I 1
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS 317-634-5561 | NO BID | 11

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN | | 11
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON 765-643-5358 | NO BID | 11

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN | | 11
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON 765-643-5358 | $91,365,946.94 | 11

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN | I 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $84,491,000.00 | 11

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA | IN | | 1
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $94,475,058.00 | 11

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP | IN | | 11
46-5342336 | MILLSTONE WEBER LLC ST CHARLES  636-949-0038 NO BID 11

| SECTION 0001 DESIGN/BUILD HMA MO 1
46-5342336 | MILLSTONE WEBER LLC ST CHARLES  636-949-0038 $90,948,358.00 11

| SECTION 0002 DESIGN/BUILD PCCP MO 11

NOTE: RANKING

OF THE BIDS 1S DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF THE ALTERNATE SECTION BIDS AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

THE LOWEST RANKING

AMOUNT CALCULATED =

SECTION 0002  +

PVFM 0002
$82,813,411.30 + $ 5,674,308.90 = $88,487,720.20
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DBE GOAL: 7.00

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 5,150,000.00
CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

US 231 AND ON
CR 1100 OVER I-65

AMOUNT OF BID

4
01/16/15

CONTRACT RS-34753-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005685
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE AND BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY
CALL: 421 ROUTE: 65
LOCATION: ON I-65 FROM US 231 TO 4.35 MILES NORTH OF
I-65 OVER US 231, ON CR 1800 OVER I-65, ON
COUNTY: JASPER WHITE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN
| | Indiana 574-875-5183
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | INDIANAPOLIS

| Indiana 317-788-6885

TYPE LOW REMARKS

IR X AWARD

| | | DBE 7.00%
IR [
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CONTRACT B -31562-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800904, 0800905 DBE GOAL: 12.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 668,000.00
CALL: 621 ROUTE: 63 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 63 OVER FALL CREEK 0.97 MILE NORTH OF SR 263

COUNTY: WARREN

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 987,575.11 |R [ X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | | | DBE 12.23%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.
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CONTRACT B -34548-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173614 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: § 868,000.00
CALL: 641 ROUTE: 31 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 31 OVER STUCKER DITCH AND CONRAIL RAILROAD, 1.9 MILES
NORTH OF SR 56
COUNTY: SCOTT

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 895,500.00 |R |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | |
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 886,833.34 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | | | DBE 6.08%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 01/05/15
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CONTRACT B -34830-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173799 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  692,000.00
CALL: 671 ROUTE: 358 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 358 OVER WHITE RIVER, 1.18 MILES EAST OF SR 67
COUNTY: DAVIESS KNOX
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 752,170.00 |R | X1 AWARD *
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | | | DBE 8.08%
35-1801998 | CLR INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 782,857.62 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 812-336-3438 | | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 753,843.18 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 02/20/15
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CONTRACT B -35280-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173900 DBE GOAL: 12.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $ 446,000.00
CALL: 691 ROUTE: 41 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 41 OVER EAST FORK OF COAL CREEK 0.52 MILE SOUTH OF
UsS 136
COUNTY: FOUNTAIN
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1609544 | SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO | INDIANAPOLIS | S 712,147.78 |R |

| | Indiana 317-484-1500 | | |
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | S 663,421.64 |R | X | AWARD *1

| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | | | DBE 12.76%
38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | S 632,330.38 |R | | REJECT *2

| | Indiana 317-284-1195 | | | |
*1 AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1) (A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.

*2 BIDDER FAILED TO MEET DBE GOAL OR PASS GOOD FAITH EFFORT REVIEW. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(C) (11).
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IVBE GOAL: 3.00

NONE BELOW

REMARKS

MBE GOAL:

CONTRACT B -37057-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1383306, 1383531 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD - SUBSTRUCTURE REPAIR AND BRIDGE DECK ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 801 ROUTE: 31 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 31 OVER 1-65, ON SR 258 OVER LITTLE SALT CREEK, AND
ON 1-65 OVER DENOIS CREEK
COUNTY: BARTHOLOMEW JACKSON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 3,734,368.00 [R | |
| Indiana 317-284-1195 | I 11

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE READVERTISED.
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