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CONTRACT IR-33734-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500446                                         DBE GOAL:  9.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION                               ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  33,630,000.00 
CALL: 161                 ROUTE: 69                                                  VINCENNES DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON PR 69 NEAR CRANE NAVAL CENTER TO 4.1 MILES NORTH OF 
                                 US 231 
                         COUNTY: GREENE 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID   TYPE   LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $  2,253,099.45 |    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 |                             |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $  1,581,122.98 |    |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                |                             |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS       |                             | $         10.00 |    |  X  |   AWARD * 
            |                                         |                             |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-0907180  | E S WAGNER COMPANY                      | OREGON        419-691-8651  | $ 28,440,704.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | OH                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-0907180  | E S WAGNER COMPANY                      | OREGON        419-691-8651  | $ 27,510,723.86 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | OH                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-0907180  | E S WAGNER COMPANY                      | OREGON        419-691-8651  | $    455,333.24 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | OH                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC                     | BLOOMINGTON   812-336-4452  |          NO BID |    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC                     | BLOOMINGTON   812-336-4452  | $ 26,798,700.00 |  R |  X  |    AWARD * 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |    |     |    DBE 9.01% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC                     | BLOOMINGTON   812-336-4452  | $     84,840.00 |  R |  X  |    AWARD * 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | COLUMBUS      800-579-6703  | $ 27,600,000.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | COLUMBUS      800-579-6703  | $ 27,262,000.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | COLUMBUS      800-579-6703  | $     83,280.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
NOTE: THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT WORTH COST, AND THE  
COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003).  A CONTRACT TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002, SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 WERE FIXED 
AT $ 10.00 BY INDOT FOR THIS CONTRACT.)  AWARDED CONTRACT AMOUNT IS $ 26,883,550.00. 
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35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC      | CLARKSVILLE   812-282-1349  |          NO BID |    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC      | CLARKSVILLE   812-282-1349  | $ 30,370,000.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC      | CLARKSVILLE   812-282-1349  | $     99,990.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  |          NO BID |    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  | $ 27,526,803.23 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | CROWN POINT   219-661-2450  | $    104,400.24 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                          | MARYLAND HEIGHTS 314-344-00 |          NO BID |    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | MO                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                          | MARYLAND HEIGHTS 314-344-00 | $ 31,250,000.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | MO                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                          | MARYLAND HEIGHTS 314-344-00 | $    174,100.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | MO                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992853  | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTR/F H PASCHEN J/V    | JOLIET        815-726-7722  |          NO BID |    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IL                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992853  | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTR/F H PASCHEN J/V    | JOLIET        815-726-7722  | $ 30,235,000.00 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IL                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992853  | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTR/F H PASCHEN J/V    | JOLIET        815-726-7722  | $     97,225.36 |  R |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IL                          |                 |    |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
NOTE: THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT WORTH COST, AND THE  
COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003).  A CONTRACT TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002, SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 WERE FIXED 
AT $ 10.00 BY INDOT FOR THIS CONTRACT.)  AWARDED CONTRACT AMOUNT IS $ 26,883,550.00. 
 


