CONTRACT IR-30695-A

CALL: 131

DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:
BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0201302, 090230

ADDED TRAVEL LANES W/NEW SIGNALS

Uus 421

OF SR 2
LAPORTE

ADDRESS

GOSHEN
Indiana

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT
ON US 421 FROM SOUTH JUNCTION OF SR 2 TO NORTH JUNCTION

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

4.00
$

PAGE: 1
DATE: 05/17/11

6,274,000.00

REMARKS

AWARD
DBE 4.02%

| PHEND & BROWN INC

MILFORD
Indiana

| WOODRUFF & SONS INC

MICHIGAN CITY
Indiana

DYER
Indiana

| WALSH & KELLY INC

GRIFFITH
Indiana

| HOFFMAN BROTHERS IN

C

BATTLE CREEK
Michigan

*FAILED TO SUBMIT A VERIFIABLE BID BOND WITH THE BID.

BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO

105 1AC 11-3-16(A)(1).



CONTRACT IR-30845-A

CALL: 141

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715016

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

ROUTE: 25
LOCATION:

0.15 MILE EAST OF US 421

COUNTY:
BIDDER

CARROLL

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

ON SR 25 FROM 1.42 MILE EAST OF TIPP/CARROLL CO LINE TO

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE: 2A
DATE: 05/17/11

6.00
$ 20,900,000.00

REMARKS

PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN-

TENANCE SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION |

PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN-

TENANCE SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION]

SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE

ITEMS

RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION
SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION

IN

RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION
SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION

RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION
SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS

PHEND & BROWN INC
SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION

IN

PHEND & BROWN INC
SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION

IN

PHEND & BROWN INC
SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS

CRIDER & CRIDER INC
SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION

CRIDER & CRIDER INC
SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION

INDIANAPOLIS
IN

| CRIDER & CRIDER INC

SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS

INDIANAPOLIS
IN



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2B
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30845-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715016 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 20,900,000.00

CALL: 141 ROUTE: 25 LAPORTE DISTRICT

CONTINUED LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 1.42 MILE EAST OF TIPP/CARROLL CO LINE TO

0.15 MILE EAST OF US 421
COUNTY: CARROLL

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 8,602,557.52 |R | | AWARD PENDING *
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 9,295,246.95 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 8,430,690.72 |[R | | AWARD PENDING *
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I | 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | NO BID | 1
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | I 1
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 9,091,421.19 [R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 9,463,468.97 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 1
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | 1L | | 11
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | $ 10,663,231.36 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | 1L I I 1
36-3543170 | T J LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION | JOLIET 815-726-7722 | $ 9,058,174.75 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 7,755,707.91 |[R | |
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | M | | 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 8,420,023.99 |[R | |
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | M | | 1
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 11,216,259.18 |[R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 11

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDDERS 1S DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE
PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002,
SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 ARE FIXED BY INDOT FOR ALL BIDDERS.)

*ADDITIONAL TIME 1S REQUIRED TO SECURE FHWA AWARD CONCURRENCE. TOTAL OF LOW BID IS $ 17,033,268.24.



CONTRACT IR-30850-A

CALL: 145

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500620, 0401299
NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

DESCRIPTION:

ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:

BIDDER

25

ON SR 25 FROM 0.11 MILE EAST OF CR 100W TO

CR 500S
CARROLL

ADDRESS

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

DBE GOAL:

ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
LAPORTE DISTRICT

.16 MILE EAST OF

PAGE: 3
DATE: 05/17/11

5.00
$ 26,200,000.00

REMARKS

GOSHEN
Indiana

PHEND & BROWN INC

MILFORD
Indiana

CRIDER & CRIDER

INC

BLOOMINGTON
Indiana

COLUMBUS
Indiana

CROWN POINT
Indiana

JOLIET
Illinois

* ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED TO SECURE FHWA AWARD CONCURRENCE.



CONTRACT IR-33042-A

CALL: 161

DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE: 69
LOCATION:

COUNTY:
BIDDER

PIKE

FED/STATE PROJECT NO.
NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

ON PR 69 FROM SR 61 TO CR 650

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

PAGE: 4A
DATE: 05/17/11

3.00
$ 22,838,900.00

REMARKS

PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN-
TENANCE SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION
PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAIN-
TENANCE SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION

SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE

ITEMS

KOLB GRADING LLC
SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION

MO

KOLB GRADING LLC
SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION

MO

KOLB GRADING LLC
SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS

E S WAGNER COMPANY
SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION

OH

E S WAGNER COMPANY
SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION

OH

E S WAGNER COMPANY
SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS

LUTGRING BROTHERS INC
SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION

LUTGRING BROTHERS INC
SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION

TELL CITY
IN

LUTGRING BROTHERS INC
SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS

TELL CITY
IN



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 4B
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT 1R-33042-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 22,838,900.00
CALL: 161 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT
CONTINUED LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM SR 61 TO CR 650
COUNTY: PIKE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON 812-336-4452 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 1
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON 812-336-4452 | $ 8,546,103.65 | 11
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON 812-336-4452 | $ 12,875,383.97 | 11
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | I 11
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH 812-853-9558 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH 812-853-9558 | $ 7,741,719.88 | 11
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH 812-853-9558 | $ 12,804,034.10 | 11
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 11
35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC| CLARKSVILLE 812-282-1349 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION | IN I I | I
35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC| CLARKSVILLE 812-282-1349 | $ 7,874,984.92 | | X1 AWARD PENDING *
| SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 1
35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC| CLARKSVILLE 812-282-1349 | $ 12,098,505.08 | | X | AWARD PENDING *
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | I 1

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE
PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002,
SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 ARE FIXED BY INDOT FOR ALL BIDDERS.)

*ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED TO SECURE FHWA AWARD CONCURRENCE. TOTAL OF LOW BID IS $ 19,973,510.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

PAGE: 5
DATE: 05/17/11

CONTRACT R -27156-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0194025 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 11,696,000.00
CALL: 201 ROUTE: 41 LAPORTE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 41 FROM NORTH OF RIDGE ROAD TO LITTLE CALUMET
RIVER
COUNTY: LAKE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 10,411,882.36 |R | X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | | DBE 6.05%
35-1035114 | SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO | GARY | $ 10,592,283.65 [R | |
| | Indiana 219-886-3728 | | | |
35-1068009 | DYER CONSTRUCTION CO | DYER | $ 11,137,760.35 [R | |
| | Indiana 219-865-2961 | | | |
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT | $ 10,593,823.22 |R | |
| | Indiana 219-661-2450 | | | |
36-2364802 | HASSE CONSTRUCTION CO INC | CALUMET CITY | $ 11,977,000.00 [R | |

| Illinois 708-862-2450 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 6
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -29177-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9989036 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,965,000.00
CALL: 221 ROUTE: ST 1001 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SALISBURY ROAD FROM 200 FEET NORTH OF INDUSTRIES ROAD
TO 1000 FEET NORTH OF NORTHWEST L STREET
COUNTY: WAYNE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-1323837 | SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | WEST CHESTER | $ 2,425,784.26 |R | |
| | Ohio 513-326-6000 | | | |
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 2,394,631.23 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | | |
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 2,471,439.64 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 1,898,640.00 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | | DBE 5.16%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 7
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -29262-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600727, 1005490 DBE GOAL: 7.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 656,000.00
CALL: 231 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON DOUGHTY ROAD CONNECTOR FROM US 50 TO DOUGHTY ROAD

COUNTY: DEARBORN

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-1323837 | SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | WEST CHESTER |'$ 731,806.57 [R | |
I | Ohio 513-326-6000 | | 11
35-0844079 | PAUL H ROHE COMPANY | AURORA | $ 707,983.60 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-926-1471 | I 11
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 643,745.00 [R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | 11 DBE 7.46%



CONTRACT R

CALL: 251

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

-29670-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600380 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITY ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: WABASH RAILROAD DEPOT RELOCATION AND TRAIL FROM
STATE ST TO MOSER PARK
COUNTY: ALLEN

PAGE: 8
DATE: 05/17/11

691,500.00

REMARKS

AWARD
DBE 3.01%

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
| BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 619,038.00 [R | X |
I | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | 11
| MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC | PLYMOUTH | $ 723,260.67 [R | |
| | Indiana 574-936-8613 | I 11
| CRI CONSTRUCTION INC | LARWILL |'$ 722,842.20 [R | |

| | Indiana 260-327-3300 | | | |



CONTRACT R

CALL: 261

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 9
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

-29686-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9976019 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,000,000.00
ROUTE: CR 800S FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 800S, FROM 1-69 TO EAST OF CR 31

COUNTY: STEUBEN

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
| BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 801,356.50 |R | X | AWARD
I | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | 11 DBE 5.00%
| E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 882,229.93 |R | |
I | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 11
| API CONSTRUCTION CORP | LAOTTO | $ 864,589.65 [R | |

| | Indiana 260-897-2743 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 10
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -30313-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0621011 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD REHABILITIATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 15,100,000.00
CALL: 271 ROUTE: SR 46 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 46 FROM SR 246 TO WEST JUNCTION OF SR 67 AND US 231

COUNTY: OWEN

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 15,619,386.18 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |
35-1385672 | FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC | COLUMBUS | $ 14,983,844.03 IR | |
| | Indiana 812-372-8441 | I 11
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 16,670,223.88 IR | |
| | Indiana 812-336-4452 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 14,977,800.00 |R | X | AWARD PENDING *
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | | DBE 6.14%

*ADDITIONAL TIME 1S REQUIRED FOR DETAILED BID REVIEW ANALYSIS BY CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

PAGE: 11
DATE: 05/17/11

0.00

$ 53,500.00
REMARKS
AWARD *

CONTRACT R -30447-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1823017 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
CALL: 281 ROUTE: 14 LAPORTE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 14 AT BARRETT RD, 0.59 MILE EAST OF EAST JCT
OF SR 25
COUNTY: FULTON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 55,612.73 [R | X |
I | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | 11
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 58,922.50 [R | |
I | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | I

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT R

CALL: 291

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

0800201

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

VARIOUS LOCATIONS

0.00
$

PAGE: 12
DATE: 05/17/11

154,000.00

REMARKS

-30818-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO.
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING
ROUTE: SR 9
LOCATION: ALONG SR 9 AT
COUNTY: BARTHOLOMEW
BIDDER
| TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P |
I |
| MIDWEST MOLE INC |
| |
| YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE |
I I
| INDIANA RELINE INC I

ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID
SALEM | $ 103,000.00
Indiana 812-883-6644 |
INDIANAPOLIS | $ 186,191.00
Indiana 317-545-1335 |
ANDERSON | $ 162,555.00
Indiana 765-378-5783 |
SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 148,401.00

Indiana 765-533-5040 |

TYPE LOW
IR 1 X
| |
IR

I I
IR

I I
IR



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 13
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -30988-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710978 DBE GOAL: 7.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 13,000,000.00
CALL: 301 ROUTE: 150 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 150 AT 113 METERS SOUTH OF THE INTERSECTION OF
SR 56 TO CR 375
COUNTY: ORANGE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 12,384,950.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 11,128,457.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |
35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE | $ 10,995,000.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-282-1349 | | | |
99-9996263 | KNIES CONSTR/ CALCAR PAVING J/ | JASPER | $ 9,742,973.01 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 812-482-1024 | | | | DBE 7.13%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 14
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -31669-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400965; 0901567 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE RECONSTRUCTION AND ROAD REPLACEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  8,942,900.00
CALL: 311 ROUTE: 69 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON 126TH STREET FROM PROMISE ROAD TO 0.9 MILE EAST
OF PROMISE ROAD AND OVER 1-69
COUNTY: HAMILTON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 8,328,321.49 |[R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 8,947,146.05 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 9,657,460.69 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-336-4452 | | | |

35-2392967 | BERNS CONSTRUCTION LLC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 7,559,915.55 |R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 317-545-8714 | | 11 DBE 6.13%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 15
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -32408-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810289 DBE GOAL: 7.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD CONSTRUCTION ADDED TRAVEL LANES ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  7,000,000.00
CALL: 321 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON OLIO ROAD FROM 96TH STREET TO GEIST RESERVOIR

COUNTY: HAMILTON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-4351261 | SHELLY & SANDS INC AND SUBSIDI | ZANESVILLE | $ 6,836,533.29 |R | |
[ | Ohio 740-453-0721 | [ [
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 5.856,500.00 |[R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | 11 DBE 7.32%
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 6,178,562.19 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1698047 | GRADEX INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 6,219,897.55 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-573-3970 | | | |
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 6,839,821.96 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-336-4452 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 6,357,000.00 |[R | |

| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 16
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -32661-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710474 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 528,000.00
CALL: 331 ROUTE: 300N GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT FORTVILLE PIKE AND CR 300N

COUNTY: HANCOCK

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-4351261 | SHELLY & SANDS INC AND SUBSIDI | ZANESVILLE | $ 424,429.22 |R | X1 AWARD
I | Ohio 740-453-0721 | [ [ DBE 6.20%
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 489,186.43 [R | |
1 | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 468,290.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 458,085.00 |R | |

| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 17
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -33031-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400792, 0901641, 0902248 DBE GOAL: 2.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 412,000.00
CALL: 341 ROUTE: 65 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: VARIOUS LOCATIONS ALONG 1-65

COUNTY: JASPER

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM | $ 283,890.00 |R | X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | | | DBE 6.43%
35-1526557 | MIDWEST MOLE INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 351,481.00 [R | |
1 | Indiana 317-545-1335 | | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 427,047.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |
35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC ] SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 327,640.30 |R | |

| | Indiana 765-533-5040 | | | |



CONTRACT R

CALL: 351

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 18
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

-33060-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0301151 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 452,000.00
ROUTE: 67 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 67 OVER MONTGOMERY/ROSS DITCH
2.02 MILES EAST OF US 27
COUNTY: JAY
BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
| VTF EXCAVATION LLC | CELINA | $ 444 ,623.46 |R | |
| | Ohio 419-586-3077 | | | |
| JUTTE EXCAVATING INC | FORT RECOVERY | $ 409,627.20 [R | | IRREGULAR *
| | Ohio 419-375-4435 | | | |
| BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 421,207.50 [R | |
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | |
| E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 441,074.32 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
| L1 C A CONSTRUCTION | BERNE | $ 375,158.16 |[R | X | AWARD
I | Indiana 260-344-5311 | | 11 DBE 6.10%
| PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | ALBION | $ 463,060.85 [R | |
| | Indiana 260-636-3000 | | | |
| HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 464,985.85 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-284-1195 | | | |

*FAILED TO SUBMIT A PERFORMANCE BOND AND POWER OF ATTORNEY LETTER WITH THE BID. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1).



CONTRACT R

CALL: 361

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

TE PROJECT NO. 0301168 DBE GOAL:
ENHANCEMENT, BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITY ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT
ON MOUNDS ROAD FROM MOUNDS STATE PARK
TO AMERICAN LEGION POST

PAGE: 19
DATE: 05/17/11

652,700.00

REMARKS

AWARD

-33141-A FED/STA
DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:
COUNTY:
BIDDER
| BROOKS CONSTRUCTION
I
| E & B PAVING INC
|
] L 1 CA CONSTRUCTIO
I
| YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE

MADISON
ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 675,100.00 |[R | |
| Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | |
| ANDERSON | $ 718,680.00 [R | |
| Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
N | BERNE | $ 589,478.08 |[R | X |
| Indiana 260-344-5311 | | | |
| ANDERSON | $ 857,646.60 |R | |

| Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

PAGE: 20
DATE: 05/17/11

CONTRACT R -33178-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900636 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION, ROUNDABOUT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 775,000.00
CALL: 371 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON ALBANY STREET, SHERMAN DRIVE AND CHURCHMAN AVENUE
COUNTY: MARION
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 724,621.99 |R | X1 AWARD

| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | | DBE 6.06%
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 777,777.00 [R | |

1 | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 798,659.00 [R | |

| | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | | |
35-1609544 | SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 859,862.19 |[R | |

| | Indiana 317-484-1500 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 21
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -33247-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810347 DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ NONE BELOW
CALL: 381 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON WABASH HERITAGE TRAIL EXTENSION, PHASE 11, FROM HAPPY
HOLLOW PARK TO ROSE STREET
COUNTY: TIPPECANOE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1386990 | JACK 1SOM CONSTRUCTION CO | REYNOLDS | $ 895,703.30 |R | X1 AWARD PENDING *
I | Indiana 219-984-5765 | | | |
35-1415044 | F & K CONSTRUCTION INC | FLORA | $ 904,412.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 574-967-4543 | | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 992,927.75 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP ] COLUMBUS | $ 952,135.75 |R | |
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |

*ADDITIONAL TIME 1S REQUIRED FOR BID REVIEW BY DISTRICT OR LPA AND CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 22
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT R -33375-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600364, 0710214 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD CONSTRUCTION ADDED TRAVEL LANES ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  7,960,000.00
CALL: 391 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SOUTH EMERSON AVENUE FROM SHELBYVILLE ROAD TO
COMPANY DRIVE
COUNTY: MARION

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 7,601,500.00 |[R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-0999231 | HUNT PAVING COMPANY INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 9,579,877.40 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-241-8313 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 7.439,449.99 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 7,777,005.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | | |
35-1609544 | SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 8,370,922.78 |[R | |
I | Indiana 317-484-1500 | | | |

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 7,218,000.00 |R | X AWARD

|
| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | | DBE 8.42%



CONTRACT R

CALL: 401

-33879-A

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172403

DESCRIPTION: PATCH AND REHAB PAVEMENT

ROUTE: 70

LOCATION: ON 1-70 FROM SR 109 TO SR 3

COUNTY: HENRY
BIDDER

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

T

YPE LOW

3.00
$

PAGE: 23
DATE: 05/17/11

1,115,000.00

REMARKS

GOSHEN
Indiana

| E & B PAVING INC

ANDERSON
Indiana

| DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC

NORTH VERNON
Indiana

AWARD *
DBE 3.04%

COLUMBUS
Indiana

PHONE AMOUNT OF BID

| $ 3,311,346.00
574-875-5183 |

| $ 2,091,110.00
765-643-5358 |

| $ 1.886,525.00
812-346-4135 |

| $ 2.269,434.50
800-854-1830 |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF

FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-30340-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500279 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,577,000.00
CALL: 421 ROUTE: 35 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 35 FROM US 24 TO SR 16

COUNTY: CASS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 1,279,926.52 |[R | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 1,414,470.93 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 1,273,784.35 |R | X1 AWARD PENDING*
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1621699 | CENTRAL PAVING INC | LOGANSPORT | $ 1,392,552.20 [R | |
| | Indiana 574-722-4727 | | | |

*ADDITIONAL TIME 1S REQUIRED FOR DETAILED BID REVIEW ANALYSIS BY CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 25
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-30769-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800159 DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  3,480,000.00
CALL: 431 ROUTE: 120 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 120 FROM SR 13 TO SR 5
COUNTY: ELKHART LAGRANGE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 3,478,713.93 |[R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 3,434,214.60 |[R | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 3,569,210.74 |[R | |
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | |
35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH | $ 2,989,043.42 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 219-924-5900 | | | | DBE 3.01%
35-1185040 | NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC | BRISTOL | $ 3,025,991.20 |[R | |

| | Indiana 574-848-4437 | | [



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 26
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-30984-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800115 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PCCP CLEANING AND SEALING JOINTS ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 195,000.00
CALL: 441 ROUTE: SR 240 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 240 FROM US 231 TO 1.62 MILES EAST OF US 231

COUNTY: PUTNAM

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-2139506 | HARDCORE CONCRETE SAWING INC | HARDINSBURG | $ 196,605.56 |R | X1 AWARD *
I | Indiana 812-472-9039 | | | |
35-2392967 | BERNS CONSTRUCTION LLC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 199,263.80 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-545-8714 | | 11
38-2625522 | SCODELLER CONSTRUCTION INC | WIXOM | $ 275,320.50 [R | |
| | Michigan 248-374-1102 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 27
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-32973-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901924 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE, PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  1,444,600.00
CALL: 445 ROUTE: 421 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 421 FROM 0.62 MILE NORTH OF SR 334 TO
0.21 MILE SOUTH OF SR 32
COUNTY: BOONE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-4351261 | SHELLY & SANDS INC AND SUBSIDI | ZANESVILLE | $ 1,348,839.81 |R | X1 AWARD
I | Ohio 740-453-0721 | [ [ DBE 4.03%
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 1,582,500.00 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 1,634,278.27 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 1,563,350.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 1,497,000.00 |[R | |

| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |



CONTRACT RS-33301-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005592 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, MICROSURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
CALL: 451 ROUTE: 69 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON 1-69 FROM 1.39 MILES NORTH OF SR 8 TO
0.29 MILE NORTH OF US 6
COUNTY: DEKALB
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

4.00
$

PAGE: 28
DATE: 05/17/11

NONE BELOW

REMARKS

NO BIDS RECEIVED. NOT RESCHEDULED AT THIS TIME.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

PAGE: 29
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CONTRACT RS-33320-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100717 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 461 ROUTE: 40 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 40 FROM 7.95 MILES EAST OF SR 1 TO 8.95 MILES EAST
OF SR 1
COUNTY: WAYNE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 312,519.50 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS (3 273,457.50 |[R | X |

| Indiana 800-854-1830 | I 11

0.00

$ 331,000.00
REMARKS
AWARD



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 30
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33365-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901883 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, MICROSURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,335,000.00
CALL: 471 ROUTE: SR 37 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 37 FROM SR 64 TO US 150
COUNTY: CRAWFORD ORANGE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM | $ 1,254,238.75 |R | X1 AWARD

| | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | | | DBE 6.98%
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33366-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005776 DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 912,000.00
CALL: 481 ROUTE: 64 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 64 FROM 0.19 MILE EAST OF SR 37 TO
0.15 MILE WEST OF SR 237
COUNTY: CRAWFORD

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0626844 | J H RUDOLPH & COMPANY | EVANSVILLE | $ 878,388.00 IR | |
| | Indiana 812-476-4921 | | 11

35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE | $ 803,000.00 |[R | X | AWARD

I | Indiana 812-282-1349 | | 11 DBE 3.16%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 32
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

MBE GOAL: 0.00
CONTRACT RS-33370-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005893 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: INSTITUTION & PARK ROAD MAINTENANCE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 240,000.00
CALL: 491 ROUTE: VARIOUS VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS WITHIN THE VINCENNES DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
11-3838875 | CALCAR PAVING INC | JASPER | $ 254,704.91 |R | X1 AWARD *
[ | Indiana 812-482-1024 | | 11
35-0626844 | J H RUDOLPH & COMPANY | EVANSVILLE | $ 293,800.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-476-4921 | I 11
35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE | $ 302,000.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-282-1349 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33430-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005953 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT WEDGE AND LEVEL ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 629,990.00
CALL: 501 ROUTE: 105 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 105 FROM SR 124 TO SR 16

COUNTY: HUNTINGTON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 477,111.43 [R | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 517,318.22 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 476,833.58 |[R | X | AWARD PENDING *
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1505753 | GAUNT & SON ASPHALT INC | WABASH | $ 814,045.06 |R | |
| | Indiana 260-563-1821 | | | |

*ADDITIONAL TIME 1S REQUIRED FOR DETAILED BID REVIEW ANALYSIS BY CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33653-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800820 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: CLEANING AND SEALING JOINTS ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 331,000.00
CALL: 505 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 69 AT 3.5 MILES SOUTH OF SR 62 TO SR 62

COUNTY: POSEY

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-2139506 | HARDCORE CONCRETE SAWING INC | HARDINSBURG | $ 305,168.67 |[R | X | AWARD
I | Indiana 812-472-9039 | | 11
35-2392967 | BERNS CONSTRUCTION LLC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 381,102.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 317-545-8714 | I 11
37-1215990 | HUFF SEALING CORPORATION | ALBION | $ 354,186.42 |R | |
| | 1linois 618-445-3148 | | 11
38-2625522 | SCODELLER CONSTRUCTION INC | WIXOM | $ 478,018.40 [R | |

| | Michigan 248-374-1102 | | | |
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33658-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006034 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 330,000.00
CALL: 511 ROUTE: 62 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 62 FROM SR 250 TO SR 129 AND ON SR 250 FROM US 421 TO
SR 62
COUNTY: JEFFERSON  RIPLEY SWITZERLAND

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-0844079 | PAUL H ROHE COMPANY | AURORA | $ 458,932.90 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-926-1471 | I 1

35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 288,296.80 |R | X | AWARD

I | Indiana 812-346-4135 | I o DBE 5.03%
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33682-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006087 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE, ULTRATHIN BONDED WEARING COURSE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 662,000.00
CALL: 515 ROUTE: 231 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 231 FROM 0.01 MILE SOUTH OF SR 28 TO 5.70 MILES
NORTH OF SR 28
COUNTY: TIPPECANOE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 898,296.00 [R | X | AWARD *

I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | 11 DBE 5.38%
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 954,144.58 |R | |

I | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | 11

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT RS-33776-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172008 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,290,000.00
CALL: 521 ROUTE: SR 63 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 63 FROM 0.25 MILE SOUTH OF SR 32 TO 1-74 RAMP

COUNTY: VERMILLION

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN |'$ 889,273.33 |R | X | AWARD

I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | [ DBE 4.10%
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 1,174,618.18 [R | |

| | Indiana 800-854-1830 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

| $ 1,925,854.97 |R
260-625-3443 | |

PAGE: 38
DATE: 05/17/11

5.00
$ 1,770,000.00

REMARKS

| $ 1,784,653.29 |R

CONTRACT B -29609-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400354
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT
CALL: 551 ROUTE: CR 900S
LOCATION: ON CR 900S OVER SALAMONIE RIVER
COUNTY: WELLS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS

35-1057237 | R L MCCOY INC | COLUMBIA CITY

| | Indiana
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE

| | Indiana

260-478-1548 | |

AWARD *
DBE 5.21%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 561

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

5.00
$

PAGE: 39
DATE: 05/17/11

795,000.00

REMARKS

-30648-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500919
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT
ROUTE:
LOCATION: ON LINDEN ROAD OVER HESTON CREEK

COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH

BIDDER ADDRESS
| JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC LAPORTE
| Indiana
| LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1 LAPORTE
| Indiana
| ALBIN CARLSON & CO ADDISON
| Illinois
| E T MACKENZIE COMPANY GRAND LEDGE
| Michigan
| ANLAAN CORPORATION SPRING LAKE
| Michigan

AWARD *
DBE 5.15%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 571

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

DBE GOAL:

ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

6.00
$

1,545,0

REMARKS

PAGE: 40
DATE: 05/17/11

00.00

AWARD

Indiana

-31109-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710940
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT
ROUTE:
LOCATION: ON CR 1050N OVER BIG RACCOON CREEK
COUNTY: PUTNAM
BIDDER ADDRESS
| WEDDLE BROTHERS HIGHWAY GROUP BLOOMINGTON
| Indiana
| DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC FRANKLIN
| Indiana
| GEORGE R HARVEY & SON INC DANVILLE
| Indiana
| FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC COLUMBUS
| Indiana
| JACK ISOM CONSTRUCTION CO REYNOLDS
| Indiana
| SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO INDIANAPOLIS
| Indiana
| AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE JEFFERSONVILLE
| Indiana
] CLR INC VINCENNES
| Indiana
| HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC INDIANAPOLIS



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 41
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT B -31454-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9999189 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE PAINTING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 671,000.00
CALL: 581 ROUTE: VARIOUS GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS BRIDGES IN MARION COUNTY

COUNTY: MARION

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1602596 | ICARUS INDUSTRIAL PAINTING | VALPARAISO | $ 619,144.70 |R | |
I | Indiana 219-531-5300 | | | |
35-1645115 | THREE STAR PAINTING INC | MERRILLVILLE | $ 694,727.03 |R | |
| | Indiana 219-947-3021 | | 11
35-1778430 | N I SPANOS PAINTING INC | CROWN POINT | $ 503,862.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 219-662-9092 | | | |
35-2019240 | CENTRAL PAINTING INC | ST JOHN | $ 392,784.40 |R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 219-942-3623 | | | |
75-3124141 | EAGLE PAINTING & MAINTENANCE C | LANSING | $ 469,003.62 [R | |

I | 1llinois 708-862-8712 | I 11



CONTRACT B

CALL: 591

-31663-A

ROUTE: CR 250W

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710052
DESCRIPTION: NEW BRIDGE, OTHER CONSTRUCTION

LOCATION: ON CR 250W OVER SALT CREEK, 2 MILES SOUTH OF

COUNTY: PORTER
BIDDER

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT
SR 130

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE: 42
DATE: 05/17/11

685,000.00

REMARKS

MICHIGAN CITY
Indiana

GOSHEN
Indiana

| GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC

GARY
Indiana

| ELLAS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC

GARY
Indiana

AWARD *
DBE 6.18%

LAPORTE
Indiana

KENTLAND
Indiana

| ADDISON

Illinois

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 601

-33224-A

DESCRIPTION:

ROUTE:

LOCATION:

COUNTY:

BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710091
BRIDGE REPLACEMENT

0.24 MILE WEST OF SR 32

DELAWARE

ADDRESS

ON WEST JACKSON STREET OVER WEST FORK WHITE RIVER,

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
GREENFIELD DISTRICT

3.00
$

PAGE: 43
DATE: 05/17/11

3,234,900.00

REMARKS

| BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC

BOGGSTOWN
Indiana

AWARD
DBE 4.24%

| PRIMCO INC

FORT WAYNE
Indiana

JEFFERSONVILLE
Indiana

SPRING LAKE
Michigan

| HIS CONSTRUCTORS

INC

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 44
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT B -33339-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005809 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: STRAIGHTEN BEAM ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 48,000.00
CALL: 621 ROUTE: 1-64 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON 1-64 OVER US 41, 4.35 MILES WEST OF SR 57

COUNTY: GIBSON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-1028573 | CIVIL CONSTRUCTION INC | PLAIN CITY | $ 92,263.34 |R | X1 AWARD *
| | Ohio 614-873-8196 | | | |
35-1801998 | CLR INC | VINCENNES | $ 123,376.00 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 812-886-0360 | | | |
91-1798131 | FLAME ON INC | SNOHOMISH | $ 97,474.00 [R | |
| | Washington 425-397-7039 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 631

-33355-A

DESCRIPTION:

ROUTE:

LOCATION:

COUNTY:

BIDDER

SR 32
DELAWARE

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902310
BRIDGE REHABILITATION

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

ON TILLOTSON AVENUE OVER EIGHTH STREET, CSX RAILROAD AND

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

5.00
$

2,660,0

REMARKS

PAGE: 45
DATE: 05/17/11

00.00

MUNCIE
Indiana

| BEATY CONSTRUCTION

INC

BOGGSTOWN
Indiana

| DUNCAN ROBERTSON

INC

FRANKLIN
Indiana

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

JEFFERSONVILLE
Indiana

SPRING LAKE
Michigan

| HIS CONSTRUCTORS

INC

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

*ADDITIONAL TIME 1S REQUIRED FOR DETAILED BID REVIEW ANALYSIS BY CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 46
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT B -33647-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800779 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,284,900.00
CALL: 641 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON PIERCE STREET OVER YELLOW RIVER, 0.14 MILE
WEST OF MICHIGAN ROAD (OLD US 31)
COUNTY: MARSHALL

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1339168 | LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I | LAPORTE | $ 1,993,676.54 |[R | |
I | Indiana 219-393-5555 | | | |
35-1690004 | NORTHERN INDIANA CONSTRUCTION | MISHAWAKA | $ 1,072,929.43 |R | X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 574-256-1811 | | | | DBE 8.68%
35-1817530 | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | ALBION | $ 1,370,992.79 |[R | |
| | Indiana 260-636-3000 | | | |
36-0872360 | ALBIN CARLSON & CO | ADDISON | $ 1,336,610.42 |R | |
| | 1ilinois 630-785-4000 | | | |
38-2675420 | ANLAAN CORPORATION | SPRING LAKE | $ 1,799,735.85 |[R | |

| | Michigan 616-846-8442 | | [



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 47
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011
MBE GOAL: 0.00
CONTRACT M -33428-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005747 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 584,600.00
CALL: 671 ROUTE: VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ALONG SR 37, SR 66, SR 145 AND SR 245 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS
COUNTY: PERRY
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM | $ 436,570.00 |R | X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | | |
35-1009310 | DEIG BROTHERS LUMBER & CONSTR | EVANSVILLE | $ 626,265.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-423-4201 | I 11
35-1526557 | MIDWEST MOLE INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 607,785.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 317-545-1335 | | | |
35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC ] SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 455,275.00 |R | |

| | Indiana 765-533-5040 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 48
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

MBE GOAL: 0.00
CONTRACT M -33429-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005751 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 185,975.00
CALL: 681 ROUTE: 257 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ALONG SR 257 AT 2.57 MILES, 2.95 MILES AND 6.82 MILES NORTH
OF SR 64; ALONG SR 356 AT 9.78 MILES EAST OF SR 57
COUNTY: PIKE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM | $ 194,960.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | | |
35-1009310 | DEIG BROTHERS LUMBER & CONSTR | EVANSVILLE | $ 208,792.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-423-4201 | I 11
35-1526557 | MIDWEST MOLE INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 234,300.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 317-545-1335 | | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 211,123.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |

35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC | SULPHUR SPRINGS |'$ 181,844.45 |R | X | AWARD
I | Indiana 765-533-5040 | I 11



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 49
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT T -30209-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0501032 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,150,000.00
CALL: 701 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON MADISON STREET FROM 21ST STREET TO WYSOR STREET

COUNTY: DELAWARE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
06-1675328 | MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC | SOUTH BEND | $ 1,202,202.02 |R | |
I | Indiana 574-271-5000 | | | |
35-0392360 | HOOSIER COMPANY INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 1,319,082.81 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-872-8125 | | | |
35-0821499 | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 1,255,254.40 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-876-3739 | | | |
35-1262778 | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 1,155,356.36 |R | X1 AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | 11 DBE 6.17%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.



CONTRACT T

CALL: 711

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

-33632-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005259 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNALS MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON DR ANDREW J BROWN AVENUE AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

COUNTY: MARION

0.00
$

PAGE: 50
DATE: 05/17/11

NONE BELOW

REMARKS

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
| HOOSIER COMPANY INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 373,008.16 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-872-8125 | | [
| JAMES H DREW CORPORATION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 415,182.63 [R | |
1 | Indiana 317-876-3739 | | | |
| MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 353,844.57 |[R | X |
| | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | | |
| MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 359,149.30 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-356-9250 | | | |

*ADDITIONAL TIME 1S REQUIRED FOR DETAILED BID REVIEW ANALYSIS BY CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 51
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

CONTRACT T -33762-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005798 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: SIGN REPLACEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 321,000.00
CALL: 721 ROUTE: VARIOUS FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN THE CITY OF ELKHART

COUNTY: ELKHART

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
06-1675328 | MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC | SOUTH BEND | $ 498,498.49 |R | |
I | Indiana 574-271-5000 | | | |
35-1657131 | MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC | PLYMOUTH | $ 310,762.90 [R | |
| | Indiana 574-936-8613 | | | |

35-1983873 | M A S MARKERS INC | LEBANON | $ 283,074.66 |[R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 317-769-7200 | | | |
35-2040834 | GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 388,360.64 [R | |
| | Indiana 317-541-2727 | | | |
38-2421492 | ACTION TRAFFIC MAINTENANCE | FLINT | $ 298,500.16 [R | |
I | Michigan 810-695-7516 | | | |
43-1012298 | COLLINS & HERMANN INC | ST LOUIS | $ 327,978.56 [R | |
| | Missouri 314-869-8000 | | | |
62-1339540 | HAWK ENTERPRISES INC | CROWN POINT | $ 421,066.20 |R | |

| | Indiana 219-662-8090 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 52
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

MBE GOAL: 0.00

CONTRACT TM-32977-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901965 WBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 98,300.00
CALL: 741 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE
LAPORTE DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1262778 | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 169,166.00 |R | X1 AWARD *

| | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | 11

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 53
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

MBE GOAL: 0.00
CONTRACT TM-33744-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006573 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: RAISED PAVEMENT MARKINGS ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 322,000.00
CALL: 751 ROUTE: VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE VINCINNES DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

31-0989223 | TRAFFIC SPECIALISTS INC | SHANDON |'$ 214,403.50 [R | |

I | Ohio 513-738-1900 | | 11
31-1035771 | A & A SAFETY INC | AMELIA |$ 267,838.50 [R | |

| | Ohio 513-943-6100 | I 11
35-1983873 | M A S MARKERS INC | LEBANON | $ 208,479.89 |[R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 317-769-7200 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 54
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011

MBE GOAL: 0.00
CONTRACT TM-33759-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006780; 1006779 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 213,835.00
CALL: 761 ROUTE: 64/65 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 64/65 AT WALMART AND KMART ENTRANCE, 0.46 MILE
WEST OF US 41; ON OLD SR 61(6TH STREET) AND WHEATLAND ROAD
COUNTY: GIBSON KNOX
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1675187 | HUMMEL ELECTRIC INC | EVANSVILLE | $ 218,000.00 |[R | X | AWARD *
I | Indiana 812-474-1500 | | [

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 55
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 05/17/11
FOR THE LETTING OF May 11, 2011
MBE GOAL: 0.00

CONTRACT TM-33763-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006792 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 148,000.00
CALL: 771 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1262778 | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 161,522.00 |[R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | 1
35-1710202 | SIGNAL CONSTRUCTION INC | GREENFIELD |'$ 171,944.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 317-894-0120 | I 11

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



