
                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 09/28/10 
                                               FOR THE LETTING OF September 01, 2010 
 
CONTRACT IR-31104-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200699                                                        DBE GOAL:  4.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE WIDENING                                     ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  44,040,000.00 
CALL: 171                 ROUTE: 70                                                  GREENFIELD DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON I-70 FROM 0.6 MILE EAST OF POST ROAD TO 1.3 MILES EAST 
                                 OF MOUNT COMFORT ROAD 
                         COUNTY: HANCOCK      MARION 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            |PRESENT VALUE COST, HMA PAVEMENT|                              | $  5,094,040.59 |    |   | 
            |                                |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            |PRESENT VALUE COST,PCCP PAVEMENT|                              | $  3,539,454.84 |    |   | 
            |                                |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | TOTAL OF FIXED PRICE ITEMS     |                              |       22,677.00 |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 CONSTRUCTION      |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
31-1023518  | KOKOSING CONSTRUCTION CO INC   | COLUMBUS                     |    NO BID       |    |   | 
            | HMA OPTION                     | Ohio            614-228-1029 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
31-1023518  | KOKOSING CONSTRUCTION CO INC   | COLUMBUS                     | $ 38,708,192.73 |R   |   | 
            | PCCP OPTION                    | Ohio            614-228-1029 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
31-1257382  | HI WAY PAVING INC              | HILLIARD                     |    NO BID       |    |   | 
            | HMA OPTION                     | Ohio            614-876-1700 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
31-1257382  | HI WAY PAVING INC              | HILLIARD                     | $ 36,335,804.34 |R   |   | 
            | PCCP OPTION                    | Ohio            614-876-1700 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0175870  | BERNS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC | INDIANAPOLIS                 |    NO BID       |    |   | 
            | HMA OPTION                     | Indiana         317-545-8714 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0175870  | BERNS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $ 33,846,852.49 |R   |   | 
            | PCCP OPTION                    | Indiana         317-545-8714 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $ 33,596,108.42 |R   |   | 
            | HMA OPTION                     | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $ 32,332,908.93 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            | PCCP OPTION                    | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   |        DBE  4.08% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $ 36,694,492.07 |R   |   | 
            | HMA OPTION                     | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     |    NO BID       |    |   | 
            | PCCP OPTION                    | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 09/28/10 
                                               FOR THE LETTING OF September 01, 2010 
 
CONTRACT IR-31104-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200699                                                        DBE GOAL:  4.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE WIDENING                                     ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  44,040,000.00 
CALL: 171                 ROUTE: 70                                                  GREENFIELD DISTRICT 
(CONTINUED)            LOCATION: ON I-70 FROM 0.6 MILE EAST OF POST ROAD TO 1.3 MILES EAST 
                                 OF MOUNT COMFORT ROAD 
                         COUNTY: HANCOCK      MARION 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9996209  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION CO/E & B PA | LAPORTE                      |    NO BID       |    |   | 
            | HMA OPTION                     | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9996209  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION CO/E & B PA | LAPORTE                      | $ 37,974,271.64 |R   |   | 
            | PCCP OPTION                    | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
NOTE:  THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A SECTION PLUS THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT VALUE COST (NOT INCLUDING  
SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002 PLUS SECTION 0003. 
(AMOUNTS OF CONTRACTORS' BIDS SHOWN INCLUDE SECTION 0003.) 
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                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 09/20/10 
                                               FOR THE LETTING OF September 01, 2010 
 
CONTRACT IR-31108-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. S870011                                                        DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION                               ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  12,468,000.00 
CALL: 181                 ROUTE: 331                                                 LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 331 FROM US 20 BYPASS, SOUTH OF 12 STREET 
 
                         COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $ 10,078,908.82 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC              | MILFORD                      | $ 11,985,600.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-658-4166 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1058916  | WOODRUFF & SONS INC            | MICHIGAN CITY                | $ 13,013,617.36 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-872-8605 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1068009  | DYER CONSTRUCTION CO           | DYER                         | $ 11,387,031.86 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-865-2961 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1120685  | WALSH & KELLY INC              | GRIFFITH                     | $ 10,246,308.45 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-5900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1185040  | NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC         | BRISTOL                      | $ 12,755,587.20 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-848-4437 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1489621  | HRP CONSTRUCTION INC           | SOUTH BEND                   | $ 13,544,850.56 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-271-7800 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-1625197  | SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC      | NILES                        | $  9,695,468.73 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Michigan        269-684-0842 |                 |    |   |        DBE  5.01% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2051611  | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC           | BATTLE CREEK                 | $ 10,494,891.07 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        269-965-1207 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT B -30454-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0301074                                                        DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT                         ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     593,000.00 
CALL: 351                 ROUTE: US 421                                              LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 421 OVER EAST BRANCH OF SLOCUM DITCH, 1.18 MILES NORTH 
                                 OF US 30 
                         COUNTY: LAPORTE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-3919039  | TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL | MICHIGAN CITY                | $    692,637.57 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-879-7321 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
32-0154474  | JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC           | LAPORTE                      | $    562,953.88 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-324-9393 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $    782,779.12 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035122  | GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC     | GARY                         | $    593,700.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-887-5233 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1058916  | WOODRUFF & SONS INC            | MICHIGAN CITY                | $    755,626.95 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-872-8605 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1569222  | GRIMMER CONSTRUCTION INC       | HIGHLAND                     | $    566,608.44 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-1623 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1817530  | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC         | LEO                          | $    726,305.45 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         260-627-5981 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-3806996  | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC           | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    555,838.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         317-284-1195 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 


