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CONTRACT IR-30162-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1761009                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION                               ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  20,900,000.00 
CALL: 131                 ROUTE: 24                                                  FT. WAYNE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 24 FROM 0.5 MILE EAST OF I-469 TO 0.5 MILE EAST OF 
                                 BRUICK/RYAN ROAD 
                         COUNTY: ALLEN 
    CODE                  BIDDER                      ADDRESS     PHONE/FAX       AMOUNT OF BID    TYPE LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE |                             | $    919,579.74 |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            |                             |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE |                             | $  1,475,368.14 |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             |                             |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | SECTION 0003 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS   |                             | $          9.00 |    |   | 
            |                                     |                             |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-4456871  | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION  INC       | ARCHBOLD      419-445-1015  | $ 17,126,951.39 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            | OH                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-4456871  | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION  INC       | ARCHBOLD      419-445-1015  | $ 16,593,462.83 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             | OH                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC     | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  | $ 16,883,604.60 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC     | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  | $ 16,055,178.49 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC                    | ANDERSON      765-643-5358  | $ 16,452,359.85 | R  | X |        AWARD * 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            | IN                          |                 |    |   |        DBE 6.07% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC                    | ANDERSON      765-643-5358  | $ 16,020,393.08 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                          | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  | $ 16,843,565.39 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                          | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |     NO BID      |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1698047  | GRADEX INC                          | INDIANAPOLIS  317-573-3970  | $ 16,596,965.57 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1698047  | GRADEX INC                          | INDIANAPOLIS  317-573-3970  |     NO BID      |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC                 | INDIANAPOLIS  317-334-0758  | $ 17,046,415.82 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC                 | INDIANAPOLIS  317-334-0758  |     NO BID      |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-3082681  | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC           | LEROY         231-768-4469  |     NO BID      |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION            | MI                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-3082681  | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC           | LEROY         231-768-4469  | $ 17,912,365.98 | R  |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION             | MI                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
NOTE:  THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A SECTION PLUS THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT VALUE COST (NOT INCLUDING  
SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002 PLUS SECTION 0003. 
(AMOUNTS OF CONTRACTORS' SECTION BIDS SHOWN DO NOT INCLUDE SECTION 0003.) 


