
                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 12/17/10 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF November 30, 2010 
 
CONTRACT IR-33040-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500441, 0902201                                DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $ 106,500,000.00 
CALL: 161                 ROUTE: 69                                                  VINCENNES DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON PR-69 FROM PATOKA RIVER TO SR 61 
 
                         COUNTY: PIKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PW OF FURUTE MAINTENANCE COST  |                              | $  3,434,001.06 |    |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PW OF FURUTE MAINTENANCE COST  |                              | $  2,165,255.83 |    |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | SEC 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS  |                              | $          8.00 |    |   | 
            | FIXED PRICES                   |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-0907180  | E S WAGNER COMPANY             | OREGON                       | $ 17,097,621.52 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Ohio            419-691-8651 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-0907180  | E S WAGNER COMPANY             | OREGON                       | $ 17,127,665.76 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Ohio            419-691-8651 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-0907180  | E S WAGNER COMPANY             | OREGON                       | $ 59,170,951.94 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Ohio            419-691-8651 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $ 16,950,357.18 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $ 55,723,131.57 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  |      NO BID     |    |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $ 17,293,621.24 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   |        DBE  5.17% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $ 53,328,966.64 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 12/17/10 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF November 30, 2010 
 
CONTRACT IR-33040-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500441, 0902201                                DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $ 106,500,000.00 
CALL: 161                 ROUTE: 69                                                  VINCENNES DISTRICT 
(CONTINUED)            LOCATION: ON PR-69 FROM PATOKA RIVER TO SR 61 
 
                         COUNTY: PIKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                 | MARYLAND HTS.                |      NO BID     |    |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Missouri        314-344-0070 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                 | MARYLAND HTS.                | $ 19,023,097.63 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Missouri        314-344-0070 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                 | MARYLAND HTS.                | $ 63,521,205.13 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Missouri        314-344-0070 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992098  | F H PASCHEN/T J LAMBRECHT J/V  | CHICAGO                      |      NO BID     |    |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Illinois        773-444-3474 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992098  | F H PASCHEN/T J LAMBRECHT J/V  | CHICAGO                      | $ 16,962,560.17 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Illinois        773-444-3474 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992098  | F H PASCHEN/T J LAMBRECHT J/V  | CHICAGO                      | $ 61,630,589.86 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Illinois        773-444-3474 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
NOTE: THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT WORTH  
COST, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002, SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. 
(AMOUNTS OF CONTRACTORS' SECTION BIDS SHOWN DO NOT INCLUDE SECTION 0004.) 
 


