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                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF August 06, 2010 
 
CONTRACT IR-30889-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800234                                                        DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  47,900,000.00 
CALL: 170                 ROUTE: 31                                                  GREENFIELD DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF US 35/SR 22 TO 0.65 MILE 
                                 NORTH OF CR 200N 
                         COUNTY: HOWARD 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID    TYPE   LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE COST, SECTION 0001,       |                             | $ 1,271,495.00  |      |     | 
            | NEW BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION, PCCP           |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE COST, SECTION 0002,       |                             | $ 2,060,540.00  |      |     | 
            | NEW BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION, HMA            |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE COST, SECTION 0003,       |                             | $   515,677.00  |      |     | 
            | ADDED TRAVEL LANES, PCCP                |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE COST, SECTION 0004,       |                             | $   797,518.00  |      |     | 
            | ADDED TRAVEL LANES, HMA                 |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | TOTAL OF FIXED PRICE ITEMS,             |                             |           8.00  |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0005, ADDED TRAVEL LANES        |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-4456871  | MILLER BROS. CONSTRUCTION  INC          | ARCHBOLD      419-445-1015  | $33,528,027.23  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0001, PCCP OPTION               | OH                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-4456871  | MILLER BROS. CONSTRUCTION  INC          | ARCHBOLD      419-445-1015  | $33,868,397.42  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0002, HMA OPTION                | OH                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-4456871  | MILLER BROS. CONSTRUCTION  INC          | ARCHBOLD      419-445-1015  | $ 8,152,610.83  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0003, PCCP OPTION               | OH                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
34-4456871  | MILLER BROS. CONSTRUCTION  INC          | ARCHBOLD      419-445-1015  | $ 8,005,183.04  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0004, HMA OPTION                | OH                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-634-5561  | $32,811,312.88  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-634-5561  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-634-5561  | $ 8,167,795.12  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-634-5561  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0004 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  | $32,639,521.93  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  | $ 8,320,017.25  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0004 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  | $31,701,584.64  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  | $ 7,452,787.84  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0004 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-788-6885  | $34,923,621.84  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-788-6885  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-788-6885  | $ 7,969,370.16  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | INDIANAPOLIS  317-788-6885  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0004 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  | $31,551,160.94  |  R   |  X  | AWARD 5.17%  * 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  | $ 7,387,466.06  |  R   |  X  | AWARD 5.17%  * 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     |  
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0004 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3543170  | T J  LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION             | JOLIET        815-726-7722  | $31,505,064.88  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION                | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3543170  | T J  LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION             | JOLIET        815-726-7722  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION                 | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3543170  | T J  LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION             | JOLIET        815-726-7722  | $ 7,804,387.66  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION                | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3543170  | T J  LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION             | JOLIET        815-726-7722  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0004 HMA OPTION                 | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-4518443  | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO       773-444-3474  | $35,988,069.42  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION                | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-4518443  | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO       773-444-3474  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION                 | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-4518443  | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO       773-444-3474  | $ 7,906,937.29  |  R   |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION                | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-4518443  | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO       773-444-3474  |    NO BID       |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0004 HMA OPTION                 | IL                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
NOTE:  THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002 PLUS THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT VALUE COST, PLUS THE  
SUM OF SECTION 0003 OR 0004 PLUS THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT VALUE COST (NOT INCLUDING SECTION 0005).  A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF  
SECTION 0001 OR 0002 PLUS SECTION 0003 OR 0004 PLUS SECTION 0005. 
 
*AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.  CONTRACT AMOUNT EQUALS THE BID AMOUNT OF SECTION 0001 PLUS THE BID AMOUNT OF SECTION 0003 
PLUS BID AMOUNT OF SECTION OOO5 ($31,551,160.94 + $ 7,387,466.06 + $ 8.00 = $ 38,938,635.00 


